Planet T Uniforms, Inc. Uniform Pines East, Inc. dba: ALL UNIFORM WEAR iUniforms, Inc.
Total Cost $555,274.60 $625,388.96 $606,317.90

Sale Sale Sale

Price Extended  Revenue  Revenue Price Extended  Revenue  Revenue Price Extended  Revenue  Revenue
Franchise  Surchage | Base Vendor Per Amount from from Total Base Vendor Per Amount from from Total Base Vendor Per Amount from from Total
Fee Fee Price Notes Unit (w/ Franchise  Surcharge  Revenue | Price Notes Unit (w/ Franchise Surcharge  Revenue | Price Notes Unit (w/ Franchise  Surcharge  Revenue

(w/ Surcharge) Fee Fee (w/ Surcharge) Fee Fee W/ Surcharge) Fee Fee

Surcharge) Surcharge) Surcharge)

# Items Lowest

Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to 52099 $222,91080 $35662.16 $44,600.00 $80,262.16 | S18.99 FeruvAnYamwith70%cotton o000 6y1300080 $33,878.16 $44,600.00 $78,478.16
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to 52499 $113,404.62 $18,142.92 $22,690.00 $40,832.92 | S18.99 FeruvanYamwith70%cotton o000 ¢i0pace6r $17,23532 $22,690.00 $39,925.32
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to 52499 $77,294.07 $1236581 $15465.00 $27,83081 | S18.99 FerovAnYamwith70%cotton o000 400107 $11,747.21 $15465.00 $27,212.21
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to Peruvain Yarn with 70% cotton
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing $26.99 $809.70 $131.94 $150 $281.94 | $21.99 and 30% polyester $26.99 $809.70 $131.94 $150 $281.94
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to 52699  $1117386  $182077 $2,07000 $3890.77 | $2199 FeruvaAnYemwith70%cotton o,co0 ¢1y 17380 6182077 $2,07000 $3,890.77
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to $2699  $2526260 $411653 $4,680.00 $879653 | San99 erwvaAnYamwith7O%coton o055 o>c6164  $411653 6468000 $8,796.53
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to 52499 $3021291 $483358 9604500 $10,878.58 | $2099 FeruvAnYamwith70%cotton oo o eq) 43101 6507538 $6,045.00 $11,12038
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
Our standard advertised pricing to all charter schools is lower,
however, this pricing structure has been designed to $2699 9615372  $1,00274 $1,14000 $2,142.74 | $2299 FeruvaAnYemwith7O%cotton ;o0 goag17) 6104834 $1,14000 $2,188.34
accommodate and absord the City of Pembroke Pines pricing and 30% polyester
mandates.
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500 $27.90  SizeYSYXL  $32.90 $32.90 $5.58 $5 $1058 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid  NoBid | $31.99 100% Ripstop $3699  $36.99 $6.40 $5 $11.40
500 | $29.90  Size AS-A2XL $34.90 $34.90 $5.98 $5 $10.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.99 100% Ripstop $39.99 $39.99 $7.00 $5 $12.00
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#0-1 5/5 Youth Polos w/ Logo - Elem. $200,700.00 20% $ 500 $17.50 Sizes 3-20 $2250  $200,700.00 $31,220.00 $44,600.00 $75820.00 | $19.99

#0-2 /5 Youth Polos w/ Logo - Middle $102,105.00 20% $ 500 $17.50 Sizes 8-20 $2250  $102,105.00 $15,883.00 $22,690.00 $38,573.00 | $19.99

#03 /5 Youth Polos w/ Logo - High $69,592.50 20% $ 500 $17.50 Sizes 8-20 $2250  $69,59250 $10,825.50 $15,465.00 $26,290.50 | $19.99

#0-4 /5 Adult Polos w/ Logo - Elem. $717.00 20% $ 500 $18.90 AS-AM $23.90 $717.00 $113.40 $150 $263.40 | $21.99

#0-5 /5 Adult Polos w/ Logo - Middle $9,894.60 20% $ 500 $18.90 AS-A3XL $23.90  $9,894.60  $1,564.92  $2,070.00  $3,634.92 | $21.99

#0-6 /5 Adult Polos w/ Logo - High $22,370.40 20% $ 500 $18.90 AS-AGXL $23.90  $22,370.40 $3538.08  $4,680.00  $8218.08 | $21.99

#0-7 L/S Youth Polos w/ Logo - Al Schools $28,895.10 20% $ 500 $18.90 Sizes 3-20 $23.90  $28,895.10 $4,570.02  $6,045.00 $10,615.02 | $19.99

#0-8 L/S Adult Polos w/ Logo - All Schools $6,133.20 20% $ 500 $21.90 AS-AXL $2690  $6,133.20  $998.64  $1,140.00  $2,138.64 | $21.99

#0-9 Jackets w/ Logo Youth - Elem. & Mid. $40,236.70 20% $ 500 $27.90  SizeTLYXL  $32.90  $40,236.70  $6824.34  $6,11500 $12,939.34 | $31.99

$36.99 $45,238.77  $7,824.75 $6,115.00 $13,939.75 | $29.99 Jacket type is unknown $34.99 $42,792.77  $7,335.55 $6,115.00 $13,450.55

#0-10 Jackets w/ Logo Adult - Elem. & Mid. $3,490.00 20% $ 500 $29.90 AS-A2XL $34.90  $3,490.00  $598.00 $500 $1,008.00 | $33.99 $3899  $3,899.00  $679.80 $500  $1,179.80 | $34.99 Jacket type is unknown $39.99  $3999.00  $699.80 $500  $1,199.80

#0-11  Crew Neck Sweat Shirt Elem. & Middle Youth  $6,022.80 20% $ 500 $1890  SizeYXS-YXL  $23.90  $6,022.80  $95256  $1,260.00  $2,21256 | $25.99 $3099  $7,809.48  $1,309.90 $1,2260.00 $2,569.90 | $22.99 Material TBD $27.99  $7,05348  $1,15870 $1,260.00 $2,418.70

#0-12 Crew Neck Sweat Shirt High Youth $2,151.00 20% $ 500 $1890  SizeYLYKL  $23.90  $2,151.00  $340.20 $450 $790.20 | $25.99 $30.99  $2,789.10  $467.82 $450 $917.82 | $23.99 Material TBD $2899  $2,609.10  $431.82 $450 $881.82

#0-13  Crew Neck Sweat Shirt Elem. & Middle Adult ~ $2,331.00 20% $ 500 $2090 SizeAS-A2XL  $2590  $2,331.00  $376.20 $450 $826.20 | $27.99 $3299  $2,969.10  $503.82 $450 $953.82 | $22.99 Material TBD $27.99  $251910  $413.82 $450 $863.82

#0-14 Crew Neck Sweat Shirt High Adult $12,328.40 20% $ 500 $2090 SizeAS-A2XL  $25.90  $12,328.40 $1,989.68  $2,380.00  $4,369.68 | $27.99 $32.99  $15703.24  $2,664.65 $2,380.00 $5044.65 | $23.99 Material TBD $2899  $13,799.24 $2,283.85 $2,380.00 $4,663.85

#0-15 Fleece Jacket Elementary & Middle Youth $98.70 20% $ 500 $27.90  SizeVS-YXL  $32.90 $98.70 $16.74 $15 $31.74 $31.99 $36.99 $110.97 $19.19 $15 $34.19 | $29.99 100% Fleece $34.99 $104.97 $17.99 $15 $32.99

#0-16 Fleece Jacket Elementary & Middle Adult $34.90 20% $ 500 $2090  SizeAS-A2XL  $34.90 $34.90 $5.98 $5 $10.98 $33.99 $38.99 $38.99 $6.80 $5 $11.80 | $34.99 100% Fleece $39.99 $39.99 $7.00 5 $12.00

#0-17 Ripstop Jacket Youth $32.90 20%
#0-18 Ripstop Jacket Adult $34.90 20%

RIS

#0-19 Windbreaker Youth $30.99 20% $ 500 $27.90 Size YS-YXL $32.90 $32.90 $5.58 $5 $10.58 $25.99 $30.99 $30.99 $5.20 $5 $1020 | $32.99 100% Windbreaker $37.99 $37.99 $6.60 $5 $11.60

#0-20 PE Shirt Middle & High $25,374.70 50% s - $14.90  Size YM-A3XL  $14.90  $25374.70  $12,687.35 50 $12,687.35 | $20 520 $34,060.00  $17,030.00 50 $17,030.00 | $18.99 100% Polyester $1899  $32,339.97 $16,169.98 S0 $16,169.98

#0-21 PE Short Middle & High 7" $17,403.20 20% s - $1490  SizeYM-AM  $14.90  $17,403.20  $3,480.64 50 $3,480.64 $17 517 $19,856.00  $3,971.20 50 $3,971.20 | $18.99 100% Polyester $1899  $22,18032  $4,436.06 S0 $4,436.06

#0-22 PE Short Middle & High 9" $5,294.70 20% s - $1590  SizeAS-A2XL  $15.90  $5294.70  $1,058.94 50 $1,058.94 $17 517 $5,661.00  $1,132.20 50 $1,13220 | $19.99 100% Polyester $19.99  $6656.67 $1,331.33 S0 $1,331.33



