City of Pembroke Pines

Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name

Acachi LLC

Axelliant LLC

C&C International Computers and
Consultants, Inc.

Cyber Dreams, LLC

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
13359 N Highway 183
Suite 406-1079
Austin, TX 78750
Tel: (310) 817-6065
info@acachi.tech
Web: https://acachi.tech
Primary Contact:
Chimezie Epoh - Director
chimezie@acachi.tech
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
21250 Hawthorne Boulevard
Suite 500

Torrance, CA, 90503

Tel: (424) 535-1018
bidteam@axelliant.com

Primary Contact:
Ali Abrar - Manager Public Sector
Authorized Approver:
Shahzad Munawwar - Chief Operating Officer

Company Information:
3850 N. 29th Terrace
Suite106
Hollywood, FL 33020
Tel: (954) 450-0023
fsii_hubzone@ccintercomputers.com
Primary Contact:
Cecelia James - Chief Executive Officer, Owner
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
1717 Arctic Avenue
Atlantic City, NJ 08401
Web: CyberDreamslic.com
Primary Contact:
Pablo Tavarez - Owner
Tel: (609) 418-3289
Pablo@cyberdreamlic.com
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included Included
-Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included Included
- Attach 1t A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included NOT INCLUDED Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included Included
- Company Profile Form Included NOT INCLUDED Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.
Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Not Included (Does Not Meet Requiremnts)

Not Included (Does Not Meet Requiremnts)

Included - Broward County - Exp. 09/30/24

Not Included (Does Not Meet Requiremnts)

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Meets Broward County Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NiA NiA NiA NiA

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NIA NIA NIA NIA
Method of Submittal BonFire BonFire BonFire BonFire

Additional Information

* Submitted: Certificate of Filing - Domestic Limited
fLiabilityuy Co (LLC)

* Submitted: Southern California iority Supplier
Development Council (NMSDC) Certification - Exp.
09/2024

* Submitted: State of California - Seller's Permit

* Submitted: Broward County Economic
Development & Diversity Certification

* Submitted: Certification Regarding Lobbying;
Debarment, Suspension and Other Responsibility
Matters for Expenditure of Federal Funds

* Submitted: State of Florida - Department of State
Corporation Certification

* Submitted: State of New Jersey - Domestic LLC
Certification

Supplier Notes

None

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None

None
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City of Pembroke Pines

Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name

Gerelcom, Inc.

Jaak Tech LLC

Kambrian Corporation

Magna Cyber LLC

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:

560 NW Enterprise Drive

Port St. Lucie, Fl. 34986
Tel: (772) 340-5998

Web: www.gerelco.com

Primary Contact:
David Uszenski - Network Engineer
duszenski@gerelco.com
Authorized Approver:
Bryan Lanham - RCDD, Vice President

Tel: (772)201-0434

blanham@gerelco.com

Company Information:
5 Alexandria Overlook Drive
Oxon Hill, MD 20745
Tel: (240) 226-6333
info@jaaktechnologies.com
Web: www.jaaktechnologies.com
Primary Contact:

Chris Jordan - Sales Manager
cjordan@jaaktechnologies.com
Tel: (240) 407-8311
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
2707 East Valley Boulevard
Suite 312
West Covina, CA 91792
Tel: (626) 964-4445
team1@kambrian.com
Web: https://www.kambrian.com/
Primary Contact:
Jackie Chen - Sales Specialist
jackie.chen@kambrian.com
Authorized Approver:
Cathy Hsieh - CEO
cathvh@kambrian.com

Company Information:
18213 SW 5th Steet,
Pembroke Pines, FL 33029
Tel: (954) 667-3744
gov@magnacyber.com
Web: www.magnacyber.com
Primary Contact:

Jared Derival - President / CEO
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included Included
-Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included Included
- Attach 1t A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included Included
- Company Profile Form Included Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Not Included

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.
Included - No Designation Chosen

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included - BLANK - Not Signed

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - No Designation Selected

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - Port St. Lucie - Exp. 09/30/24

Not Included (Does Not Meet Requiremnts)

Not Included (Does Not Meet Requiremnts)

Not Included

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Meets Broward County Requirements

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NiA NiA NiA NiA

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NIA NIA NIA NIA
Method of Submittal BonFire BonFire BonFire BonFire

Additional Information

* Submitted: State of Florida - Electrical
Contractors License - Geremia, Kenneth A Jr - Exp
08.31.24

* Submitted: Comptroller of Maryland - Sales &
Use Tax License

* Submitted: California State Board of Equalization
Seller's Permit

* Submitted: Certification Regarding Lobbying;
Debarment, Suspension and Other Responsibility
Matters for Expenditure of Federal Funds

* Submitted: Kambrian Quote (KAMQ19532)

* Submitted: Southern California Minority Supplier
Development Council - Exp 08.01.24

* Supplied: State of Florida - Minority Business
Certification - Exp 09.07.25

Supplier Notes

None

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None

None
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City of Pembroke Pines

Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name

Magna Cyber LLC
(ALTERNATE)

Pawol Tafya, LLC

Presidio

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
18213 SW 5th Steet,
Pembroke Pines, FL 33029
Tel: (954) 667-3744
Primary Contact:

Jared Derival - President / CEO
gov@magnacyber.com
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
7220 NW 47th Place
Lauderhill, FL 33319

Sales@Pawoltafya.com

Web: https:/www.pawoltafya.com
Primary Contact:

Kenol David - Procurement Specialist
Kenol.David@Pawoltafya.com
Tel: (888) 296-3400 - Ext: 1000
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
3250 W. Commercial Place
Suite 360
Oakland Park, FL 33309
Primary Contact:

Amir Wexler - Senior Account Manager
Tel: (561) 701-8661
awexler@presidio.com
Authorized Approver:

Erik Hayko - Senior Contracts Manager
Tel: (608) 371-6750
ehayko@presidio.com

Company Information:
3392 Fann Road
Murfreesboro TN, 37128
Tel: (305) 990-8073
pr@technicalfellows.com
Primary Contact:

Nathan Blasac - Owner / Founder
Authorized Approver:
Same as above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included Included
-Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included Included
- Attach 1t A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included o Included
- Company Profile Form Included Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - No Designation Chosen

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - No Designation Chosen - Not Signed

Included - A. Contractor Currently Complies

Included - No Designation Chosen - Not Signed

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - No Designation Chosen - Not Signed

- Scrutinized Company Certification Included Included Included Included - Not Signed
- E-Verify System Certification Statement Included Not Included Included Included - Not Signed
- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Not Included Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Included - Does Not Meet Requirements - Not Signed

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Not Included

Included - Broward County - Exp. 09/30/21

Included - Broward County - Exp. 09/30/24

Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Meets Broward County Requirements

Included - Meets Broward County Requirements

Included - Meets Broward County Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements - Not Signed

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NiA NiA NiA NiA

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NIA NIA NIA NIA
Method of Submittal BonFire BonFire BonFire BonFire

Additional Information

* Supplied: State of Florida - Minority Business
Certification - Exp 09.07.26

* Supplied: State of Florida - Limited Liability
Company Certification

* Supplied: State of Florida - Limited Liability
Company Certification

* Supplied: Lead Time for ltems and Components
3-14 Days

* Supplied: Notes on Cisco Warranty and Ability to
Deliver

* Suppliied: State of Tennessee - Division of
Busines Services - Limited Liability Company
Certification

Supplier Notes

None

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None

None

Page 3 of 3




#  ltems
1 FPR2140-NGFW-K9 (13)
#1-1 FPR2140-NGFW-K9
#12 FPR2140T-TMC
#13 LFPR214OT-TMCLY
#14 CAB-AC
#15  SF-F2K-TDZ.0.1-k9
#1-6 FPR2K-SSD200
#17  FPR2K-SLIDE-RAILS
#1-8  FPRIK-NM-BLANK
#1:9 FPR2K-FAN
#1-10  FPRIK-PWR-AC-400
#1-11  FPR2K-SSD-BBLKD
#112  FPR-LTP-QR-LBL
#1-13  CON-SNT-FPR2140N
C9500-24VAC-A (15)
#2-1 €9500-24Y4C-A
#22 CAB-NSK6A-NA
#2:3 COKPWR-6S0WAC-R
#2-4 COK-PWR-6S0WAC-R/2
#2:5  COK-TL-FANTRAY
#2-6 C9500-NW-A
#2:7  SC9500HUK9-176
#28  COK-FLSSD-240G
#2:9 C9500-DNA-24Y4C-A
#2-10  C9500-DNA-L-A-3Y
#2-11  CON-SSTCM-C95120A
#2-12 PI-LFAS-T
#213 PLLFAS-AP-T-3Y
#2-14  NETWORK-PNP-LIC
#2-15  CON-SSSNT-CI5024YA
C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)
#3-1 C9200L-48P-4X-A
#3-2 C9200L-NW-A-48
#33 CAB-TA-NA
#34 PWR-C5-BLANK
#3-5  C9200L-DNA-A-48
#3-6  C9200L-DNA-A-48-3Y
#3-7  CON-SSTCM-C92LA48
#38 PI-LFAS-T
#3-9 PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y
#3-10  C9200L-STACK-KIT
#3-11 €9200-STACK
#312 STACK-T4-50CM
#3-13 NETWORK-PNP-LIC
#3-14 CON-SSSNT-C920L48P

4 C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)

#41  C9200L-48P-4X-A

#42 C9200L-NW-A-48
#43 PWR-CS-1KWAC/2
#a-4 CAB-TA-NA

#45  C9200L-DNA-A-48
#4-6  C9200L-DNA-A-48-3Y
#47  CON-SSTCM-C92LA48
#4-8 PI-LFAS-T

#4-9 PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y
#4-10  C9200L-STACK-KIT
#4-11 €9200-STACK
#4-12 STACK-T4-50CM
#4-13  NETWORK-PNP-LIC
#4-14 CON-SSSNT-C920L48P

Description

Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW Appliance, 1U, 1x
NetMod Bay

Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL License

Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL 1Y Subs

AC Power Cord (North America), C13, NEMA 5-

5P, 2.1m
Cisco Firepower Threat Defense software
v7.0.1 for FPR2100

Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140

Firepower 2000 Slide Rail it
Firepower 2000 Series Network Module Blank
Slot Cover
Firepower 2000 Series Fan Tray

Firepower 2000 Series 400W AC Power Supply
Firepower 2000 Series SSD Slot Carrier
Cisco Firepower QR Label - Internal Use Only

SNTC-8XSXNBD Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW
Appliance, 1U, 1Y

Catalyst 9500 24x1/10/25G and 4-port
40/1006, Advantage
Power Cord, 200/240V 6A North America
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling

Catalyst 9500 Type 4 front to back cooling Fan
€9500 Network Stack, Advantage
Cisco Catalyst 9500H XE.17.6 UNIVERSAL

Cisco pluggable SSD storage
€9500 DNA Advantage, Term License
Cisco Catalyst 9500 DNA Advantage 3 Year
License

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9500 DNA Advantage

Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment

SOLN SUPP 8X5XNBD Catalyst 9500 24-port
25/1006 only, Adva

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port license

North America AC Type A Power Cable
Config 5 Power Supply Blank
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv.

Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module
Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 9200L 48-port
POE+, 4 x 106, Ne

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port li

nse

1KW AC Config 5 Power Supply - Secondary
Power Supply
North America AC Type A Power Cable
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv

Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module
Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 92001 48-port

Total Cost
Quantity

49

Price per Unit

27138.91

13371.84

°

© o o o o o o

5786.96

12885.634
0
0

1629.884

0
0
0

2163.736
0

4119.816

383.72

No Bid

No Bid

1973.66

4040.1263

o oo o

2183.18693

2313363

No Bid

No Bid

844.5485
0
0

0

733.4622

4040.1262

2590.6633
0
0

2183.187

2313362

No Bid

No Bid

844.5487
0
0

0
733.462

Gerelcom, Inc.
$810,640.07
Vendor Notes

Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew

Taxncl.

Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Taxncl.

Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew
This is an older Skew, Only S9500UK9-179
will be provided
Tax Incl.

Part Included with Skew

Tax Incl.
Tax Incl,
No Bid
No Bid
Part Included with Skew

Tax Incl.

Tax Incl.

Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew
Tax Incl
Taxncl.

No Bid

No Bid

Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew

Tax Incl.

Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Tax Incl
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew
Tax Incl,
Tax Incl.
No Bid

No Bid

Tax Incl.
Part Included with Skew
Part Included with Skew

Part Included with Skew

Taxncl.

Total Cost

$27,138.91
$0

$13,371.84

$5,786.96

$64,428.17
$0
$0

$8,149.42

$10,818.68

$20,599.08
$1,918.60
No Bid
No Bid
$0

$9,868.30

$197,966.19

$o

$0
$0

$o
$106,976.16
$11,335.48
No Bid

No Bid

$41,382.88
$0
$0

$0

$35,939.65

$96,963.03
so

$62,175.92
$0
$0

$52,396.49
$5,552.07
No Bid

No Bid
$20,269.17

Price per Unit

46314.99

0

2282027

© o o o o o o

4894.85

15393.36
0
0

1557.67

0
o
0

207551
o

4912.04

324.56

0

0

1669.41

482639

©o oo o

2608.06

195.67

6204

482639

o

2475.87
o
o

2608.06

195.67

6204

Axelliant LLC
$922,101.53
Vendor Notes

As Speci
As Specified
As Specified
As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
d

As Speci
As Specified
As Specified
d

As Speci
As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

This part has been EOL by Cisco with no direct
replacement+135
This part has been EOL by Cisco with no direct
replacement

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified

“This part has been EOL by Cisco with no direct
replacement

This part has been EOL by Cisco with no
replacement
As Specified
As Specified
As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified
As Specified

As Specified

ct

This part has been EOL by Cisco with no
replacement

This part has been EOL by Cisco with no direct
replacement
As Specified
As Specified
As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

Total Cost

$46,314.99
$0

$22,820.27

$4,804.85

$76,966.80
$0
$0

$7,788.35

$10,377.55

$24,560.20

$1,622.80

$8,347.05

$236,493.11

$0

$0
$0

$0
$127,794.94
$9,587.83
$0

$0
$38,058.79

$0

$30,399.60

$115,833.36
$0

$59,420.88
$0
$0

$62,593.44
$4,696.08

$0

$0
$18,641.08

$0

$0

$0
$14,889.60

Price per Unit

49653.17

24465.06

© o o o o o o

4429.84

16502.84.
0
0

1669.94

0
0
0

22251
0

5266.08

320

1650

5174.26

o oo o

2796.03

194

0

884.74

5174.26

2654.32
0
0

2796.03

194

615

Presidio
$955,760.74
Vendor Notes Total Cost
N/A $49,653.17
N/A S0
N/A $24,465.06
N/A $0
N/A so
N/A $0
N/A so
N/A $0
N/A so0
N/A so0
N/A $o0
N/A so0
N/A $4,429.88
none $82,514.20
none $0
none $o
none $8,349.70
none $o
none $0
none $0
none $11,125.50
none
none $26,330.40
Price per unitncluding 1 year suppport ) ¢ o
coverage
none so
none so
none so
Price per unitIncluding 1year suppport  gg ey o
coverage
none $253,538.74
none $0
none so
none so
none $0
none $137,005.47
Pri it Including 1
vice per unit Including 1year suppport  gg coc oo
coverage
none $o
none $0
none $43,352.26
none
none $0
none so
none so
none $124,182.24
none $0
none $63,703.68
none $0
none so
none $67,104.72
Price per unit Including 1year suppport | g o6 o0
coverage
none so
none so
none $21,233.76
none $0
none so
none so

Price per unit Including 1 year suppport ~ $14,760.00



#

#11

#1-2

#13

#1-4

#1-5

#1-6
#17
#1-8
#1-9
#1-10
#1-11

#1-12

#1-13

#21
#2:2

#2:3

#24

#2:5
#2:6
#27

#28
#2:9

#2-10

#2:11

#2:12

#213

#214

#215

#31

#32

433
#3-4

#35

#3-6

#37

#3-9

#3-10

#3-11
#3-12

#3-13

#3-14

#4-10

#4-11
#4-12

#4-13

#4-14

Items
1 FPR2140-NGFW-K9 (13)

FPR2140-NGFW-K9
FPR2140T-TMC
L-FPR2140T-TMC-1Y
CAB-AC
SF-F2K-TD7.0.1-K9

FPR2K-SSD200
FPR2K-SLIDE-RAILS
FPR2K-NM-BLANK
FPR2K-FAN
FPR2K-PWR-AC-400
FPR2K-SSD-BBLKD
FPR-LTP-QR-LBL

CON-SNT-FPR2140N
C9500-24Y4C-A (15)
€9500-24Y4C-A
CAB-NSKGA-NA

C9K-PWR-650WAC-R
C9K-PWR-650WAC-R/2

COK-T1-FANTRAY
€9500-NW-A
SC9500HUK9-176

C9K-F1-55D-240G
€9500-DNA-24Y4C-A

€9500-DNA-L-A-3Y

CON-SSTCM-C9512QA

PI-LFAS-T
PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y
NETWORK-PNP-LIC
CON-SSSNT-C95024YA
C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)
€9200L-48P-4X-A

C9200L-NW-A-48

CAB-TA-NA
PWR-CS-BLANK

C9200L-DNA-A-48.
C9200L-DNA-A-48-3Y
CON-SSTCM-C92LA48

PI-LFAS-T
PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y

C9200L-STACK-KIT

€9200-STACK
STACK-T4-50CM

NETWORK-PNP-LIC

CON-SSSNT-C920L48P
C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)
C9200L-48P-4X-A

C9200L-NW-A-48
PWR-CS-1KWAC/2
CAB-TA-NA

C9200L-DNA-A-48.

C9200L-DNA-A-48-3Y

CON-SSTCM-C92LA48

PI-LFAS-T

PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y

C9200L-STACK-KIT

€9200-STACK
STACK-T4-50CM

NETWORK-PNP-LIC

CON-SSSNT-C920L48P

Description

Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW Appliance, 1U, 1x
NetMod Bay

Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL License

Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL 1Y Subs

AC Power Cord (North America), C13, NEMA 5-

5P, 2.1m
Cisco Firepower Threat Defense software
v7.0.1 for FPR2100

Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140

Firepower 2000 Slide Rail it
Firepower 2000 Series Network Module Blank
Slot Cover
Firepower 2000 Series Fan Tray

Firepower 2000 Series 400W AC Power Supply
Firepower 2000 Series SSD Slot Carrier
Cisco Firepower QR Label - Internal Use Only

SNTC-8XSXNBD Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW
Appliance, 1U, 1Y

Catalyst 9500 24x1/10/25G and 4-port
40/1006, Advantage
Power Cord, 200/240V 6A North America
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling

Catalyst 9500 Type 4 front to back cooling Fan
€9500 Network Stack, Advantage
Cisco Catalyst 9500H XE.17.6 UNIVERSAL

Cisco pluggable SSD storage

€9500 DNA Advantage, Term License
Cisco Catalyst 9500 DNA Advantage 3 Year
License

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9500 DNA Advantage

Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment

SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 9500 24-port
25/1006 only, Adva

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port license

North America AC Type A Power Cable
Config 5 Power Supply Blank
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv.

Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module

Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 92001 48-port
PoE+, 4x 106, Ne

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port license

1KW AC Config 5 Power Supply - Secondary
Power Supply
North America AC Type A Power Cable
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv
Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance
Term - Smart Lic

PI Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y

Cisco Catalyst 9200 Stack Module

Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 9200L 48-port
POE+, 4x10G, Ne

Total Cost
Quantity

49

49

24

Kambrian
$956,497.80

Price per Unit Vendor Notes

47655.48 "

23480.77 "

© o o o o o o

5529.87 -

15838.89 "
0 -
0 B

1602.75 -

213558 "
0 -

5054.2 B

366.67 CON-SSTCM-C9524YCA

0 has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

0 has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

1885.98 -

4966.08 "

o oo o

2683.54 B

221.05 -

°

o

has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

802.02 -

700.88 -

4966.08 "

254753 -
0 -

0 B

2683.54 -

22105 B

0 has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

0 has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

700.88 B

has gone EOL and there is no replacement.

Total Cost

$47,655.48
$0

$23,480.77

$5,529.87

$79,194.45
$0
$0

$8,013.75

$10,677.90
$0
$25,271.00

$1,83335

$9,429.90

$243,337.92

$o

$0
$0

$0
$131,493.46
$10,831.45

$0

$0

$39,298.98

so
$0

$0

$34,343.12

$119,185.92
$0
$61,140.72

$0
$0

$64,404.96
$5,305.20
$0
$0

$19,248.48

$0
$o0

$o

$16,821.12

Price per Unit

48787.88

o

24038.72

© o o o o o o

5093.63

16215.26
0
0

1640.83

2186.33
0

51743

337.74

No Bid

No Bid

0

1737.2

5084.1

o oo o

274731

203.62

No Bid

No Bid

826.56

o
0

0

645.59

5084.1

0

2608.07
0
0

2747.31

203.62

No Bid

No Bid

826.56

0
0

o

645.59

Cyber Dreams, LLC
$970,996.35
Vendor Notes

Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW Appliance, 1U, 1x
NetMod Bay
Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL License
Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
and URL 1Y Subs
AC Power Cord (North America), C13, NEMA 5~

5P,2.1m

Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140

Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140

Firepower 2000 Slide Rail Kit
Firepower 2000 Series Network Module Blank
Slot Cover
Firepower 2000 Series Fan Tray

Firepower 2000 Series 400W AC Power Supply
Firepower 2000 Series SSD Slot Carrier
Cisco Firepower QR Label - Internal Use Only

SNTC-8XSXNBD Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW
Appliance, 1U,

Catalyst 9500 24x1/10/25G and 4-port 40/100G,
Advantage
Power Cord, 200/240V 6A North America
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling
650W AC Config 4 Power Supply front to back
cooling
Catalyst 9500 Type 4 front to back cooling Fan
€9500 Network Stack, Advantage
Cisco Catalyst 9500 XE 17.9 UNIVERSAL
59500UK9-179
Cisco pluggable SSD storage
€9500 DNA Advantage, Term License

Cisco Catalyst 9500 DNA Advantage 3 Year
License

SOLN SUPP SW SUB SOLN SUPP SW SUBC950
CON-SSTCM-C9524YCA

No Bid

No Bid

Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment

SOLN SUPP 8X5XNBD Catalyst 9500 24-port
25/1006 only, Adva

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port license

North America AC Type A Power Cable
Config 5 Power Supply Blank
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv.
No Bid
No Bid

Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module

Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 92001 48-port
PoE+, 4x 106, Ne

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
Advantage

€9200L Network Advantage, 48-port license

1KW AC Config 5 Power Supply - Secondary
Power Supply
North America AC Type A Power Cable
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port Term
license
€9200L Cisco DNA Advantage, 48-port, 3 Year
Term license

SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv
No Bid
No Bid

Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module

Catalyst 9200 Stack Module
50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable
Network Plug-n-Play Connect for zero-touch
device deployment
SOLN SUPP 8XSXNBD Catalyst 9200L 48-port
POE+, 4x10G, Ne

Total Cost

$48,787.88
$0

$24,038.72

$5,093.63

$81,076.30
$0
$0

$8,204.15

$10,931.65
$0
$25,871.50

$1,688.70

No Bid
No Bid
$0

$8,686.00

$249,120.90

$0

$0
$0

$0
$134,618.19
$9,977.38
No Bid
No Bid

$40,501.44

$0
$0

$0

$31,633.91

$122,018.40
$0
$62,593.68

$0
$0

$65,935.44

$4,886.88
No Bid
No Bid

$19,837.44

$0
$0

$0

$15,494.16

Price per Unit

49082.75

24184

© o o o o o o

5187.37

16313.25

0
0

1650.74

219954

0

5205.58

343.96

No Bid

No Bid

1769.17

5114.82

o oo o

2763.92

207.36

No Bid

No Bid

874.57

0
0

0

657.47

5114.82

2623.83
0
0

2763.92

207.37

No Bid

No Bid

874.57

0
0

0

657.47

Technical Fellows Consulting
$980,961.70

Vendor Notes Total Cost
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢y 0o o
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢ 1, 0
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not o 1o, 1,
included in price
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢ (oo
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not oo o
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, o, 2

included in price
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not

included in price $26027.90
Cisco Solution Support - technical
support - for C9500-DNA-24YAC-A=,
C9500-DNA-24YAC-A Duration (months) ~ $1,719.80
2.00 // Freigth and tax not included
in price
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢ o0 o

included in price

Freight and tax, when applicable, not

included in price 525062618

Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, 10t ¢ 10 oo
included in price
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢y (0 0
included in price
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, oo o
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, 1 o
included in price
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, o oo
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, o, o)
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not g . o0
included in price
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢ o7 o
included in price
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, o0 oo
included in price
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Not sold separately $0
Freight and tax, when applicable, not ¢, oo

included in price



Acachi LLC Magna Cyber LLC Magna Cyber LLC - Alternate # 1
Total Cost $991,129.08 $1,031,954.33 $1,031,954.33
# items Description Quantity  Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost  Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost _ Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost
1 FPR2140-NGFW-K9 (13)
#a FPR2AONGRWAI o F"epcwerzl}::)M'\ﬁF:: :p""am’ Wax oy 49555.17 AVAILABLE $49,555.17 | 51393166 NA $51,393.17 | 51393166 NA $51,393.17
w12 eerataormmc  CiscoFPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware o AVALABLE - o NA - o N -
and URL License
13 LeeR2oTTIMCLy O FPRZLIO 1’:3’3&1’:';1:““" Malware 24535.88 AVAILABLE $24535.88 | 25322385 NA $2532239 | 25322.385 NA $25,322.39
4 cAB-AC ACPower Cord m"';: Az";e’;‘"]' CI3,NEMAS- 0 AVAILABLE $0 o NA $0 0 NA $0
Cisco Firepower Threat Defense software
#1-5  SF-F2K-TD7.0.1-K9 V7.0.1 for FPR2100 1 0 AVAILABLE so o NA so 0 NA so
6 FPR2K-SSD200  Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140 1 0 AVAILABLE $0 1147.707 NA $1,147.71 1147.707 NA $1,147.71
17 FPR2K-SLIDE-RAILS Firepower 2000 Slide Rail Kit 1 o AVAILABLE 0 303.237 NA $303.24 303.237 NA $303.24
#18 FPRZCNM-BLANK | epower2000 5:‘:: c"::‘::"'k ModuleBlank 0 AVAILABLE $0 38379 NA $38.38 38.379 NA $38.38
a9 FPR2KFAN Firepower 2000 Series Fan Tray 1 o AVAILABLE $0 767.701 NA $767.70 767.701 NA $767.70
#110  FPRK-PWR-AC-400  Firepower 2000 Series 400W AC Power Supply 2 o AVAILABLE 0 1919225 NA $3,838.45 1919225 NA $3,838.45
#1141 FPR2K-SSD-BBLKD Firepower 2000 Series SSD Slot Carrier 1 0 AVAILABLE $0 95.964 NA $95.9 95.964 NA $95.9
#112  FPRLTP-QR-LBL  Cisco Firepower QR Label - Internal Use Only 1 0 AVAILABLE 0 o NA $0 0 NA $0
#1-13 CON-SNT-FPR2140N o1 8XSKNED Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW 1 5259.43 AVAILABLE $5,259.43 6032.928 NA $6,032.93 6032.928 NA $6,032.93
Appliance, 1U, 1Y
2 C9500-24Y4C-A (15)
21 C950024Y4C-A Catalyst 9500 24x1/10/25G and &-port 5 16550.62 AVAILABLE $82,753.10 | 17081152 NA 8540576 | 17081152 NA $85,405.76
40/1006, Advantage
#22 CAB-NSKGA-NA Power Cord, 200/240V 6A North America 10 0 AVAILABLE $o0 o NA so 0 NA $0
123 CcokPwResowacR 0N ACConfiEd Z‘:’:ﬁ:‘z”pply fronttoback o 0 AVAILABLE $0 0 NA $0 0 NA $0
124 cokPwRssOWACR/z  OoOWACConfiEd ZZ‘ZE:‘Z“””"’ fronttoback ¢ 1674.77 AVAILABLE $8,373.85 1728.452 NA $8,642.26 1728.452 NA $8,642.26
425 COKTLFANTRAY  Catalyst 9500 Type 4 front to back cooling Fan 10 o AVAILABLE $0 o NA $0 0 NA $0
6 00-NW-A €9500 Network Stack, Advantage s o AVAILABLE 0 o NA $0 o NA $0
W27 SCI500HUKS-176 Cisco Catalyst 9500H XE.17.6 UNIVERSAL 5 0 AVAILABLE $0 0 NA $0 0 NA $0
428 COKF1S5D-2406 Cisco pluggable SSD storage 5 223155 AVAILABLE $11,157.75 | 2303.081 NA $1151541 | 2303.081 NA $11,515.41
#2:9  C9500-DNA-24YAC-A €9500 DNA Advantage, Term License B o AVAILABLE 0 o NA 0 o NA 0
210 COS00-DNALAGY o€ Catalst 950&2':; Advantage 3 Year 5 528131 AVAILABLE $26,406.55 545061 NA $27,253.05 545061 NA $27,253.05
#211 CON-SSTCM-CI5120A  SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9500 DNA Advantage 5 34874 AVAILABLE $1,743.70 301 NA $1,505.00 301 NA $1,505.00
1 . Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance s o AVAILABLE - N " - o N -
Term - Smart Lic
#2-13 PI-LFAS-AP-T-3Y Pl Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term 3Y 15 0 AVAILABLE $o0 o NA $0 0 NA S0
4214 NETWORK-pNpLC  \etWorkPlugm-Play Connect for zero-touch 5 0 AVAILABLE $0 0 NA $0 0 NA $0
device deployment
215 CON-SSSNT-Coszaya  SOHN SUPP BXSXNBD Catalyst 9500 24-port 5 179375 AVAILABLE $8,968.75 2057.55 NA $10,287.75 205755 NA $10,287.75

25/100G only, Adva

C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)

Catalyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network

5355.592

o oo o

2894.012
241164
0

o

864.908
o
o

0

764.643

$262,424.01

$0

$0

$0

$0
$141,806.59
$11,817.04

$0

$0
$42,380.49

$0

$0

$o

$37,467.51

5355.592

o oo o

2894.012
241164
0

0

864.908

764.643

NA

NA

NA
NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

$262,424.01

$0

$0

$0

$0
$141,806.59
$11,817.04

$0

$0
$42,380.49

$0

$0

$0

$37,467.51

431 C9200L-48P-4X-A a9 518923 AVAILABLE 525027227
Advantage
432 CO200LNW-A48  C9200LNetwork Advantage, 48-portlicense 49 0 AVAILABLE 0
33 CABTANA North America AC Type A Power Cable a9 0 AVAILABLE 0
434 PWRCS-BLANK Config 5 Power Supply Blank a9 0 AVAILABLE $0
435 Co200LDNAA4s  CT200LCiscoDNA I‘_‘\i::age’ ABportTerm g o AVAILABLE $0
436  Cor00LDNAAdg3y  CO00HClscoDNAAdvantage, 4B-port, 3vear o 2804.12 AVAILABLE $137,401.88
Term license
437 CON-SSTCM-CO2LA48  SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv. a9 21024 AVAILABLE 51030176
s otFAST Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance w© o AVALABLE -
Term - Smart Lic
439 PLIFASAPT-3Y  PIDevLicfor Lifecycle & Assurance Term3Y 49 0 AVAILABLE $0
4310 CO200LSTACK-KIT Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module a9 8351 AVAILABLE $40,919.90
#311  C9200-STACK Catalyst 9200 Stack Module % 0 AVAILABLE 0
#3312 STACK-T&-50CM 50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable a9 0 AVAILABLE $0
4313 NETWORKPNpLC  NetworkPlugn-Play Connect for zero-touch 49 0 AVAILABLE $0
device deployment
LN SUPP EXSXNBD Catalyst 9200L 4
#4314 CON-SsSNT-cozotagp SOV SUPP BXSXNBD Catalyst 9200L 48port g 666.61 AVAILABLE $32,663.89
POE+, 4 x 106, Ne
C9200L48P-4X-A (14)
#a1 Cooo0L4gpax  COrAIVSt9200L4-portPob, 410G, Network 5189.23 AVAILABLE $124,541.52
Advantage
442 CO200LNW-A48  C9200LNetwork Advantage, 48-portlicense 24 0 AVAILABLE $0
#13  PWR-C5-IKWAC/2 KW AC Config 5 Power Supply - Secondary 2 2662 AVAILABLE $63,888.00
Power Supply
a4 CABTANA North America AC Type A Power Cable a8 0 AVAILABLE $0
#45  Co200LDNAA4g o200 CiscoDNA ﬁ‘t;’:age’ 48-port Term 2 0 AVAILABLE $0
6 Cor00LDNAAdg3y  COO0HClscoDNAAdvantage, 4B-port, 3vear 2804.12 AVAILABLE $67,208.88
Term license
447  CON-SSTCM-CO2LA48  SOLN SUPP SW SUBCS200L Cisco DNA Adv 2 21024 AVAILABLE $5,045.76
s otFAST Prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance e o AVALABLE -
Term - Smart Lic
489 PLLFASAPT-3Y  PIDevLicfor Lifecycle & Assurance Term3Y 24 0 AVAILABLE $0
4810 CS200LSTACK-KIT Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module i 8351 AVAILABLE $20,042.40
#11  C9200-STACK Catalyst 9200 Stack Module a8 0 AVAILABLE 0
#4812 STACK-T&-50CM 50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable 2 0 AVAILABLE $0
4813 NETWORKPNpLC  NetworkPlugn-Play Connect for zero-touch 2 0 AVAILABLE $0
device deployment
14 CON-SSSNT-cozoLagp SOV SUPP BXSXND Catalyst 9200L 48port 5 666.61 AVAILABLE $15,998.64

POE+, 4x 10G, Ne

5355.592

0

2747.338
0
0

2630.92

241164

764.643

$128,534.21
$0
$65,936.11
$0
$0
$63,142.08
$5,787.94
$0
$0
$20,757.79
$o0
$0
$0

$18,351.43

5355.592

2747.338
0
0

2630.92

241164

764.643

NA

NA

NA

NA
NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

$128,534.21
$0
$65,936.11
$0
$0
$63,142.08
$5,787.94
$0
$0
$20,757.79
$o0
$0
$0

$18,351.43



Total Cost $1,081,733.06 $1,128,099.00 $1,282,921.00
§ tems Description Quantity  Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost  Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost _ Price per Unit Vendor Notes Total Cost
1 FPR2140-NGFW-K9 (13)
#1 FPR24O-NGRW-kg (o0 FirePower Z'}::)M'\:T:; :p""am’ Wax oy 4782177411 None $47,821.77 49800 N/A $49,800.00 54771 n/a $54,771.00
Cisco FPR2140 Threat Defense Threat, Malware
#12 FPR2140T-TMC and URL License 1 0 None $o0 o N/A so 0 n/a $0
413 LepRotaoTTMCay  CSC0 FPR2LA0Threat Defense Threat, Malware 2356269845 None $23,562.70 24450 N/A $24,450.00 26987 n/a $26,987.00
and URL 1Y Subs
e ChpAC AC Power Cord (Nor;: Azrr;e’::a], ci3 NEmAS o None w© o A © o e ©
Cisco Firepower Threat Defense software
#1-5  SF-F2K-TD7.0.1-K9 V7.0.1 for FPR2100 1 0 None so o N/A so 0 n/a so
6 FPR2K-SSD200  Firepower 2000 Series SSD for FPR-2130/2140 1 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 0 nfa $0
L7 FPR2K-SLIDE-RAILS Firepower 2000 Slide Rail Kit 1 o None 0 o N/A 0 o n/a 0
sis  FeRacNMBLaN  Firepower 2000 Series Network Module Blank o None © o A w0 o e w0
Slot Cover
a9 FPR2KFAN Firepower 2000 Series Fan Tray 1 o None 0 o N/A $0 0 n/a 0
#110  FPR2K-PWR-AC-400  Firepower 2000 Series 400W AC Power Supply 2 o None 0 o N/A $0 o n/a 0
#1-11  FPR2K-SSD-BBLKD Firepower 2000 Series SSD Slot Carrier 1 0 None $o o N/A so 0 n/a $o0
#1412 FPRLTP-QR-BL  Cisco Firepower QR Label - Internal Use Only 1 0 None 0 0 N/A $0 o n/a 0
#1-13 CON-SNT-fPR2140N >\ 1C8XSKNED Cisco Firepower 2140 NGFW 1 7017.86151 None $7,017.86 14900 N/A $14,900.00 8038 n/a $8,038.00
Appliance, 1U, 1Y
2 C9500-24Y4C-A(15)
W21 C9500-24Y4C-A Catalyst 9500 24x1/10/25G and &-port B 15894.15482 None $79,470.77 16600 N/A $83,000.00 18204 n/a $91,020.00
40/100G, Advantage
W22 CABNSK6ANA Power Cord, 200/240V 6A North America 10 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 0 nfa $0
123 CcokpwResowacR  O0WACConfiEd Z‘:’:ﬁ:‘z”pply fronttoback o 1608336675 None $8,041.68 0 N/A $0 1842 n/a $9,210.00
W AC Config 4 P Iy i K
04 cokpPwResowACR/2 CoOWACConfie :::Ti:‘:upnv ront to bacl 5 0 None $0 1670 N/A $8,350.00 0 n/a $0
425 COKTLFANTRAY  Catalyst 9500 Type 4 front to back cooling Fan 10 o None $0 o N/A $0 0 n/a $0
-6 €9500-NW-A €9500 Network Stack, Advantage s 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 0 n/a $0
#2-7 SCIS00HUK9-176 Cisco Catalyst 9500H XE.17.6 UNIVERSAL 5 0 None $o0 o N/A $0 0 n/a $0
428 COKF1SSD-2406 Cisco pluggable SSD storage 5 2143.0398 None $10,715.20 2230 N/A $11,150.00 2454 n/a $12,27000
2.9 C9500-DNA-24YAC-A €9500 DNA Advantage, Term License B o None 0 o N/A 0 1064 n/a $5,320.00
i ! DNAA Y
#2210  cosooDNALAgy  Ciseocaast gsngcwe vantage 3 Vear B 5071.844085 None $25,359.22 5400 N/A $27,00000 5809 n/a $29,045.00
#211 CON-SSTCM-CI5120A  SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9500 DNA Advantage 5 929.069955 None 54,645.35 975 We have quoted part # CON-SSTCM-C3524YCA ~ $4,875.00 0 n/a $0
12 prFAST prime Infrastructure Lifcycle & Assurance s o None & o A - o e -
Term - Smart Lic
#213 PILLFAS-APT3Y Pl Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term3Y 15, 0 None $0 o N/A $0 o n/a $0
#214 NETWORKPNpuic  NeMWOrk PlugmPlay Connect for zero-touch 5 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 0 n/a $0
device deployment
1215 CON-SSSNT-Cosozaya  SCLN SUPP BXSXNBD Catalyst 9500 24-port 5 4778.711025 None $23,893.56 4997 N/A $24,985.00 6843 n/a $34,215.00
25/100G only, Adva
3 C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)
#1 conoodgpaxa  CANStO200 43:’:‘2::;2: 4x106, Network 4 4983.42306 None $244,187.73 5110 N/A $250,390.00 5708 n/a $279,692.00
432 CO200LNW-A48  C9200L Network Advantage, 48-portlicense 49 o None 0 o N/A 0 2543 n/a $124,607.00
33 CABTANA North America AC Type A Power Cable 49 0 None $0 o N/A $0 0 nfa $0
434 PWRCS-BLANK Config 5 Power Supply Blank 49 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 0 n/a 0
#35  Co200LDNAA4g  CO200LCiscoDNA ﬁt’;’:“e’ dBportTerm g o None $0 0 N/A 0 0 n/a $0
436 coroLDNaAdgay OO0 @ DN&::T:;:S: aeport,3ear g 2692900815 None $131,952.14 2853 N/A $139,797.00 3084 n/a $151,116.00
#37  CON-SSTCM-CS2LA48  SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv 49 560.107185 None $27,445.25 576 N/A $28,224.00 641 n/a $31,409.00
s PrFAST prime Infrastructure Lifecycle & Assurance © o None - o WA - B e -
Term - Smart Lic
439 PLLFASAP-T3Y Pl Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term3Y 49 o None $0 0 N/A $0 o n/a $0
310 C9200LSTACKKIT Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module a9 807.545145 None 539,569.71 813 N/A $39,837.00 925 n/a $45,325.00
#3141  C9200STACK Catalyst 9200 Stack Module 98 0 None $0 o N/A $0 0 nfa $0
#312 STACK-T4-50CM 50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable 49 0 None $0 o N/A $0 0 n/a $0
1313 NETWORKpNpc  NerworkPlugm-Play Comnect forzerostouch g o None $0 N/A 0 0 n/a $0
device deployment
#4314 CON-SsSNT-cozotagp  SO-N SUPP BXSXNBD Catalyst 9200L d8-port g 1775898795 None $87,019.04 1845 N/A $90,405.00 0 n/a $0
POE+, 4 x 106, Ne
4 C9200L-48P-4X-A (14)
Iyst 9200L 48-port PoE+, 4 x 10G, Network
w1 cono0Ldgpaxa  CHAVSHO200 3::‘/’:“';(; X106, Network 5, 4983.42306 None 511960215 5129 N/A $123,096.00 5708 n/a $136,992.00
442 CO200LNW-A48  C9200L Network Advantage, 48-portlicense 24 0 None $0 0 N/A $0 3084 n/a 574,016.00
w3 wRcsiwacp  KWACConfiE :D :/"e"r’;z:“;”"’ - Secondary 2 2556419415 None $61,354.07 2648 N/A $63,552.00 2028 n/a $70,272.00
a4 CABTANA North America AC Type A Power Cable 48 0 None $0 o N/A $0 o n/a $0
#45  Co200LDNAA4g (0200 CiscoDNA ﬁt’;’:“e’ 48-port Term 2 0 None $0 N/A $0 2543 n/a $61,032.00
a6 CorooLDNAAdgay  COR00CO DN&::T:;:?: aeport,3ear oy 2692900815 None $64,629.62 2763 N/A $66,312.00 0 n/a $0
47 CON-SSTCM-CS2LA48  SOLN SUPP SW SUBC9200L Cisco DNA Adv 2 560.107185 None $13,442.57 579 N/A $13,896.00 641 n/a $15,384.00
s PrFAST Prime Infrastructure Lifcycle & Assurance " o None - o WA - B e -
Term - Smart Lic
449 PLLFASAP-T3Y Pl Dev Lic for Lifecycle & Assurance Term3Y 24 o None $0 0 N/A $0 0 n/a $0
410 CI200LSTACKKIT Cisco Catalyst 9200L Stack Module 2 807.545145 None 519,381.08 825 N/A $19,800.00 925 n/a $22,200.00
W11 C9200STACK Catalyst 9200 Stack Module 48 0 None $0 o N/A $0 o nfa $0
#412  STACK-T4-50CM 50CM Type 4 Stacking Cable 2 o None $0 0 N/A $0 0 n/a $0
w13 NETWORKpNpC  NerworkPlugm-Play Connect forzerostouch ) o None $0 N/A $0 0 n/a $0
device deployment
14 CON-SsSNT-cozotagp  SOUN SUPP BXSXNBD Catalyst 9200L d8-port 5 1775898795 None $42,621.57 1845 N/A $44,280.00 0 n/a $0

POE+, 4 X 10G, Ne
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