#0-4

#0-5

#0-6

#0-7

#0-8

#0-10

#0-11

#0-12

#0-13

#0-14

#0-15

#0-16

#0-17

#0-18

#0-19

TS-22-05 Cameras

Items

Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera

Axis Camera
Verkada Bullet
Series CB51-E
Camera, 30 days
Verkada Bullet
Series CB51-TE, 30
days

Verkada 3 Year
License
Cradlepoint
AER2200 Branch
Router

Cradlepoint
AER2200 Mounting
kit

Cradlepoint
AER2200 Power
adapter

DDB Industries 7RU
outdoor NEMA 4
Cabinet

Pentair 800 BTU AC
unit

DDB Industries
Inner insulation
DDB Industries
Cover Plates

Part

Number QTY
P1455-LE 24
Q1798-LE 8
Q3819-PVE 30
Q6100-E 2
Q6315-LE F 9
M2036-LE 38
P3719-PLE 9
D2110-VE | 6
A8207-VE I 7
CB51-30E-t 20
CB51-30TE 2
LIC-3Y 22
BA3-22001 20
170749-00 20
170751-00 20
WOD-16DX 20
APC-800-T: 20
OD-INS 20
ZP-NDCPP 40

Integrated Security Systems
$143,952.34
0
S0

Alternate make, model,
specs, etc. *Only fill out

B & H Foto & Electronics Corp.
$149,187.00
0
S0

Alternate make,
model, specs, etc.
*Only fill out on

on “Additional
Responses" Tab

Unit of the Excel File. Total
Price Cost
$377.72 0 $9,065.28
$1,134.42 0 $9,075.36
$1,260.54 0 $37,816.20
$1,008.30 0 $2,016.60
$1,891.13 0 $17,020.17
$251.60 0 $9,560.80
$1,008.30 0 $9,074.70
$945.25 0 $5,671.50
$882.19 0 $6,175.33
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,765.44 0 $35,308.80
$14.39 0 $287.80
$143.99 0 $2,879.80
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

“Additional
Responses" Tab

Unit £ the Excel Fil Total

Price of the Excel File. '
$519.00 AX01997001 $12,456.00

$1,579.00 AXQ1798LE $12,632.00

$1,749.00 AXQ3819PVE $52,470.00

$1,399.00 AXQ6100E $2,798.00

$2,699.00 AX01925004 $24,291.00
$369.00 AXM2036LEWH $14,022.00

$1,399.00 AXP3719PLE $12,591.00

$1,379.00 AXD2110VE $8,274.00

$1,379.00 AXA8207VEMK2 $9,653.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Focus Camera LLC
$151,073.07
0
S0

Alternate make,
model, specs, etc.
*Only fill out on
“Additional
Responses" Tab

Unit
! of the Excel File.

Price

$539.99 Same as requested
$1,619.99 same as requested
$1,799.99 Same as requested
$1,349.10 Same as requested
$2,699.99 Same as requested

$359.10 Same as requested
$1,439.99 Same as requested
$1,349.99 Same as requested

$1,349.99 Same as requested

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Total

Cost
$12,959.76
$12,959.92
$53,999.70
$2,698.20
$24,299.91
$13,645.80
$12,959.91
$8,099.94

$9,449.93

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc
$157,732.00
0
S0

Alternate make, model, specs,
etc. *Only fill out on “Additional

Unit
Price
$519.00 N/A
$1,337.00 N/A
$1,485.00 N/A
$1,118.00 N/A
$2,228.00 N/A
$296.00 N/A
$1,188.00 N/A
$1,114.00 N/A

$1,114.00 N/A

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

$1,448.00 N/A

No Bid No Bid
$118.00 N/A
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Responses" Tab
of the Excel File.

Total

Cost
$12,456.00
$10,696.00
$44,550.00
$2,236.00
$20,052.00
$11,248.00
$10,692.00
$6,684.00

$7,798.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$28,960.00

No Bid

$2,360.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid



#0-1

#0-2

#0-3

#0-4

#0-7

#0-8

#0-9

#0-10

#0-11

#0-12

#0-13

#0-14

#0-15

#0-16

#0-17

#0-18

#0-19

TS-22-05 Cameras

Items

Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera
Axis Camera

Axis Camera
Verkada Bullet
Series CB51-E
Camera, 30 days
Verkada Bullet
Series CB51-TE, 30
days

Verkada 3 Year
License
Cradlepoint
AER2200 Branch
Router

Cradlepoint
AER2200 Mounting
kit

Cradlepoint
AER2200 Power
adapter

DDB Industries 7RU
outdoor NEMA 4
Cabinet

Pentair 800 BTU AC
unit

DDB Industries
Inner insulation
DDB Industries
Cover Plates

Part

Number QTY

P1455-LE

Q1798-LE

Q3819-PVE

Q6100-E

Q6315-LEF

M2036-LE

P3719-PLE

D2110-VE|

A8207-VE I

CB51-30E-

CB51-30TE

LIC-3Y

BA3-22001

170749-00

170751-00

WOD-16DX

APC-800-T:

OD-INS

ZP-NDCPP

24

8

30

20

22

20

20

20

20

20

20

40

ODP Business Solutions, LLC
$166,837.01
0
S0
Alternate make, model,
specs, etc. *Only fill out
on “Additional
Responses" Tab
Unit of the Excel File.
Price

Total

Cost
$482.97 01997-001 Network sun $11,591.28

$1,450.54 01702-001 Network sun $11,604.32

$1,611.80 01819-001 Panoramic c: $48,354.00

$1,289.28 01711-001 Network sun  $2,578.56

$2,418.10 01925-004 Network sun $21,762.90
$321.71 02125-001

$12,224.98

$1,289.28 01500-001 Panoramic c: $11,603.52

$1,208.65 01564-001 Axis Commut  $7,251.90

$1,208.65 02026-001 Axis Commur  $8,460.55

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1,451.84 BA3-2200120B-NNN $29,036.80

No Bid No Bid No Bid
$118.41 170751-000 $2,368.20

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gerelcom Inc.
$226,524.79
0
S0

Alternate make,

model, specs, etc.

*Only fill out on
“Additional
Responses" Tab
of the Excel File.

Unit
Price
$461.23 11-14 weeks
$1,385.23 4-5 months
$1,539.23 4-5 months
$1,231.23 4-5 months
$2,309.23 4-5 months
$307.23 11-14 weeks
$1,231.23 4-5 months
$1,154.23 4-5 months

$1,154.23 4-5 months

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

2142.66 8-10 weeks

2268.05 8-10 weeks

297 8-10 weeks

75.9 8-10 weeks

Total

Cost
$11,069.52
$11,081.84
$46,176.90
$2,462.46
$20,783.07
$11,674.74
$11,081.07
$6,925.38

$8,079.61

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$42,853.20
$45,361.00
$5,940.00

$3,036.00

ER Tech Systems Group, Inc.

model, specs, etc.

Unit
Price
$539.10 n/a
$1,619.10 n/a
$1,799.10 n/a
$1,439.10 n/a
$2,699.10 n/a
$399.00 n/a
$2,239.81 n/a
$1,349.10 n/a

$1,349.10 n/a

$1,119.20 n/a

$1,199.20 n/a

$399.00 n/a

$2,159.38 n/a

$28.00 n/a

$32.50 n/a

$2,659.80 n/a
$1,755.09 n/a
$114.18 n/a

$34.50 n/a

$329,812.29
0
S0

Alternate make,

*Only fill out on
“Additional
Responses" Tab
of the Excel File.

Total

Cost
$12,938.40
$12,952.80
$53,973.00
$2,878.20
$24,291.90
$15,162.00
$20,158.29
$8,094.60

$9,443.70

$22,384.00

$2,398.40

$8,778.00

$43,187.60

$560.00

$650.00

$53,196.00
$35,101.80
$2,283.60

$1,380.00

Bryant Integrated Technologies
$334,269.00
0
S0
Alternate make, model, specs,
etc. *Only fill out on “Additional
Responses" Tab
of the Excel File.
Unit
Price
$506.00 Milesight MS-C2964-RFIPA
$1,545.00 MILESIGHT MS-C5366X12PA
$1,667.00 MILESIGHT MS-C8176-PA
$1,351.00 MILESIGHT MS-C9674-PA
$2,550.00 MILESIGHT MS-C2941-X30TPA
$347.00 MILESIGHT MS-C5364-PD/J
$1,343.00 MILESIGHT MS-C2974-PA
$1,263.00 NO ALTERNATE

$1,284.00 NO ALTERNATE

$1,153.00 NO ALTERNATE

$1,229.00 NO ALTERNATE

$453.00 NO ALTERNATE

$1,917.00 NO ALTERNATE

$66.00 NO ALTERNATE

$183.00 NO ALTERNATE

$2,025.00 NO ALTERNATE
$3,170.00 NO ALTERNATE
$318.00 NO ALTERNATE

$80.00 NO ALTERNATE

Total

Cost
$12,144.00
$12,360.00
$50,010.00
$2,702.00
$22,950.00
$13,186.00
$12,087.00
$7,578.00

$8,988.00

$23,060.00

$2,458.00

$9,966.00

$38,340.00

$1,320.00

$3,660.00

$40,500.00
$63,400.00
$6,360.00

$3,200.00



IFB # TS-22-03 Hewlett Packard Enterprise Server with Qumulo File Data Platform

City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name

Integrated Security Systems

B & H Foto & Electronics Corp.

Focus Camera LLC

Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
1876 NW 7" St,,

Miami, FL33125
(305)324-8800
Primary Contact:
Jennifer Medina - Business Development Manager
(305)815-3694
jmedina@teamiss.com
Authorized Approver:
Ronen Sarig - General Manager
(305)341-4628
rsarig@teamiss.com

Company Information:
440 Ninth Ave. New York,
NY 10001
(212)239-7500
Fax:(212)239-7509
Shmulyk@bhphoto.com
Primary Contact:
Shmuly Koppel - Bids
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:

905 McDonald Ave. Brooklyn,
NY. 11218
(718)431-7978
Bids@focuscamera.com
Primary Contact:

Igal Avshalom - Account Manager
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
605 County Line Rd. Unit A
Palmer Lake, Co 80133
Primary Contact:
Saun Sandoval - CEO
Shaun@sccicovert.com
(303)918-3878
Authorized Approver:
Sara Swaney - VIP of Finance
sara@sccicovert.com
(303)956-99720

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

- Pricing Sheets / Bid Tables Included Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included Included
- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included Included
- Company Profile Included Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - Currently Complies

Included - C. Contractor will not comply with the
conditions of this section at the time of contract award

Included - B. Contractor will comply with the conditions
of this section at the time of contract award.

Included - A. Contractor currently complies with the
requirements of this section

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements - Miami Dade

Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements

Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements

Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements

Exp. 09 30 22
- Certification Regarding Lobbying; Debarment, Suspension and Other
Responsibility Matters for Expenditure of Federal Funds Not Included Not Included Not Included ncluded
- Minority-Owned Business Enterprise Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
- Woman-Owned Business Enterprise Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
- HUBZone-Certified Small Businesses / Labor Surplus Area Firms Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)
- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) N/A NIA N/A NIA
- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) N/A NIA N/A NIA
Method of Submittal BonFire BonFire BonFire BonFire
Supplied - *State Registration
*Resale Certificate " I . :
. e Supplied - *Local Vendor Certification Supplied - *Local Vendor Certification

Additional Information L(ical Vendor Certification *State Registration *State Registration None

Professional License
Supplier Notes None None None None
Comments None None None None

Page 1 of 2




IFB # TS-22-03 Hewlett Packard Enterprise Server with Qumulo File Data Platform

City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name

ODP Business Solutions, LLC

Gerelcom Inc.

ER Tech Systems Group, Inc

Bryant Integrated Technologies

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
6600 North Military Trail
Boca Raton FI, 33496
(732)330-4810
Primary Contact:
Lisa Pastirik - Business Development
Manager/ Technology
lisa.pastirik@officedepot.com
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:

560 NW Enterprise Dr,

Port St Lucie, Fl 34986
Primary Contact:

Bill Heemskerk - Estemator
bheemskerk@gerelco.com
(772)201-9027
Authorized Approver:
Bryan Lanham - Vice President
blanham@gerelco.com
(772)340-5998

Company Information:

290 SW 12" Ave, Suite 1
Pompano Beach,Fl 33069
(561)578-4964
Fax: (561)658-0360
admin@broadcastsystemsinc.com
Primary Contact:

Oscar Nelson - Contracts Manager
oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com
Authorized Approver:
Nicholas Her - Chief Executive Officer
nick@broadcastsystemsinc.com

Company Information:
2035 Harding street Suit 100
Hollywood, FI 33020
(954)505-3844
Fax:(954)374-8661
Primary Contact:

Leon Chlimper - Sales Manager
leon@bryantintegrated.com
(954)505-3844
Authorized Approver:
Loretta Lance - COO
loretta@bryantintegrated.com

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

- Pricing Sheets / Bid Tables Included Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included Included
- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included Included
- Company Profile Included Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - Currently Complies

Included - C.Contractor will not comply with the
conditions of this section at the time of contract award

Included - Contractor will comply with the conditions of
this section at the time of contract award

Included - Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification Included Included Included Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement Included Included Included Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Not Included Included - Does Not Meet Requirements
- Local Business Tax Receipts Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements Not Included - * Does Not Meet Requirements Included - Broward - Exp. 09 30 22 Not Included
- Certification Regarding Lobbying; Debarment, Suspension and Other

Responsibility Matters for Expenditure of Federal Funds Not Included Not Included Included Not Included
- Minority-Owned Business Enterprise Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
- Woman-Owned Business Enterprise Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
- HUBZone-Certified Small Businesses / Labor Surplus Area Firms Not Included Not Included Not Included Not Included
BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) N/A NIA N/A NIA

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds

(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) N/A NIA N/A NIA
Method of Submittal BonFire BonFire BonFire BonFire

Additional Information

Submmited - *State registration
*Resale Certificate

Submmited - *State Registration

Submmited - *Text (954)608-9224
*Professional License
*State registration
Local vendor form

Submmited - *Professional License
*State Registration
*Local Vendor Preference
*MS-C5364-PD
*MS-C2964-RFIPA
*MS-C8176-PA
MS-C5366-X12PA

Supplier Notes

None

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None

None
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