
Selected Line Item Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost

Vendor 
Notes

Unit Cost
Vendor 
Notes

Unit Cost
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Notes

Unit Cost
Vendor 
Notes

Unit Cost
Vendor 
Notes

X 1
Rose Price Park HVAC Replacement 

Project
Lump Sum $74,634.00 $93,671.75 $106,184.00 $64,550.00 $60,524.50 

X 2
Town Gate Park HVAC Replacement 

Project
Lump Sum $58,935.00 $74,937.40 $70,603.00 $44,350.00 $53,916.60

X 3 Club 19 HVAC Replacement Project Lump Sum $122,871.00 $149,874.81 $167,903.00 $102,850.00 $93,916.60 

X 4 Golf Pro Shop HVAC Replacement Project Lump Sum $21,758.00 $18,734.35 $22,794.00 $14,000.00 $21,971.90 

X 5 Cost for Payment & Performance Bond Lump Sum $4,173.00 $16,860.92 $4,449.00 $5,250.00 $7,491.61 

$282,371.00 $354,079.23 $371,933.00 $231,000.00 $237,821.21
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Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost
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Notes

Unit Cost
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Notes

Unit Cost
Vendor 
Notes

Unit Cost
Vendor 
Notes

1
Rose Price Park HVAC Replacement 

Project
Lump Sum No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Town Gate Park HVAC Replacement 

Project
Lump Sum No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Club 19 HVAC Replacement Project Lump Sum No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Golf Pro Shop HVAC Replacement Project Lump Sum No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Cost for Payment & Performance Bond Lump Sum No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mario's Painting and Services, 
Inc

Total

PRIMARY RESPONSES

ADDITIONAL RESPONSES  

Total

Advanced Roofing, Inc. Cortez Heating & Air Integ Miami,  LLC JCR Mechanical Contractor

Advanced Roofing, Inc. Cortez Heating & Air Integ Miami,  LLC JCR Mechanical Contractor
Mario's Painting and Services, 

Inc



City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Vendor Name JR Mechanical Contractor Mario's Painting and Services, Inc. Advance Roofing, LLC. Cortez Heating & Air Integ Miami, LLC.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
2520 W 74 Street,
Hialeah, FL 33016

office@jcrmechanicalcontractor.com
Primary Contact:

Diana Martinez - Office Manager
Phone:(786)366-9697

Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
911 NW 209th Ave. Suite 104,

Pembroke Pines, FL 33029
info@mariospaint.com

Primary Contact:
Jason Viera - Vice President

Phone:(954)815-6198
Authorized Approver:

Same as Above

Company Information:
1950 NW 22nd Street

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311
Primary Contact:

Paul Murphy- HVAC Manager
Paulm@advancedairsystem.com

Phone:(954)522-6868
Authorized Approver:

Robert Kornahrens - President
kimc@advancedroofing.com

Company Information:
5012 US Highway 41

North Palmetto, FL 34221
Primary Contact:

CJ Wildasin - Account Executive
cjwildasin@cortez-ac.com

Phone:(941)720-1035
Authorized Approver:

David Shephard - General Manager
davidshephard@cortez-ac.com

Phone:(941)755-5211

Company Information:
10001 NW 50th Street, unit 106

Sunrise, FL 33351
Primary Contact:

Carlos Zuluaga - Chief Estimator
czuluaga@integca.com
Phone:(954)338-9889

Authorized Approver:
Miguel Suarez - Vice President

mas@integca.com
Phone:(305)760-4934

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

PRICING SHEET / BID TABLES Included Included Included Included Included

VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included Included Included

- References Form Included Included - Resubmitted just 1 Included Included Included

- Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have 
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have 
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have 
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have 
been charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate have 
been charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form
Included - B. Contractor will comply with the 
conditions of this section at the time of contract 
award.

Included - Contractor Currently Complies 
(Resubmitted) Included - Contractor Currently Complies Included - Contractor Currently Complies Included - Contractor Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form Included - Complies Fully Included - Complies Fully(Resubmitted) Included - Complies Fully Included - Complies Fully Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification Included Included (Resubmitted) Included Included Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement Included Included Included Included Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Included - Not Filled (Resubmitted) Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Included - No Selection Included - Does Not Meet Requirements 

- Local Vendor Preference Certification Included - Does Not Meet Requirements Included - Does Not Meet Requirements 
(Resubmitted) Included - Meets Requirements Included - Meets Requirements Included - Meets Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts  Included - LBTR - Miami Dade
- 09.30.24

 Included - LBTR - Pembroke Pines
- 09.30.24

 Included - LBTR - Broward
- 09.30.24

 Included - LBTR -Polk County 
- 09.30.24

 Included - LBTR - Broward
- 09.30.24

- Anti-Human Trafficking Affidavit Included Included Included Included Included

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) Included Included Included Included Included

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Method of Submittal OpenGov OpenGov OpenGov OpenGov OpenGov

Additional Information
* Submitted: Mechanical Contractor License 

* Submitted: Certification Regarding Lobbying,
Debarment

* Submitted: General Contractor License
* Submitted: Certification Regarding Lobbying,
Debarment

* Submitted: Class A Air Conditioning License
* Submitted: General Contractor License

* Submitted: Class A Air Conditioning License * Submitted: Mechanical Contractor License 

Supplier Notes None None None None None

Comments None None None None None
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