# Items

Cost for Police Training Facility -

#0-1 Concrete Slab project

AN

Cost of Payment and Performance

#0-2 Bond (if applicable)

# Items

Cost for Police Training Facility -

#0-1 Concrete Slab project

N

Cost of Payment and Performance

#0-2 Bond (if applicable)

# Items

Cost for Police Training Facility -

#0-1 Concrete Slab project

AN

Cost of Payment and Performance
#0-2 Bond (if applicable)

Manjor Investment Corp

$87,500.00
Unit Price Vendor Notes Total Cost
$87,500.00 FULL PRICE $87,500.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miami Fresh Renovations
$117,967.00
Unit Price Vendor Notes Total Cost
$117,967.00 N/A $117,967.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
ENCOP, INC.
$129,843.00
Unit Price Vendor Notes Total Cost
$129,843.00 N/A $129,843.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price

$95,000.00 No notes

Unit Price

$118,000.00 n/a

No Bid

Unit Price

$139,958.00 builts per RFP.

Abbot Construction, Inc.

$95,000.00
Vendor Notes Total Cost
$95,000.00
S0 N/A $0
LGI Construction
$118,000.00
Vendor Notes Total Cost
$118,000.00
No Bid No Bid

BD Construction and Development Inc.

$139,958.00
Vendor Notes Total Cost
Includes all materials, labour,
testing, shop drawings, as
$139,958.00
Not Required (Bid Less than
$0 200K) $0

Penuelita Concrete Pump Inc
$105,435.00

Vendor
Unit Price Notes Total Cost
$105,435.00 n/a $105,435
No Bid No Bid No Bid

TECHGROUPONE, Inc

$122,798.95
Vendor
Unit Price Notes Total Cost
$122,798.95 NA $122,798.
S0 NA

Bejar Construction, Inc.

$174,000.00
Vendor
Unit Price Notes Total Cost
$170,000.00 None $170,000.
$4,000.00 None $4,000

.00

.95

$0

.00

.00

Unit Price

$110,000.00

No Bid

Unit Price

$123,000.00

No Bid

Beraki Concrete Contractors LLC
$110,000.00

Vendor Notes

The structurual slab that was
porposed does not have any ramps
to drive on or off said slab; we
recommend 3 ramps to be added.

No Bid

Homestead Concrete & Drainage, Inc.
$123,000.00
Vendor Notes

N/A

No Bid

Total Cost

$110,000.00

No Bid

Total Cost

$123,000.00

No Bid



Vendor Name

Manjor Investment Corp

Abbot Construction, Inc.

Penuelita Concrete Pump, Inc.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
13550 Sw 88th Street, suite 120
Miami, FL 33186
Primary Contact:

Jorge Capestany - President
project@manjorcorp.com
Phone:(786)205-1849
Authorized Approver:

Felix Dayan Guerra - Project Manager
Phone:(561)229-2618

Company Information:
6019 NW 74th Street
Parkland, FL 33067
Primary Contact:
Michael Richel - President
mprichel@gmail.com
Phone:(754)244-0322
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
3401 NW 106 St
Miami, FL 33147
Primary Contact:
Manuel Penuela - President
penuelitacp@outlook.com
Phone:(786)258-3892
Authorized Approver:
Lisset Paultre - Officer Manager
Phone:(305)772-0643

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included
-Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included

- Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included

- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included

- Tab 4 - References Form Included Included Included

- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included - (Not a City Form) Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included - not filled

- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018)

Included (Resubmitted)

Included (Resubmitted)

Included (Not signed)

- Company Profile

Included

Included

Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included (Not signed)

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - Currently Complies

Included - D. Does Not Comply 1 .The contractor does
not provide benefits to employees' spouses in
traditional marriages

Included - Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - Miami Dade - 09-30-2023

Included - Broward - 09-30-2023

Included - Miami Dade - 09-30-2023

- Local Vendor Preference Certification Included - Not Meets Requirements Included - Meets Requirements Not Included
BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)
- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000) NiA N/A N/A
-100°

100% Payment and Performance Bonds N/A N/A N/A

|(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

Method of Submittal

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

Additional Information

*Submitted - State Registration

*Submitted - General contractor License

*Submitted - Exemp frpm Florida workers

compensation
Supplier Notes None None None
Comments None None None
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Vendor Name

Daniel Beraki
DBA
Beraki Concrete Contractors, LLC

Perez-Borroto Construction, LLC
DBA
Miami Fresh Renovations

Leonard Graham, Inc.
DBA
LGI Construction

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
2800 NW 56 Ave Suite A304
Lauderhill, FL 33313
Primary Contact:
Daniel Beraki - CEO
berakiconcrete@gmail.com
Phone:(786)626-3085
Authorized Approver:
Emias Beraki - Manager
emiasbraki@gmail.com
Phone:(786)532-7670

Company Information:
5951 NW 151 ST, Suite 206
Miami Lakes, FL 33014
Phone:(786)382-1507
Primary Contact:
William Perez-Borroto - President
wpb@miamifreshrenovations.com
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
1773 Blount Road Unit 314
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

Phone:(954)326-8061
Primary Contact:
Marcella Holness - Administrator
marcella@lgiconstructionfl.com
Phone:(954)326-1485
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included
- Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included
- Tab 4 - References Form Included Included Included
- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included - (Not a City Form) Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included
- Company Profile Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are

acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are

acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been

charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - B. Will comply

Included - B. Will comply

Included - Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - Not Included

Not Included

Included - Broward - 09-30-2023

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Meets Requirements

Included - Meets Requirements

Included - Meets Requirements

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

N/A

-100% Payment and Performance Bonds
|(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

N/A

Method of Submittal

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

Additional Information

*Submitted - Limited Liability

*Submitted - State Registration / Fictitious Name

*Submitted - Profit Corporation Report
*Submitted - SBD
*Submitted - Roofing License
*Submitted - General Contractor License

Supplier Notes

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None
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Vendor Name

TechGroupOne, inc.

Homestead Concrete & Drainage, Inc.

Encop,Inc.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
8504 NW 66th Steet
Miami, FL 33166
Primary Contact:

Juan C. Maggi - President
contractor@techgroupone.com
Phone:(305)517-3040
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
221 SW 4th Avenue
Homestead, FL 33030
Primary Contact:
Nelson Apolinario - Director
bids@homesteadconcrete.com
Phone:(305)248-9649
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
7858 SW 3RD Street

North Lauderdale, FL 33068
Primary Contact:
Wolmer Oliveira - President
wolmer@encopinc.com

Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included Included
- Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included Included
- Tab 4 - References Form Included Included Included
- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Included
- Company Profile Included Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been

charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - Currently Complies

Included - Currently Complies

Included - B. contractor will comply

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - Broward - 09-30-2023

Included - Broward - 09-30-2023(Resubmitted)

Included - Broward - 09-30-2023

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meets Requirements

Included - Meets Requirements

Included - Meets Requirements

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

N/A

-100% Payment and Performance Bonds
|(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

N/A

Method of Submittal

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

Additional Information

*Submitted - State Registration
*Submitted - MBC
*Submitted - Financial Statement
*Submitted - General Contractor
*Submitted - _Liability Insurance

Supplier Notes

*Submitted - Profit Report
*Submitted - State Registration
*Submitted - Company Presenttion.
*Submitted - General Contractor License

*Submitted - State Registration
*Submitted - General Contractor License

None

None

None

Comments

None

None

None
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Vendor Name

BD C truction and D 1 t Inc.

President

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
18459 Pines Boulevard #531
Pembroke Pines, Fl 33029
Primary Contact:
David Esquivel - President
david@bd-build.com
Phone:(754)287-9794
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

Company Information:
6326 SW 191 Avenue
Pembroke Pines, FL 33332
Primary Contact:
Benny Bejar - President
bejarconstruction@msn.com
Phone:(786)299-1072
Authorized Approver:
Same as Above

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS

Pricing Sheet/Bid Tables Included Included
- Tab 1 - Contact Information Form Included Included
-Tab 2 - Proposer's Background Information Included Included
- Tab 3 - Vendor Registration Checklist Included Included
- Tab 4 - References Form Included Included
- Attachment A: Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included
VENDOR REGISTRATION AND QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS

- Vendor Information Form Included Included
- Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included
- Company Profile Included Included

- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

Included - A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are

acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

- Equal Benefits Certification Form

Included - Currently Complies

Included - Currently Complies

- Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Included - Complies Fully

Included - Complies Fully

- Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

- E-Verify System Certification Statement

Included

Included

- Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

Included - Does Not Meet Requirements

- Local Business Tax Receipts

Included - Pembroke Pines - 09-30-2023

Included - Pembroke Pines - 09-30-2023

- Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Meets Requirements

Included - Meets Requirements

BID SECURITY (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

- 5% Proposal Security / Bid Bond
(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

- 100% Payment and Performance Bonds
|(Required in the event that the proposal exceeds $200,000)

N/A

N/A

Method of Submittal

BonFire / Email

BonFire / Email

Additional Information

*Submitted - State Registration
*Submitted - Certification Regarding Lobbying
*Submitted - MBC Certification
*Submitted - General Contractor License

*Submitted - General Contractor License

Supplier Notes

None

None

Comments

None

None
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