PRIMARY RESPONSES
Shade America, Inc. Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Bejar Construction, Inc. Sky Living CO., Inc. Miniopolis LLC Trevid Group LLC
Selected| Line Item | Description Measure Unit Cost |Vendor Notes  Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost |Vendor Notes Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost |Vendor Notes
X 1 Maxwell Park  Lump sum | $16,890.00 $23,670.00 Industrial Shadeports Inc|] $48,950.00 $47,053.50 Sky Living CO., Inc. | $78,000.00 Pro Playgrounds| $69,850.00
X 2 Josias Dog Park Lump sum | $27,780.00 $29,842.00 Industrial Shadeports Inc|] $49,500.00 $55,765.00 Sky Living CO., Inc. | $48,000.00 Pro Playgrounds| $79,675.00
Total $44,670.00 $53,512.00 $98,450.00 $102,818.50 $126,000.00 $149,525.00
ADDITIONAL RESPONSES
Shade America, Inc. Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Bejar Construction, Inc. Sky Living CO., Inc. Miniopolis LLC Trevid Group LLC
Unit of
Line Item | Description Measure Unit Cost [Vendor Notes  Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost Vendor Notes Unit Cost |Vendor Notes
X 1 Maxwell Park  Lump sum | $16,890.00 No Bid No Additional Response $48,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X 2 Josias Dog Park Lump sum | $27,780.00 No Bid No Additional Response $49,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $44,670.00 No Bid $98,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Question Title

1 certify that | have read, understood and agree to the terms in
this solicitation, and that | am authorized to submit this response

Shade America, Inc.

Pass

City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement

Industrial Shadeports, Inc.

Pass

Bejar Construction, Inc.

Pass

SKY LIVING CO., INC

Miniopolis, LLC.

Trevid Group LLC

Pass Pass Pass
on behalf of my company.
PROJECT COST: PRICING / BID TABLE(S) Included Included Included Included Included Included
Project Documents
Proposers Background Information Form Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
References Form Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
Proposal Security (Bid Bond Form or Cashier’s Check) No Response No Response No Response Pass No Response Pass

Non-Collusive Affidavit

Not Included

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Standard Documents

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any
officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,
members, or agents who are active in management of the entity, nor
any affiliate of the entity have been charged with and convicted of a
public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers,

directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or

agents who are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of

the entity have been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime
subsequent to July 1, 1989.

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers,

directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or

agents who are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of

the entity have been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime
subsequent to July 1, 1989.

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers,

directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or

agents who are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of

the entity have been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime
subsequent to July 1, 1989.

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any
officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,
members, or agents who are active in management of the entity, nor
any affiliate of the entity have been charged with and convicted of a

public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any
officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,
members, or agents who are active in management of the entity, nor
any affiliate of the entity have been charged with and convicted of a

public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

Equal Benefits Certification Form

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass

Contractor currently complies

Contractor currently complies

Contractor currently complies

D. Contractor does not comply 1, The contractor does not provide
benefits to employees' spouses in traditional marriages;

Contractor currently complies

Contractor currently complies

Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB) Preference Certification

Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form
Complies Fully Complies Fully Complies Fully Complies Fully Does not meet Requirement Complies Fully
Scrutinized Company Certification Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
E-Verify System Certification Statement Pass (Resubmitted) Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass

Does not meet Requirement

Does not meet Requirement

Does not meet Requirement

Does not meet Requirement

Does not meet Requirement

Does not meet Requirement

Determination Letter from the United States Department of

Veteran Affairs Center Pass No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response
N/A N/A
Local Vendor Preference Certification Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
Does not meet Requirement Meet Requirement Meet Requirement Does not meet Requirement Does not meet Requirement Meet Requirement
Local Business Tax Receipts Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
LBTR - Johns County - 09-30-24 LBTR - Broward - 09-30-24 LBTR - Pembroke Pines - 09-30-25 LBTR - Dade County - 09-30-25 Not Included LBTR - Broward- 09-30-24

Trade Secrets

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

Anti-Human Trafficking Affidavit Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
Optional Documentation

No Response

Financial Statements

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

Alternatives

No Response

No Response

Pass

No Response No Response No Response Pass
Additional Information No Response Pass No Response Pass Pass
Images o . W-9 .
Liability Certificate Pre-Engineered Shade Structures
Product Specification Liability Certificate v X R Certification of Liability 8
State Registration LBTR-Pompano-09-30-24
Warranty
Professional Licenses Pass No Response Pass Pass No Response Pass
General Contractor License
General Contractor Building Contractor License General Contractor Roofing Contractor License
CBE SBE Certification
Vendor Classification
Is your firm a Minority-Owned Business Enterprise (MBE)? Pass Pass Pass Pass

Pass

No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

Yes, a Hispanic-American MBE

Yes, a Hispanic-American MBE

No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

Is your firm a Woman-Owned Business Enterprise (WBE)?

Pass

Pass

Pass

Pass Pass Pass
No No No No No No
Is your firm a HubZone Business / Labor Surplus Area Firm? Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass
No No No No No No
If you selected "yes" to any of the above questions, please
provide current certificates from the agency(ies) that certified No Response No Response Pass Pass No Response No Response
your vendor classification.
N/A N/A N/A MWBE Certification MBE Certification N/A
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