TS-22-05 Cameras - Award by Line Item

Alternate make, model, specs, etc. *Only fill out on

# Items Part Number Qry Unit Price “Additional Responses" Tab Total Cost Awarded Vendors
of the Excel File.
01997-001 Network surveillance camera - outdoor -
. color (Day&Night) - 2 MP - 1920 x 1080 - 1080p - . .
#0-1 A P1455-LE 24 482.97 11,591.28 ODP B Solut , LLC
0 xis Camera = ? auto iris - vari-focal - audio - GbE - MPEG-4, MJPEG, 3 usiness solutions
H.264, AVC, HEVC, H.265 - PoE Class 3

#0-2 Axis Camera Q1798-LE 8 $1,337.00 N/A $10,696.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-3 Axis Camera Q3819-PVE 180° 30 $1,485.00 N/A $44,550.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-4 Axis Camera Q6100-E 2 $1,118.00 N/A $2,236.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-5 Axis Camera Q6315-LE PTZ 9 $2,228.00 N/A $20,052.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-6 Axis Camera M2036-LE MK II 38 $296.00 N/A $11,248.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-7 Axis Camera P3719-PLE 360° 9 $1,188.00 N/A $10,692.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-8 Axis Camera D2110-VE Radar 6 $1,114.00 N/A $6,684.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
#0-9 Axis Camera A8207-VE MK Il 7 $1,114.00 N/A $7,798.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.

Verkada Bullet Series
#0-10 CB51-E Camera, 30 CB51-30E-HW 20 $1,153.00 NO ALTERNATE $23,060.00 | Bryant Integrated Technologies

days

Verkada Bullet Seri

#0-11 | ‘< <ada BUICLSCMIES | poy 30TE-HW 2 $1,229.00 NO ALTERNATE $2,458.00 | Bryant Integrated Technologies
CB51-TE, 30 days

#0-12 |Verkada 3 Year License LIC-3Y 22 $453.00 NO ALTERNATE $9,966.00 | Bryant Integrated Technologies

Cradl int AER2200
#o-13 | adiepom BA3-2200120B-NNN | 20 |]$1,448.00 0 $28,960.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.

Branch Router

Cradl int AER2200

#0-14 | ~OCIGPOINTAER 170749-001 20 $66.00 NO ALTERNATE $1,320.00 | Bryant Integrated Technologies
Mounting kit

Cradl int AER2200

#o-15 | adepom 170751-000 20 $118.00 N/A $2,360.00 | Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.
Power adapter

DDB Industries 7RU

#0-16 outdoor NEMA 4 WOD-16DXC 20 $2,025.00 No Bid $40,500.00 | Bryant Integrated Technologies
Cabinet

Pentair 800 BTU AC
#0-17 entair o APC-800-T15-110 20 ||$1,755.09 No Bid $35,101.80 | ER Tech Systems Group, Inc.

DDB Industries |
#0-18 naustries inner OD-INS 20 $114.18 No Bid $2,283.60 | ER Tech Systems Group, Inc.

insulation

DDB Industries C

#0-19 naustries tover ZP-NDCPP 40 $34.50 No Bid $1,380.00 | ER Tech Systems Group, Inc.

Plates




Initial Award Current Award Difference in awards
Integrated Security Systems $105,763.74 $0.00 -$105,763.74
ODP Business Solutions, LLC $0.00 $11,591.28 $11,591.28
ER Tech Systems Group, Inc. $72,975.80 $38,765.40 -$34,210.40
Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc. $28,960.00 $145,276.00 $116,316.00
Bryant Integrated Technologies $40,500.00 $77,304.00 $36,804.00
Total Award $248,199.54  $272,936.68 $24,737.14




