
Line 
Item Description Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor Notes

1 Maxwell Park 1 Lump sum $23,670.00 $23,670.00 FALSE
Industrial 

Shadeports Inc

2 Josias Dog Park 1 Lump sum $29,842.00 $29,842.00 FALSE
Industrial 

Shadeports Inc
Total $53,512.00

Exhibit "B"



Line 
Item Description Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor Notes

1 Maxwell Park Lump sum TRUE
No Additional 
Response

2 Josias Dog Park Lump sum TRUE
No Additional 
Response

Total $0.00



Proposer's Background Information Form

# Question Response Comment Status

?

1.1.1 Primary Contact: Please provide the contact information (Name, Title, E-mail and 
Phone Number) for the Primary Contact for this project.

Chip Breitweiser 954-
755-0661 

sales@shadeports.com
Complete

1.1.2 Authorized Approver: Please provide the contact information (Name, Title, E-mail 
and Phone Number) for the Authorized Approver for this project.

Chip Breitweiser 954-
755-0661 

admin@shadeports.co
m

Complete

?

1.2.1 Please state the year that you company started its business. 1993 Complete

1.2.2
Please state the year that your company started providing service under your current 
business name.

1993

Industrial Shadeports has been providing new shadeports, 
replacement service, covers,  repairs, etc since our incorportaion 
in 1993. While our incorporated name has changed over the years 
we have always had a dba as Industrial Shadeports. 

Complete

1.2.3 What State is your Company Registered In? Florida Complete

?

1.3.1 Under what former name has your business operated?  Include a description of the 
business.

Industrial Shadeports USA dba Industrial Shadeports. Sun Shade 
Inc dba Industrial Shadeports. Industrial Shadeports Inc. current 
since 11/1/2016

Complete

1.3.2 At what address was that business located? Pompano Beach, FL . Deerfield Beach, FL. Coral Springs, FL.  Complete

?

1.4.1 Have you ever failed to complete work awarded to you.  If so, when, where and why? No Complete

?

1.5.1 Have you personally inspected the proposed WORK and do you have a complete 
plan for its performance?

Yes Complete

?

1.6.1

Will you subcontract any part of this WORK?  If you will be subcontracting any part of 
this work, provide details including a list of each sub-contractor(s) that will perform 
work in excess of ten percent (10%) of the contract amount and the work that will be 
performed by each subcontractor(s).  (Note: The proposed list of subcontractor(s) 
may not be amended after award of the contract without the prior written approval 
of the Contract Administrator, whose approval shall not be reasonably withheld.)

No Complete

?

1.7.1

List and describe all bankruptcy petitions (voluntary or involuntary) which have been 
filed by or against the Proposer, its parent or subsidiaries or predecessor 
organizations during the past five (5) years.  Include in the description the 
disposition of each such petition.

None Complete

?

1.8.1
List and describe all successful Bond claims made to your surety(ies) during the last 
five (5) years.  The list and descriptions should include claims against the bond of 
the Proposer and its predecessor organization(s).

None Complete

?

1.9.1

List all claims, arbitrations, administrative hearings and lawsuits brought by or 
against the Proposer or its predecessor organizations(s) during the last (10) years.  
The list shall include all case names; case, arbitration or hearing identification 
numbers; the name of the project over which the dispute arose; and a description of 
the subject matter of the dispute.

None Complete

?

Contact Information

Organization Background

Former Business

Past Failure

Inspected

Subcontracting

Bankruptcy Petitions

Bond Claims

Claims, Arbitrations, Administrative Hearings and Lawsuits

Criminal Proceedings or Hearings



1.10.1
List and describe all criminal proceedings or hearings concerning business related 
offenses in which the Proposer, its principals or officers or predecessor 
organization(s) were defendants.

None Complete

?

1.11.1
In regards to the commodities/services proposed, which of the following best 
classifies your firm?  If you selected any options besides \"Original Provider\" please 
explain.

Original Provider Complete

?

1.12.1
Have you ever been debarred or suspended from doing business with any 
governmental agency?  If you have been debarred or suspended from doing 
business with any governmental agency, please explain.

No Complete

?

1.13.1 Describe the firm’s local experience/nature of service with contracts of similar size 
and complexity, in the previous three (3) years.

Over the past 3 years we have manufactured and installed 
structures for over 100 individual customers with approximately 
75% of the customers being municipalities in South Florida.

Complete

?

1.14.1
Are professional licenses required to perform the services requested in this 
solicitation?  If so, please list any applicable professional licenses that your 
company has that are required to provide these services.

Applicable CGC #:CGC1525577 CPSI #: 60331-327. RISC #: 2023-1649 Complete

?

1.15.1

Do you need to disclose any conflicts of interest?
The award of any contract hereunder is subject to the provisions of Chapter 112, 
Florida Statutes.  Proposers must disclose with their Proposal the name of any 
officer, director, partner, proprietor, associate or agent who is also an officer or 
employee of CITY or any of its agencies.  Further, all Proposers must disclose the 
name of any officer or employee of CITY who owns, directly or indirectly, an interest 
of five percent (5%) or more in the Proposer 's firm or any of its branches or affiliate 
companies.

No Complete

Debarment/Suspension

Company Classification

Similar Experience & Contracts

Professional License Information

Conflict of Interest

19 Questions 100.00% Complete































Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Response
Pricing unsealed at Sep 24, 2024 2:31 PM

CONTACT INFORMATION

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

No addenda issued

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. I certify that I have read, understood and agree to the terms in this solicitation, and that I am authorized to submit this response on behalf of my company.*
 Confirmed

2. Project Documents

2.1. Proposers Background Information Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Proposers_Background_Information_Form.xlsx

 Proposers_Background_Information_Form_Industrial_Shadeports.xlsx

2.2. References Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  References_Form.pdf

 References_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

2.3. Proposal Security (Bid Bond Form or Cashier’s Check)
No response submitted

3. Standard Documents
The following documents are standard documents that the City generally requires for every solicitation. As a result, we recommend vendors to keep these documents 
updated and readily available so that they can be easily uploaded for each project that the vendor would like to participate in. In the event that the City does not have one of 
the forms or documents listed below for your company, the City may reach out to your company after the bid has closed to obtain the document(s).

3.1. Non-Collusive Affidavit*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Non-Collusive_Affidavit.pdf

Company
Industrial Shadeports, Inc.

Email
sales@shadeports.com

Contact
Industrial Shadeports

Address
6600 NW 12th Ave
Unit 220
Fort Laudardale, FL 33309

Phone
(954) 755-0661

Website
www.Shadeports.com

Submission Date
Sep 23, 2024 1:01 PM (Eastern Time)

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

10/1/24, 2:55 PM Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Response

https://procurement.opengov.com/governments/82391/projects/109826/evaluation/proposals/219078 1/4

https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/109483/219040a4-d2c4-4955-ac70-602f3ea9092a_Proposers_Background_Information_Form.xlsx?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4AP6KD22P%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T172333Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIEGRcRFAuFmqYEIzwo0W3nut2f0W28yr9M%2Fynm9JWsWwAiEAqFmqjuafXbdMSlGmzznob6tOexK1Z5pPTJIZyXt07XMqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDLDKiYDC8YI9LWLOAyrgBO0yIvasRY1WnpzlnkiS%2BaagdCcgvoyEg%2Bf1zBrs042T3YcSi39baKmN5ALW8BAurMrFBSBIxUnxA95RRurrHtyM7T%2BIekzvE2DV2YO0duu0WNN5h7pwL%2FzqQER5Yb59%2BiywrVM4KyTSue70dzyKlsPSWnceOIP1fR5CCvJkxTu9WzBWMj1eHxflQcKuTghPgBMYuyy7Ah4zYgX4kPGvI2kBuBP7Bhy0FRYnl8uK4FAicralCNiPJ1Lz6RWvyFIXfwu3mUsZRY7siTXhGg7w3FtLYzrgg5eV2h1RRMrxczcIcD7RgI7WHQtGJbs8NXTQvZqtnxXE7LC4SlGCMVq1TtQeGLniiv%2Fe8vPljZFSkbAip1E5U6Ws2g12kvQQfBr86ohAwJRKp%2BNQdbcswRMA6lxkgsxBDrGOi1UP8CZcxHqZHZuajAonfDM4rCJVBftbhX9HpFTThg7WW4lNfXMj6X89VIDViuziy3R2vEDob3mdDxF75zBKy0dpFAJremCZ%2BsQR0LDFtfW4lQM1ZZhyHb6hjZMWEoGEC1Xj7RI9s6neD7CFKw6YhF%2FAR8LQyg%2FxEoBG%2BgVxTrBRBj16akZ0ZdnJ6%2FiFoS%2B8Rit9Ixrzr3g041XSB208JC5JXjtLlasB4hJlQfzQ6sNl03eP36Q%2FVCWS7VdM%2BbZkBnrIiD6sO5kDJ4QXgs76oeuY%2Bp0xQJ9zYPVAx8ZDpeqd%2B6BgsPe5LxUoQ9yk2hGt86P%2B4NQ8WecmQfnDJeXtgZCKT2K8PBgar6z5955RivSeEcCm5yAAd97oe9LJY9itERfYgh8nJRuhMK7N8LcGOpsBEJ974ZNMQLlp%2FEsRex4BrexQoLBpjT1DgRw%2ByP7stOAv0ciVPrJqKbdh9iBsMBrvMomR33W9rK%2FbD7BttWUSZY0%2FVCOwZmiTMunMjtXNzv%2F%2FK%2Fo7hHW2Gkpx3ynGjO0PD4Dt1W0T7ifi6g8C11t9V9kLDBZvdE9SBZ5tlEYcUehjOJMOQnT%2BYefV%2BRetKln6tzLJiY5K6WWib2M%3D&X-Amz-Signature=6f99f13e2df5070b163bad6c12a378c6f32c95bcc3dc4c5691e758f265df3104&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Proposers_Background_Information_Form.xlsx%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/7dd61d9b-b800-46ae-888c-d3ac0d052ef0_Proposers_Background_Information_Form_Industrial_Shadeports.xlsx?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=9dab0d0e0cef4e1961ffb9034385324769f6e4db7ad4936cd409fa815f68c4f3&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Proposers_Background_Information_Form_Industrial_Shadeports.xlsx%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/109483/b6c52808-dc9d-469f-a3a0-d2728a5d2d31_References_Form.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4AP6KD22P%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T172333Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIEGRcRFAuFmqYEIzwo0W3nut2f0W28yr9M%2Fynm9JWsWwAiEAqFmqjuafXbdMSlGmzznob6tOexK1Z5pPTJIZyXt07XMqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDLDKiYDC8YI9LWLOAyrgBO0yIvasRY1WnpzlnkiS%2BaagdCcgvoyEg%2Bf1zBrs042T3YcSi39baKmN5ALW8BAurMrFBSBIxUnxA95RRurrHtyM7T%2BIekzvE2DV2YO0duu0WNN5h7pwL%2FzqQER5Yb59%2BiywrVM4KyTSue70dzyKlsPSWnceOIP1fR5CCvJkxTu9WzBWMj1eHxflQcKuTghPgBMYuyy7Ah4zYgX4kPGvI2kBuBP7Bhy0FRYnl8uK4FAicralCNiPJ1Lz6RWvyFIXfwu3mUsZRY7siTXhGg7w3FtLYzrgg5eV2h1RRMrxczcIcD7RgI7WHQtGJbs8NXTQvZqtnxXE7LC4SlGCMVq1TtQeGLniiv%2Fe8vPljZFSkbAip1E5U6Ws2g12kvQQfBr86ohAwJRKp%2BNQdbcswRMA6lxkgsxBDrGOi1UP8CZcxHqZHZuajAonfDM4rCJVBftbhX9HpFTThg7WW4lNfXMj6X89VIDViuziy3R2vEDob3mdDxF75zBKy0dpFAJremCZ%2BsQR0LDFtfW4lQM1ZZhyHb6hjZMWEoGEC1Xj7RI9s6neD7CFKw6YhF%2FAR8LQyg%2FxEoBG%2BgVxTrBRBj16akZ0ZdnJ6%2FiFoS%2B8Rit9Ixrzr3g041XSB208JC5JXjtLlasB4hJlQfzQ6sNl03eP36Q%2FVCWS7VdM%2BbZkBnrIiD6sO5kDJ4QXgs76oeuY%2Bp0xQJ9zYPVAx8ZDpeqd%2B6BgsPe5LxUoQ9yk2hGt86P%2B4NQ8WecmQfnDJeXtgZCKT2K8PBgar6z5955RivSeEcCm5yAAd97oe9LJY9itERfYgh8nJRuhMK7N8LcGOpsBEJ974ZNMQLlp%2FEsRex4BrexQoLBpjT1DgRw%2ByP7stOAv0ciVPrJqKbdh9iBsMBrvMomR33W9rK%2FbD7BttWUSZY0%2FVCOwZmiTMunMjtXNzv%2F%2FK%2Fo7hHW2Gkpx3ynGjO0PD4Dt1W0T7ifi6g8C11t9V9kLDBZvdE9SBZ5tlEYcUehjOJMOQnT%2BYefV%2BRetKln6tzLJiY5K6WWib2M%3D&X-Amz-Signature=14df8f60b1f14e1a75f4470a50204d52ef80762194cb732dbab3a8860bca4d79&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22References_Form.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/7157dd90-8eea-416b-b323-a06086d6a8b2_References_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=11036a47a3c315754d546abab6d07ff51b98d3e6e9bc68175199370f9e108947&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22References_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/109483/d0e200c1-82f4-4276-911e-841af1a5f800_Non-Collusive_Affidavit.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4AP6KD22P%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T172333Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIEGRcRFAuFmqYEIzwo0W3nut2f0W28yr9M%2Fynm9JWsWwAiEAqFmqjuafXbdMSlGmzznob6tOexK1Z5pPTJIZyXt07XMqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDLDKiYDC8YI9LWLOAyrgBO0yIvasRY1WnpzlnkiS%2BaagdCcgvoyEg%2Bf1zBrs042T3YcSi39baKmN5ALW8BAurMrFBSBIxUnxA95RRurrHtyM7T%2BIekzvE2DV2YO0duu0WNN5h7pwL%2FzqQER5Yb59%2BiywrVM4KyTSue70dzyKlsPSWnceOIP1fR5CCvJkxTu9WzBWMj1eHxflQcKuTghPgBMYuyy7Ah4zYgX4kPGvI2kBuBP7Bhy0FRYnl8uK4FAicralCNiPJ1Lz6RWvyFIXfwu3mUsZRY7siTXhGg7w3FtLYzrgg5eV2h1RRMrxczcIcD7RgI7WHQtGJbs8NXTQvZqtnxXE7LC4SlGCMVq1TtQeGLniiv%2Fe8vPljZFSkbAip1E5U6Ws2g12kvQQfBr86ohAwJRKp%2BNQdbcswRMA6lxkgsxBDrGOi1UP8CZcxHqZHZuajAonfDM4rCJVBftbhX9HpFTThg7WW4lNfXMj6X89VIDViuziy3R2vEDob3mdDxF75zBKy0dpFAJremCZ%2BsQR0LDFtfW4lQM1ZZhyHb6hjZMWEoGEC1Xj7RI9s6neD7CFKw6YhF%2FAR8LQyg%2FxEoBG%2BgVxTrBRBj16akZ0ZdnJ6%2FiFoS%2B8Rit9Ixrzr3g041XSB208JC5JXjtLlasB4hJlQfzQ6sNl03eP36Q%2FVCWS7VdM%2BbZkBnrIiD6sO5kDJ4QXgs76oeuY%2Bp0xQJ9zYPVAx8ZDpeqd%2B6BgsPe5LxUoQ9yk2hGt86P%2B4NQ8WecmQfnDJeXtgZCKT2K8PBgar6z5955RivSeEcCm5yAAd97oe9LJY9itERfYgh8nJRuhMK7N8LcGOpsBEJ974ZNMQLlp%2FEsRex4BrexQoLBpjT1DgRw%2ByP7stOAv0ciVPrJqKbdh9iBsMBrvMomR33W9rK%2FbD7BttWUSZY0%2FVCOwZmiTMunMjtXNzv%2F%2FK%2Fo7hHW2Gkpx3ynGjO0PD4Dt1W0T7ifi6g8C11t9V9kLDBZvdE9SBZ5tlEYcUehjOJMOQnT%2BYefV%2BRetKln6tzLJiY5K6WWib2M%3D&X-Amz-Signature=8727a074e6459fa07ccdd9e71034dba3644c6cf1ac117057caa6679e975b3398&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Non-Collusive_Affidavit.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
http://www.shadeports.com/


 Non-Collusive_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.2. Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Sworn_Statement_on_Public_Entity_Crimes.pdf

 Sworn_Statement_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.3. Equal Benefits Certification Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Equal_Benefits_Certification_Form.pdf

 Equal_Benefits_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.4. Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Vendor_Drug-Free_Workplace_Certification_Form.pdf

 Drug_Free_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.5. Scrutinized Company Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Scrutinized_Company_Certification.pdf

 Scrutinized_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.6. E-Verify System Certification Statement*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  E-Verify_System_Certification_Statement.pdf

 E-Verify_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.7. Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB) Preference Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Veteran_Owned_Small_Business_(VOSB)_Preference_Certification.pdf

 Veteren_Owned_Industrials_Shadeports.pdf

3.8. Determination Letter from the United States Department of Veteran Affairs Center
If claiming Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification, business must attach the “Determination Letter” from the United States Department of Veteran Affairs 
Center for Verification and Evaluation notifying the business that they have been approved as a Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB).

No response submitted

3.9. Local Vendor Preference Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Local_Vendor_Preference_Certification.pdf

 Local_Vendor_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.10. Local Business Tax Receipts
 2024_Broward_Business_Tax_Receipt.pdf

 2023_Broward_Business_Tax_Receipt.pdf

3.11. Anti-Human Trafficking Affidavit*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Anti-Human_Trafficking_Affidavit.pdf

 Human_Trafficking_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

4. Optional Documentation

4.1. Trade Secrets

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/f595d662-98c1-4d6a-9ab3-bf3fa252435c_Human_Trafficking_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=08f1e27fbfb8265155e66d519ac136f221019dae4ea140549601a74c70ae1a76&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Human_Trafficking_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject


a. The Proposer’s response to this solicitation is a public record pursuant to Florida law, which is subject to disclosure by the City under the State of Florida Public 
Records Law, Florida Statutes Chapter 119.07 (“Public Records Law”).  The City shall permit public access to all documents, papers, letters or other material 
submitted in connection with this solicitation and the Contract to be executed for this solicitation, subject to the provisions of Chapter 119.07 of the Florida Statutes.

b. Any language contained in the Proposer’s response to the solicitation purporting to require confidentiality of any portion of the Proposer’s response to the solicitation, 
except to the extent that certain information is in the City’s opinion a Trade Secret pursuant to Florida law, shall be void.  If a Proposer submits any documents or 
other information to the City which the Proposer claims is Trade Secret information and exempt from Florida Statutes Chapter 119.07 (“Public Records Laws”), the 
Proposer shall clearly designate that it is a Trade Secret and that it is asserting that the document or information is exempt.  The Proposer must specifically identify 
the exemption being claimed under Florida Statutes 119.07.  The City shall be the final arbiter of whether any information contained in the Proposer’s response to the 
solicitation constitutes a Trade Secret.

c. EXCEPT FOR CLEARLY MARKED PORTIONS THAT ARE BONA FIDE TRADE SECRETS PURSUANT TO FLORIDA LAW, DO NOT MARK YOUR RESPONSE TO 
THE SOLICITATION AS PROPRIETARY OR CONFIDENTIAL.  DO NOT MARK YOUR RESPONSE TO THE SOLICITATION OR ANY PART THEREOF AS 
COPYRIGHTED.  ALL DOCUMENTS THAT THE FIRM PURPORTS TO BE CONFIDENTIAL, PROPRIETARY OR A TRADE SECRET SHALL BE UPLOADED TO 
THE OPENGOV WEBSITE AS A SEPARATE ATTACHMENT, IN THIS SECTION, CLEARLY IDENTIFYING THE EXEMPTION BEING CLAIMED UNDER FLORIDA 
STATUTES 119.07.

d. The city’s determination of whether an exemption applies shall be final, and the proposer agrees to defend, indemnify, and hold harmless the city and the city’s 
officers, employees, and agent, against any loss or damages incurred by any person or entity as a result of the city’s treatment of records as public records. 

No response submitted

4.2. Financial Statements
a. The City is not requesting the vendor to submit any financial statements for this project and prefers if the vendor does not submit financial statements.  In addition, if 

the City needs a copy of the vendor’s financial statements, the City can contact the vendor after the bid due date to request those documents.  However, if the vendor 
does submit the financial statements, they should be uploaded in this section.

b. Any claim of confidentiality on financial statements must be asserted at the time of submittal.  The firm must identify the specific statute that authorizes the exemption 
from the Public Records Law.  Please note that the financial statement exemption provided for in Section 119.071(1)c, Florida Statutes only applies to submittals in 
response to a solicitation for a “public works” project.

No response submitted

4.3. Alternatives
a. If you are submitting an alternative product, please upload any related information in this section (such as specification sheets, etc.).
b. In addition, pursuant to Section 3.7 “Brand Names,” if and wherever in the specifications a brand name, make, name of manufacturer, trade name, or vendor 

catalog number is mentioned, it is for the purpose of establishing a grade or quality of material only.  Since the City does not wish to rule out other competition and 
equal brands or makes, the phrase “OR EQUAL” is added.  However, if a product other than that specified is bid, Proposers shall indicate on their proposal and 
clearly state the proposed substitution and deviation.  It is the vendor’s responsibility to provide any necessary documentation and samples within their bid submittal 
to prove that the product is equal to that specified.  Such samples are to be furnished before the date of bid opening, unless otherwise specified.  Additional evidence 
in the form of documentation and samples may be requested if the proposed brand is other than that specified.  The City retains the right to determine if the proposed 
brand shall be considered as an approved equivalent or not.

No response submitted

4.4. Additional Information
Please provide any additional information that you deem necessary to complete your proposal in this section, if it has not been requested in another section.

 Shadeports_Overview.pdf

 Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF

 City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf

4.5. Professional Licenses
No response submitted

5. Vendor Classification

5.1. Is your firm a Minority-Owned Business Enterprise (MBE)?*
No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

5.2. Is your firm a Woman-Owned Business Enterprise (WBE)?*
No

5.3. Is your firm a HubZone Business / Labor Surplus Area Firm?*
No

5.4. If you selected "yes" to any of the above questions, please provide current certificates from the agency(ies) that certified your vendor classification.
No response submitted

PRICE TABLES

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/e40f32ec-2246-4ed4-8088-c5c8d184397a_Shadeports_Overview.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=c47c05a705ace11960aa2fefeab6bb04628437f0c6d7dcc6eb77052e0514183f&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Shadeports_Overview.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/e5958672-6576-478a-8a12-221adba6f0af_Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=35b44fb24fc859a1ccbb06ca00ba9b49400bc22da1a1696611ee3290d926675f&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/b4374d5a-96fc-4f51-b08c-b3cb5d2e3f70_City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=e478e3c71960c96eb82243d1e32f708911c886962f4a243f1cbe466395ceb816&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject


Primary Responses

Additional Responses

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor N…

1. Maxwell Park 1 Lump sum $23,670.00 $23,670.00 Industrial
Shadeports

2. Josias Dog Park 1 Lump sum $29,842.00 $29,842.00 Industrial
Shadeports

Total $53,512.00

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor N…

1. Maxwell Park Lump sum  No
Additional

2. Josias Dog Park Lump sum  No
Additional

Total $0.00
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Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Response
Pricing unsealed at Sep 24, 2024 2:31 PM

CONTACT INFORMATION

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

No addenda issued

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. I certify that I have read, understood and agree to the terms in this solicitation, and that I am authorized to submit this response on behalf of my company.*
 Confirmed

2. Project Documents

2.1. Proposers Background Information Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Proposers_Background_Information_Form.xlsx

 Proposers_Background_Information_Form_Industrial_Shadeports.xlsx

2.2. References Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  References_Form.pdf

 References_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

2.3. Proposal Security (Bid Bond Form or Cashier’s Check)
No response submitted

3. Standard Documents
The following documents are standard documents that the City generally requires for every solicitation. As a result, we recommend vendors to keep these documents 
updated and readily available so that they can be easily uploaded for each project that the vendor would like to participate in. In the event that the City does not have one of 
the forms or documents listed below for your company, the City may reach out to your company after the bid has closed to obtain the document(s).

3.1. Non-Collusive Affidavit*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Non-Collusive_Affidavit.pdf

Company
Industrial Shadeports, Inc.

Email
sales@shadeports.com

Contact
Industrial Shadeports

Address
6600 NW 12th Ave
Unit 220
Fort Laudardale, FL 33309

Phone
(954) 755-0661

Website
www.Shadeports.com

Submission Date
Sep 23, 2024 1:01 PM (Eastern Time)

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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 Non-Collusive_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.2. Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Sworn_Statement_on_Public_Entity_Crimes.pdf

 Sworn_Statement_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.3. Equal Benefits Certification Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Equal_Benefits_Certification_Form.pdf

 Equal_Benefits_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.4. Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Vendor_Drug-Free_Workplace_Certification_Form.pdf

 Drug_Free_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.5. Scrutinized Company Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Scrutinized_Company_Certification.pdf

 Scrutinized_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.6. E-Verify System Certification Statement*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  E-Verify_System_Certification_Statement.pdf

 E-Verify_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.7. Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB) Preference Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Veteran_Owned_Small_Business_(VOSB)_Preference_Certification.pdf

 Veteren_Owned_Industrials_Shadeports.pdf

3.8. Determination Letter from the United States Department of Veteran Affairs Center
If claiming Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification, business must attach the “Determination Letter” from the United States Department of Veteran Affairs 
Center for Verification and Evaluation notifying the business that they have been approved as a Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB).

No response submitted

3.9. Local Vendor Preference Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Local_Vendor_Preference_Certification.pdf

 Local_Vendor_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

3.10. Local Business Tax Receipts
 2024_Broward_Business_Tax_Receipt.pdf

 2023_Broward_Business_Tax_Receipt.pdf

3.11. Anti-Human Trafficking Affidavit*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

  Anti-Human_Trafficking_Affidavit.pdf

 Human_Trafficking_Industrial_Shadeports.pdf

4. Optional Documentation

4.1. Trade Secrets

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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a. The Proposer’s response to this solicitation is a public record pursuant to Florida law, which is subject to disclosure by the City under the State of Florida Public 
Records Law, Florida Statutes Chapter 119.07 (“Public Records Law”).  The City shall permit public access to all documents, papers, letters or other material 
submitted in connection with this solicitation and the Contract to be executed for this solicitation, subject to the provisions of Chapter 119.07 of the Florida Statutes.

b. Any language contained in the Proposer’s response to the solicitation purporting to require confidentiality of any portion of the Proposer’s response to the solicitation, 
except to the extent that certain information is in the City’s opinion a Trade Secret pursuant to Florida law, shall be void.  If a Proposer submits any documents or 
other information to the City which the Proposer claims is Trade Secret information and exempt from Florida Statutes Chapter 119.07 (“Public Records Laws”), the 
Proposer shall clearly designate that it is a Trade Secret and that it is asserting that the document or information is exempt.  The Proposer must specifically identify 
the exemption being claimed under Florida Statutes 119.07.  The City shall be the final arbiter of whether any information contained in the Proposer’s response to the 
solicitation constitutes a Trade Secret.

c. EXCEPT FOR CLEARLY MARKED PORTIONS THAT ARE BONA FIDE TRADE SECRETS PURSUANT TO FLORIDA LAW, DO NOT MARK YOUR RESPONSE TO 
THE SOLICITATION AS PROPRIETARY OR CONFIDENTIAL.  DO NOT MARK YOUR RESPONSE TO THE SOLICITATION OR ANY PART THEREOF AS 
COPYRIGHTED.  ALL DOCUMENTS THAT THE FIRM PURPORTS TO BE CONFIDENTIAL, PROPRIETARY OR A TRADE SECRET SHALL BE UPLOADED TO 
THE OPENGOV WEBSITE AS A SEPARATE ATTACHMENT, IN THIS SECTION, CLEARLY IDENTIFYING THE EXEMPTION BEING CLAIMED UNDER FLORIDA 
STATUTES 119.07.

d. The city’s determination of whether an exemption applies shall be final, and the proposer agrees to defend, indemnify, and hold harmless the city and the city’s 
officers, employees, and agent, against any loss or damages incurred by any person or entity as a result of the city’s treatment of records as public records. 

No response submitted

4.2. Financial Statements
a. The City is not requesting the vendor to submit any financial statements for this project and prefers if the vendor does not submit financial statements.  In addition, if 

the City needs a copy of the vendor’s financial statements, the City can contact the vendor after the bid due date to request those documents.  However, if the vendor 
does submit the financial statements, they should be uploaded in this section.

b. Any claim of confidentiality on financial statements must be asserted at the time of submittal.  The firm must identify the specific statute that authorizes the exemption 
from the Public Records Law.  Please note that the financial statement exemption provided for in Section 119.071(1)c, Florida Statutes only applies to submittals in 
response to a solicitation for a “public works” project.

No response submitted

4.3. Alternatives
a. If you are submitting an alternative product, please upload any related information in this section (such as specification sheets, etc.).
b. In addition, pursuant to Section 3.7 “Brand Names,” if and wherever in the specifications a brand name, make, name of manufacturer, trade name, or vendor 

catalog number is mentioned, it is for the purpose of establishing a grade or quality of material only.  Since the City does not wish to rule out other competition and 
equal brands or makes, the phrase “OR EQUAL” is added.  However, if a product other than that specified is bid, Proposers shall indicate on their proposal and 
clearly state the proposed substitution and deviation.  It is the vendor’s responsibility to provide any necessary documentation and samples within their bid submittal 
to prove that the product is equal to that specified.  Such samples are to be furnished before the date of bid opening, unless otherwise specified.  Additional evidence 
in the form of documentation and samples may be requested if the proposed brand is other than that specified.  The City retains the right to determine if the proposed 
brand shall be considered as an approved equivalent or not.

No response submitted

4.4. Additional Information
Please provide any additional information that you deem necessary to complete your proposal in this section, if it has not been requested in another section.

 Shadeports_Overview.pdf

 Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF

 City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf

4.5. Professional Licenses
No response submitted

5. Vendor Classification

5.1. Is your firm a Minority-Owned Business Enterprise (MBE)?*
No, not a Minority Business Enterprise

5.2. Is your firm a Woman-Owned Business Enterprise (WBE)?*
No

5.3. Is your firm a HubZone Business / Labor Surplus Area Firm?*
No

5.4. If you selected "yes" to any of the above questions, please provide current certificates from the agency(ies) that certified your vendor classification.
No response submitted

PRICE TABLES
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Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/e40f32ec-2246-4ed4-8088-c5c8d184397a_Shadeports_Overview.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=c47c05a705ace11960aa2fefeab6bb04628437f0c6d7dcc6eb77052e0514183f&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Shadeports_Overview.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/e5958672-6576-478a-8a12-221adba6f0af_Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=35b44fb24fc859a1ccbb06ca00ba9b49400bc22da1a1696611ee3290d926675f&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Cert_of_Ins_-_CITY_OF_PEMBROKE_PINES.PDF%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/219078/b4374d5a-96fc-4f51-b08c-b3cb5d2e3f70_City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4BTS3DHEW%2F20241001%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20241001T183326Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEEkaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQDTeCfzaJ%2FJO%2FOeLdYwIZbtIOLgBc4DPgBJtl61wW8ZLAIgax%2FpkV%2BYBI11rhXPQN%2FIUisnDrxssdQ1rrjDOZT2AegqjAUIkv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDIyNVH1MYyO7nnhq7yrgBNXB%2FHrfvvCOEERi7Ybg8MntLoaC%2F7lfVJiA5Le5kaNSXACphRKALdP2DZouPZCHOpSWoMU9cjBXAkR1vQ4SS%2FrcnYgwGcya8P9GC%2FyLP19IyPOSlnJH6Qowv4igbpdcGroWEgfACMPqqtnZw8W6X8UVUcxZTix4vresFNy06ZNWkI5ewdXqozfTTSecQV%2F1UpY2%2Bs4JvY%2BMGNWMsjO0b%2BFHuH0Vb71Mjg2SRCZT5NAb00dJnOzY1XNXdWw6k4q70raiWzPDrSbveWZ8%2FdriedXR5tu8QugcNDaOP1W1qLe%2FIEdeSxBv1eeP0kohU8b2ykDilOwOk5ut2Ef9ZSRd7lSQLnT4Sg%2FoXqYGGdmKkJwoS9cboKTaE4Kcj6jEVxXL4dAkbiyvlAkY6w0UUpFDtrcum8M2K9uDmXI%2Bk0xhhoZVeJluqgO519FJbxD7uQyVh2%2BLmTiWIQvcyeXsgThmZC1ajfQv3ZikxxiL0qmAtcJ1tzH6QWxBs2j435tPxHWhdZz%2F6hvst%2FRyxqgXwWvbcU51Z8LYKrJMA6HFkXZHMAHlJZsubDIVJ9OQa8czohQRY3CYq3vlDe2jwtW0tM4NhAE6AT0ONr9YVHCwVkf4IiaMG6KcIui6ZEvHXthnrdFrDwEqzEd%2BIF%2F2rjcgZXwZZAa3%2B2AAaoXyBb3JpCWbw1suh%2BRstH1GVtE%2BSjitA3C0DblkXgd9eVllfxardjNkfb5%2Btr5lEwosClqdFObYCeBW5S%2BQ3DuNXci7mgBIBkzZbL9wFg%2Bkf1NN09Gc07Ds4UMAm5Qw9kJrDAcHqA2v37k3MKnQ8LcGOpsBhlEOX%2B1SpNM0eEXx6rWKWPgCX%2FHBgtsDF%2Fup9WhIK74b1DBtEchvpbx4R1s8joxJMufg7YRP7N5rJgVVZh95KiEtZFVtd%2BEnkvERYlE8lXy8ZyfmD%2FmWKEN6soc7W6zWgbyNo%2FLBlpRErI9juxu8rgsW8pEopBTO1%2Bn0n8TKMoFxV0uhQOTPYp1YXR12FTu3olo%2B7TdAP8vFgvo%3D&X-Amz-Signature=e478e3c71960c96eb82243d1e32f708911c886962f4a243f1cbe466395ceb816&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22City_of_Pembroke_Pines_WC_2025.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject


Primary Responses

Additional Responses

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor N…

1. Maxwell Park 1 Lump sum $23,670.00 $23,670.00 Industrial
Shadeports

2. Josias Dog Park 1 Lump sum $29,842.00 $29,842.00 Industrial
Shadeports

Total $53,512.00

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total No Bid Vendor N…

1. Maxwell Park Lump sum  No
Additional

2. Josias Dog Park Lump sum  No
Additional

Total $0.00
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