
From: Granda-Paez, Byron
To: "Oscar"
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
Date: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 4:10:05 PM

Thank you Oscar. These 3 line items:
 
#0-17 Pentair 800 BTU AC unit APC-800-T15-110 20 $1,755.09 $35,101.80
#0-18 DDB Industries Inner insulation OD-INS 20 $114.18 $2,283.60
#0-19 DDB Industries Cover Plates ZP-NDCPP 40 $34.50 $1,380.00

 Are confirmed for you.
 
We plan on releasing the award the first commission meeting of September.
 
Regards,
 
Byron Granda Paez
City of Pembroke Pines
Procurement Department
8300 South Palm Drive, Pembroke Pines, FL 33025
(P): (954) 518-9025,  (F) : (954) 518-8902
(E): bgrandapaez@ppines.com          (W): www.ppines.com

 

From: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 2:38 PM
To: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Line Item #0-14 is also a no-go.   Please let me know if you have any questions.   Thanks.   Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO Broadcast Systems Office: (561)578-4964 http://www.broadcastsystems

Caution! This message was sent from outside your organization. Allow sender | Block sender
sophospsmartbannerend

Line Item #0-14 is also a no-go.
 
Please let me know if you have any questions.
 
Thanks.
 

Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO
Broadcast Systems
Office: (561)578-4964
http://www.broadcastsystemsinc.com
 
Main Office
290 SW 12th Avenue, Suite 1 | Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
 

From: Oscar 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 9:41 AM
To: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Thanks for your patience.  I am hoping to find out today.
 

Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO
Broadcast Systems
Office: (561)578-4964
http://www.broadcastsystemsinc.com
 
Main Office
290 SW 12th Avenue, Suite 1 | Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
 

From: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 9, 2022 6:54 PM
To: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Thank you Oscar. When do you think you will find out about line item #0-14?
 

From: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, August 09, 2022 5:36 PM
To: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Good afternoon Byron,   I wanted to at least get you an answer today.  We can confirm the below 3 items.   #0-17 Pentair 800 BTU AC unit APC-800-T15-110 20 $1,755.09 $35,101.80 #0-18 DD
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Good afternoon Byron,
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http://www.ppines.com/Index.aspx?NID=652
http://www.broadcastsystems/
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I wanted to at least get you an answer today.  We can confirm the below 3 items.
 
#0-17 Pentair 800 BTU AC unit APC-800-T15-110 20 $1,755.09 $35,101.80
#0-18 DDB Industries Inner insulation OD-INS 20 $114.18 $2,283.60
#0-19 DDB Industries Cover Plates ZP-NDCPP 40 $34.50 $1,380.00

 
Items #0-15 is a no-go and I am still awaiting confirmation for #0-14.
 

Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO
Broadcast Systems
Office: (561)578-4964
http://www.broadcastsystemsinc.com
 
Main Office
290 SW 12th Avenue, Suite 1 | Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
 

From: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 8, 2022 5:55 PM
To: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Hi Oscar,
 
Can you also verify if you provided a quote for the requested item for line item 14?
 

        Numeric Text  

# Item Part Number QTY Unit Price

Alternate make, model, specs,
etc.  *Only fill out on “Additional
Responses" Tab of the Excel

File.

Total Cost

#0-14 Cradlepoint AER2200 Mounting kit 170749-001 20 $28.00 n/a $560.00

 
Thanks,
 
Byron Granda Paez
City of Pembroke Pines
Procurement Department
8300 South Palm Drive, Pembroke Pines, FL 33025
(P): (954) 518-9025,  (F) : (954) 518-8902
(E): bgrandapaez@ppines.com          (W): www.ppines.com

 

From: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 08, 2022 4:35 PM
To: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: TS-22-05 Cameras
 
Byron,   If I don’t have a response before you leave today, I’ll send it this evening or in the morning…as soon as I get it.   Thanks.   Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO Broadcast Systems Offic
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Byron,
 
If I don’t have a response before you leave today, I’ll send it this evening or in the morning…as soon as I get it.
 
Thanks.
 

Oscar Nelson, CSCP, CPPO
Broadcast Systems
Office: (561)578-4964
http://www.broadcastsystemsinc.com
 
Main Office
290 SW 12th Avenue, Suite 1 | Pompano Beach, Florida 33069
 

From: Granda-Paez, Byron <bgrandapaez@ppines.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 8, 2022 10:11 AM
To: Oscar <oscar@broadcastsystemsinc.com>
Subject: TS-22-05 Cameras
Importance: High
 
Good morning Oscar,
 
Per our conversation last week, I followed up with our IT director and he said we cannot accept alternates for line items 10-12.
 

        Numeric Text  
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# Item Part Number QTY Unit Price

Alternate make, model, specs,
etc.  *Only fill out on “Additional
Responses" Tab of the Excel

File.

Total Cost

#0-10 Verkada Bullet Series CB51-E
Camera, 30 days

CB51-30E-
HW 20 1119.2 n/a $ 22,384.00

#0-11 Verkada Bullet Series CB51-
TE, 30 days

CB51-30TE-
HW 2 1199.2 n/a $ 2,398.40

#0-12 Verkada 3 Year License LIC-3Y 22 399 n/a $ 8,778.00

 
Can you please confirm you quoted us the requested items for the remaining items we intend to award you?
 
Vendor 2 ER Tech Systems Group, Inc.
Total
Award $72,975.80

# Items Part Number QTY
Unit
Price Total Cost

#0-15 Cradlepoint AER2200 Power adapter 170751-000 20 $32.50 $650.00
#0-17 Pentair 800 BTU AC unit APC-800-T15-110 20 $1,755.09 $35,101.80
#0-18 DDB Industries Inner insulation OD-INS 20 $114.18 $2,283.60
#0-19 DDB Industries Cover Plates ZP-NDCPP 40 $34.50 $1,380.00

 
Please confirm before COB today if possible.
 
Thanks,
 
Byron Granda Paez
City of Pembroke Pines
Procurement Department
8300 South Palm Drive, Pembroke Pines, FL 33025
(P): (954) 518-9025,  (F) : (954) 518-8902
(E): bgrandapaez@ppines.com          (W): www.ppines.com

 
The City of Pembroke Pines is a public entity subject to Chapter 119 of the Florida statutes concerning public records. Email messages are covered under Chapter 119
and are thus subject to public records disclosure. All email messages sent and received are captured by our server and retained as public records.
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