
Primary Responses Sandoval Custom Creations

Numeric Text

Bid/No Bid 
Decision

# Item Part Number QTY Unit Price

Alternate make, 
model, specs, 
etc.  *Only fill 

out on 
“Additional 

Responses" Tab 
of the Excel File.

Total Cost

Bid #0-1 Axis Camera P1455-LE 24 519 N/A $ 12,456.00 

Bid #0-2 Axis Camera Q1798-LE 8 1337 N/A $ 10,696.00 

Bid #0-3 Axis Camera Q3819-PVE 180° 30 1485 N/A $ 44,550.00 

Bid #0-4 Axis Camera Q6100-E 2 1118 N/A $ 2,236.00 

Bid #0-5 Axis Camera Q6315-LE PTZ 9 2228 N/A $ 20,052.00 

Bid #0-6 Axis Camera M2036-LE MK II 38 296 N/A $ 11,248.00 

Bid #0-7 Axis Camera P3719-PLE 360° 9 1188 N/A $ 10,692.00 

Bid #0-8 Axis Camera D2110-VE Radar 6 1114 N/A $ 6,684.00 

Bid #0-9 Axis Camera A8207-VE MK II 7 1114 N/A $ 7,798.00 

No Bid #0-10 Verkada Bullet Series CB51-E Camera, 30 days CB51-30E-HW 20 -

No Bid #0-11 Verkada Bullet Series CB51-TE, 30 days CB51-30TE-HW 2 -

No Bid #0-12 Verkada 3 Year License LIC-3Y 22 -

Bid #0-13 Cradlepoint AER2200 Branch Router
BA3-2200120B-

NNN
20 1448 N/A $ 28,960.00 

No Bid #0-14 Cradlepoint AER2200 Mounting kit 170749-001 20 -

Bid #0-15 Cradlepoint AER2200 Power adapter 170751-000 20 118 N/A $ 2,360.00 

No Bid #0-16 DDB Industries 7RU outdoor NEMA 4 Cabinet WOD-16DXC 20 -

No Bid #0-17 Pentair 800 BTU AC unit
APC-800-T15-

110
20 -

No Bid #0-18 DDB Industries Inner insulation OD-INS 20 -

No Bid #0-19 DDB Industries Cover Plates ZP-NDCPP 40 -



Additional Responses Sandoval Custom Creations

Numeric Text

# Item Part Number QTY Unit Price

Alternate make, 
model, specs, 
etc.  *Only fill 

out on 
“Additional 

Responses" Tab 
of the Excel File.

Total Cost
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Question Set 1: Contact Information Form

# Question Response Comment

1.1.1 Company Name
Sandoval Custom Creations, 

Inc.

1.1.2 Company Address
605 County Line Rd. Unit A 

Palmer Lake, CO 80133

1.2.1 Contact Name Shaun Sandoval

1.2.2 Contact Title CEO

1.2.3 Contact E-mail Address shaun@sccicovert.com

1.2.4 Contact Telephone Number 303-918-3878

1.3.1 Contact Name Sara Swaney

1.3.2 Contact Title VP of Finance

1.3.3 Contact E-mail Address sara@sccicovert.com

1.3.4 Contact Telephone Number 303-956-9972

Company Information

Primary Contact for the Project

Authorized Approver

10 Questions 100.00% Complete



Question Set 2: Proposer's Background Information
Question Set 2 Instructions

# Question Response Comment

2.1.1
Under what former name has your business operated?  Include a description of 
the business.

Sandoval Custom Homes, Inc.

2.1.2 At what address was that business located?
2094 Quartz Mountain Dr. 

Larkspur, CO 80118

2.2.1
Have you ever failed to complete work awarded to you.  If so, when, where and 
why?

No

2.3.1
Have you personally inspected the proposed WORK and do you have a 
complete plan for its performance?

No

2.4.1

Will you subcontract any part of this WORK?  If you will be subcontracting any 
part of this work, provide details including a list of each sub-contractor(s) that 
will perform work in excess of ten percent (10%) of the contract amount and the 
work that will be performed by each subcontractor(s).  (Note: The proposed list 
of subcontractor(s) may not be amended after award of the contract without the 
prior written approval of the Contract Administrator, whose approval shall not be 
reasonably withheld.)

No

2.5.1

List and describe all bankruptcy petitions (voluntary or involuntary) which have 
been filed by or against the Proposer, its parent or subsidiaries or predecessor 
organizations during the past five (5) years.  Include in the description the 
disposition of each such petition.

N/A

2.6.1
List and describe all successful Bond claims made to your surety(ies) during the 
last five (5) years.  The list and descriptions should include claims against the 
bond of the Proposer and its predecessor organization(s).

N/A

2.7.1

List all claims, arbitrations, administrative hearings and lawsuits brought by or 
against the Proposer or its predecessor organizations(s) during the last (10) 
years.  The list shall include all case names; case, arbitration or hearing 
identification numbers; the name of the project over which the dispute arose; 
and a description of the subject matter of the dispute.

N/A

2.8.1
List and describe all criminal proceedings or hearings concerning business 
related offenses in which the Proposer, its principals or officers or predecessor 
organization(s) were defendants.

N/A

2.9.1
In regards to the commodities/services proposed, which of the following best 
classifies your firm?  If you selected any options besides "Original Provider" 
please explain.

Distributor We are a reseller of the products listed on the bid.

2.10.1
Have you ever been debarred or suspended from doing business with any 
governmental agency?  If you have been debarred or suspended from doing 
business with any governmental agency, please explain.

No

2.11.1
Describe the firm’s local experience/nature of service with contracts of similar 
size and complexity, in the previous three (3) years.

More than sufficient 
experience

We have sold approximately $6 million worth of similar equipment over the last 
3 years. 

The PROPOSER acknowledges and understands that the information contained in response to this Qualification Statement shall be relied upon by CITY in awarding the contract and such information is 
warranted by PROPOSER to be true. The discovery of any omission or misstatement that materially affects the PROPOSER’s qualifications to perform under the contract may cause the CITY to reject the Bid, 
and if after the award, to cancel and terminate the award and/or contract.

Former Business

Past Failure

Inspected

Subcontracting

Debarment/Suspension

Similar Experience & Contracts

12 Questions 100.00% Complete

Bankruptcy Petitions

Bond Claims

Claims, Arbitrations, Administrative Hearings and Lawsuits

Criminal Proceedings or Hearings

Company Classification



Question Set 3: Vendor Registration Checklist
Question Set 3 Instructions

# Question Response Comment

3.1.1
Did you submit a completed Vendor Information Form in the Vendor Registration 
Portal?

No I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.2.1
Did you submit a W-9 Form (Revised October 2018 or later) in the Vendor 
Registration Portal?

No I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.3.1 Did you submit your Company Profile Form in the Vendor Registration Portal? No I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.4.1
Which option did you select on the Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes 
Form?

A) Not Charged / Convicted I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.5.1

Which option did you select on the Veteran Owned Small Business Preference 
Certification?  Note - If certifying that your business is a  Veteran Owned Small 
Business, you must also attach a “Determination Letter” from the U.S. Dept. of 
Veteran Affairs Center

Not a Veteran Owned Small 
Business

I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.6.1 Which option did you select on the Equal Benefits Certification Form? Other - Not Listed Above I did not see this within the bid documentation.

3.7.1
Which option did you select on the Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification 
Form?

Complies Fully I did not see this within the bid documentation.  We are a drug-free workplace. 

3.8.1
Did you submit a completed E-Verify System Certification Statement in the 
Vendor Registration Portal?

No I did not see this within the bid documentation. 

3.9.1
Did you submit your Local Business Tax Receipts in the Vendor Registration 
Portal?

No I did not see this within the bid documentation. 

3.10.1
Did you submit a completed Scrutinized Company Certification in the Vendor 
Registration Portal?

No I did not see thiis within the bid documentation. 

3.11.1

Did you submit a completed "Certification Regarding Lobbying; Debarment, 
Suspension and Other Responsibility Matters for Expenditure of Federal Funds" 
in the Vendor Registration Portal?

Lobbying: As required by 7 CFR Part 3018, for persons entering into a contract, 
grant or cooperative agreement over $100,000 involving the expenditure of 
Federal funds, the Contractor must complete the Certification Regarding 
Lobbying.

Debarment, Suspension and Other Responsibility Matters: Where the Contractor 
is unable to certify to any of the statements in the certification for Debarment, 
Suspension and Other Responsibility Matters, he or she shall provide an 
explanation.

Did not complete Certifications I did not see this within the bid documentation. 

The City has included various documents in the Vendor Registration portal on the Bonfire website.  This process is intended to make the bidding process easier for vendors that bid on multiple City projects.  This 
process will allow vendors to complete and submit the following standard forms and documents at any time prior to bidding on a project. In addition, the vendors will be able to utilize these same forms without the 
need to re-fill and re-submit the forms each time they bid on a City project. In the event that the City does not have one of the forms or documents listed below for your company, the City may reach out to your 
company after the bid has closed to obtain the document(s).

Furthermore, please make sure to update this information on an as-needed basis so that all pertinent information is accurate, such as local business tax receipts, and any other relevant information.  

This section will summarize your responses to those relevant documents.

Vendor Information Form

Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018 or later)

Company Profile

Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form

Scrutinized Company Certification

Federal Projects

Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Equal Benefits Certification Form

Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

E-Verify System Certification Statement

Local Business Tax Receipts



3.11.2

Did you submit a completed "Standard Form - LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report 
Lobbying" in the Vendor Registration Portal?

Note - If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will 
be paid to any person for influencing or attempting to influence an officer or 
employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of 
Congress or an employee of a Member of Congress, in connection with this 
Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the Contractor shall also 
complete and submit the Standard Form - LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report 
Lobbying,” in accordance with its instructions.

No

3.11.3

Are you a Minority Owned Business Enterprise, Woman-Owned Business 
Enterprise or HUBZone-Certified Small Businesses / Labor Surplus Area Firms?  
If so, did you select the appropriate MBE Classification(s) and submit your MBE 
Certificate(s) in the Vendor Registration Portal?

Yes Pikes Peak Enterprise Zone

13 Questions 100.00% Complete



City of Pembroke Pines 

NON-COLLUSIVE AFFIDAVIT

BIDDER is the 
__________________________________________________________________________,

(Owner, Partner, Officer, Representative or Agent) 

BIDDER is fully informed respecting the preparation and contents of the attached Bid and of all
pertinent circumstances respecting such Bid; 

Such Bid is genuine and is not a collusive or sham Bid; 

Neither the said BIDDER nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents, representative, 
employees or parties in interest, including this affidavit, have in any way colluded, conspired, 
connived or agreed, directly or indirectly, with any other BIDDER, firm or person to submit 
a collusive or sham Bid in connection with the Contract for which the attached Bid has been 
submitted; or to refrain from bidding in connection with such Contract; or have in any 
manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion, or communications, or 
conference with any BIDDER, firm, or person to fix the price or prices in the attached Bid or 
any other BIDDER, or to fix any overhead, profit, or cost element of the Bid Price or the Bid 
Price of any other BIDDER, or to secure through any collusion conspiracy, connivance, or 
unlawful agreement any advantage against (Recipient), or any person interested in the 
proposed Contract; 

The price of items quoted in the attached Bid are fair and proper and are not tainted by collusion, 
conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement on the part of the BIDDER or any other of its 
agents, representatives, owners, employees or parties in interest, including this affidavit. 

Printed Name/Signature _______________________________ 

Title _______________________________ 

  Name of Company _______________________________ 

Owner

Shaun Sandoval 
CEO

Digitally signed by Shaun 
Sandoval CEO 
Date: 2022.06.14 09:34:59 -06'00'

CEO
Sandoval Custom Creations, Inc.



(OFFICE USE ONLY) Vendor # ____________ 

 

City of Pembroke Pines 

VENDOR INFORMATION FORM 
 

The City of Pembroke Pines is currently implementing an enhanced Citywide Enterprise Resource Planning 
(ERP) system with the goal of updating our processes and improving customer service.  Part of the new 
Tyler Technologies Munis ERP system will include a vendor management module.  In addition, this new 
system will include a Vendor Self Service (VSS) web portal which will allow vendors to update their 
necessary information and documents on an as-needed basis.  The City intends for this system to allow for 
vendors to view their Purchase Orders, Invoices, Checks and other beneficial information in real-time.   
Using VSS, vendors will also be able to enter and maintain their contact and remittance information, 
discount and payment terms, designated contact persons, and the commodity codes that represent the 
goods and services the vendor can provide.   
 
While we work towards go-live with the new VSS web portal, we are requesting for vendors to complete the 
attached Vendor Registration Packet and submit it to accountspayable@ppines.com to help facilitate the 
implementation process. 
 

MAIN CONTACT INFORMATION 
Company Name  
(Legal Name as filed with IRS) 

 

Doing Business As (DBA)  
Primary Business Address  

 
 
City:  
State:  Zip:  
Country:  

Remit To Address  
 
 
City:  
State:  Zip:  
Country:  

Order From Address  
 
 
City:  
State:  Zip:  
Country:  

Foreign Entity (Yes/No)  
Telephone Number  
Primary Company E-mail  
Fax  
Website  
DUNS  
Independent Contractor (Yes/No)  
Identification Number SSN:  FID:  

 

GENERAL PAYMENT TERMS 
Discount Percent 

Defines the discount percentage the 
vendor extends to your organization. 

Days to Discount 
Number of days which payment must be 
received to claim the discount percent. 

Days to Net 
Number of days that the vendor allows 

before requiring net payment. 
   

 



(OFFICE USE ONLY) Vendor # ____________ 

 

City of Pembroke Pines 

CONTACT # 1 
Contact Name (First & Last Name)  
Description/Title/Position  
Phone (Voice)  
Phone (Text)  Opt In (Y/N):  
Fax  
E-mail  

 

CONTACT # 2 
Contact Name (First & Last Name)  
Description/Title/Position  
Phone (Voice)  
Phone (Text)  Opt In (Y/N):  
Fax  
E-mail  

 

CONTACT # 3 
Contact Name (First & Last Name)  
Description/Title/Position  
Phone (Voice)  
Phone (Text)  Opt In (Y/N):  
Fax  
E-mail  

 

MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE 
MBE Classifications Yes Certifying Agency Expiration 

African American    
Asian American    
Disadvantage Business    
Hispanic American    
HubZone / Labor Surplus Area    
Minority Owned Business    
Native American    
Small Business Enterprise    
Veteran Owned Small Business    
Woman Owned Business    

If you selected “Yes” to any of the above items, please attach proof of certification. 
 

GEOGRAPHIC PREFERENCE 
Local Broward County Vendor  
Local Pembroke Pines Vendor  
Not a Local Broward County of Pembroke Pines Vendor  

Please read and complete the attached “Local Vendor Preference Certification” Form and select 
the applicable option above. 

 

STATE REGISTRATION 
Is your company registered with the State of Florida? (Y/N)  
     If not, what state is your company registered in?  

Please attach the print out from https://dos.myflorida.com/sunbiz/ or the appropriate state 
showing your active registration and any applicable fictitious names that are registered. 



SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

x

605 County Line Road  Unit A

Palmer Lake, CO  80133

8   4        1   5    4  3   6    9   6

1-3-2022



(OFFICE USE ONLY) Vendor # ____________ City of Pembroke Pines 

COMPANY PROFILE FORM 

Please provide the following information so that the City could better get to know your company’s 
background. 

MAIN CONTACT INFORMATION 
Company Name  
(Legal Name as filed with IRS) 
Doing Business As (DBA) 
Primary Business Address 

City:
State: Zip: 
Country:  

Organization Background 
Please state the year that you company started its 
business 
Please state the year that your company started 
providing service under your current business name 
What State is your Company Registered In? 

Please attach any applicable organization registration documents. 

Professional License Information 
License Type License Number Expiration 

Please list and attach any applicable professional licenses required to perform the services your 
company offers. 

Please Provide a Summary of your Company and What Services you provide 

Please select the appropriate Commodity Codes that your company provides, this will help City 
Departments find vendors that can provide services in which the City is looking to Procure. 



    
City of Pembroke Pines 

SWORN STATEMENT 

ON PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES 
UNDER FLORIDA STATUTES CHAPTER 287.133(3)(a). 

1. This sworn statement is submitted ____________________________________________ 
(name of entity submitting sworn statement) whose business address is 
________________________________________________________________________
and (if applicable) its Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) is 
___________________________. (If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security 
Number of the individual signing this sworn statement: __________________________.) 

2. My name is                                                                                                                and my 
(Please print name of individual signing)

relationship to the entity named above is                                                                             . 

3. I understand that a "public entity crime" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(g), Florida 
Statutes, means a violation of any state or federal law by a person with respect to and 
directly related to the transaction of business with any public entity or with an agency or 
political subdivision of any other state or with the United States, including, but not 
limited to, any bid, proposal, reply, or contract for goods or services, any lease for real 
property, or any contract for the construction or repair of a public building or public 
work, involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or 
material misrepresentation. 

4. I understand that a "convicted" or "conviction" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), 
Florida Statutes, means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity crime, with or 
without an adjudication of guilt, in any federal or state trial court of record relating to 
charges brought by indictment or information after July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury 
verdict, nonjury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere. 

5. I understand that an "affiliate" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(a), Florida Statutes, 
means: 

1. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime: or 

2. An entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management 
of the entity and who has been convicted of a public entity crime.  The term 
"affiliate" includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, 
employees, members, and agents who are active in the management of an 
affiliate.  The Cityship by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest 
in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among persons when not 
for fair market value under an arm's length agreement, shall be a prima facie case 
that one person controls another person.  A person who knowingly enters into a 

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

605 COUNTY LINE RD, UNIT A PALMER LAKE, CO 80133

84-1543696

SHAUN SANDOVAL

OWNER & CEO



    
City of Pembroke Pines 

joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in 
Florida during the preceding 36 months shall be considered an affiliate. 

6. I understand that a "person" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(e), Florida Statutes, 
means any natural person or any entity organized under the laws of any state or of the 
United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract and which bids or 
applies to bid on contracts let by a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies 
to transact business with a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies to 
transact business with a public entity.  The term "person" includes those officers, 
directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are 
active in management of an entity. 

7. Based on information and belief, the statement which I have marked below is true in 
relation to the entity submitting this sworn statement.  (Please indicate which statement 
applies.)

 A) Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers, directors, 
executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are active in 
management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity have been charged with and 
convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989. 

 B) The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of the officers, 
directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are 
active in management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with and 
convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989, AND (Please indicate 
which additional statement applies.)

 B1) There has been a proceeding concerning the conviction before a hearing 
officer of the State of Florida, Division of Administrative Hearings.  The final 
order entered by the hearing officer did not place the person or affiliate on the 
convicted vendor list. (Please attach a copy of the final order.)

 B2) The person or affiliate was placed on the convicted vendor list.  There has 
been a subsequent proceeding before a hearing officer of the State of Florida, 
Division of Administrative Hearings. The final order entered by the hearing 
officer determined that it was in the public interest to remove the person or 
affiliate from the convicted vendor list. (Please attach a copy of the final 
order.)

 B3) The person or affiliate has not been placed on the convicted vendor list.  
(Please describe any action taken by or pending with the Department of 
General Services.) 

_________________________           _______________________          __________________ 
Bidder’s Name/Signature                     Company                        Date  

✔

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC. 06/16/2022



City of Pembroke Pines 

EQUAL BENEFITS CERTIFICATION FORM  
FOR DOMESTIC PARTNERS AND ALL MARRIED COUPLES  

Except where federal or state law mandates to the contrary, a Contractor awarded a Contract 
pursuant to a competitive solicitation shall provide benefits to Domestic Partners and spouses of 
its employees, irrespective of gender, on the same basis as it provides benefits to employees' 
spouses in traditional marriages. 

The Contractor shall provide the City and/or the City Manager or his/her designee, access to its 
records for the purpose of audits and/or investigations to ascertain compliance with the provisions 
of this section, and upon request shall provide evidence that the Contractor is in compliance with 
the provisions of this section upon each new bid, contract renewal, or when the City Manager has 
received a complaint or has reason to believe the Contractor may not be in compliance with the 
provisions of this section.  Records shall include but not be limited to providing the City and/or the 
City Manager or his/her designee with certified copies of the Contractor’s records pertaining to its 
benefits policies and its employment policies and practices. 

The Contractor must conspicuously make available to all employees and applicants for 
employment the following statement: 

“During the performance of a contract with the City of Pembroke Pines, 
Florida, the Contractor will provide Equal Benefits to its employees with 
spouses, as defined by Section 35.39 of the City’s Code of Ordinances, and 
its employees with Domestic Partners and all Married Couples”. 

The posted statement must also include a City contact telephone number and email address 
which will be provided to each contractor when a covered contract is executed. 

SECTION 1 DEFINITIONS 

1. Benefits means the following plan, program or policy provided or offered by a contractor 
to its employees as part of the employer’s total compensation package which may include 
but is not limited to sick leave, bereavement leave, family medical leave, and health 
benefits. 

2. Cash Equivalent mean the amount of money paid to an employee with a domestic partner 
or spouse in lieu of providing benefits to the employee’s domestic partner or spouse.  The 
cash equivalent is equal to the employer’s direct expense of providing benefits to an 
employee for his or her spouse from a traditional marriage. 

3. Covered Contract means a contract between the City and a contractor awarded 
subsequent to the date when this section becomes effective valued at over $25,000 or the 
threshold amount required for competitive bids as required in section 35.18(A) of the 
Procurement Code. 

4. Domestic Partner shall mean any two (2) adults of the same or different sex who have 
registered as domestic partners with a governmental body pursuant to state or local law 
authorizing such registration, or with an internal registry maintained by the employer of at 



City of Pembroke Pines 

least one of the domestic partners.  A contractor may institute an internal registry to allow 
for the provision of equal benefits to employees with domestic partners who do not register 
their partnerships pursuant to a governmental body authorizing such registration, or who 
are located in a jurisdiction where no such governmental domestic partnership registry 
exists.  A contractor that institutes such registry shall not impose criteria for registration 
that are more stringent than those required for domestic partnership registration by the 
City of Pembroke Pines. 

5. Equal benefits means the equality of benefits between employees with spouses and/or 
dependents of spouses and employees with domestic partners and/or dependents of 
domestic partners, and/or between spouses of employees and/or dependents of spouses 
and domestic partners of employees and/or dependents of domestic partners. 

6. Spouse means one member of a married pair legally married under the laws of any state 
within the United States of America or any other jurisdiction under which such marriage is 
legally recognized, irrespective of gender.    

7. Traditional marriage means a marriage between one man and one woman. 

SECTION 2 CERTIFICATION OF CONTRACTOR  
The firm providing a response, by virtue of the signature below, certifies that it is aware of the 
requirements of Section 35.39 “City Contractors providing Equal Benefits for Domestic Partners 
and all Married Couples” of the City’s Code of Ordinances, and certifies the following (Check only 
one box below):

A. Contractor currently complies with the requirements of this section; or 

B. Contractor will comply with the conditions of this section at the time of contract award; or 

C. Contractor will not comply with the conditions of this section at the time of contract award: 
or

D. Contractor does not comply with the conditions of this section because of the following 
allowable exemption (Check only one box below):

1.  The Contractor does not provide benefits to employees' spouses in traditional 
marriages;

2. The Contractor provides an employee the cash equivalent of benefits because the 
Contractor is unable to provide benefits to employees' Domestic Partners or spouses 
despite making reasonable efforts to provide them. To meet this exception, the Contractor 
shall provide a notarized affidavit that it has made reasonable efforts to provide such 
benefits. The affidavit shall state the efforts taken to provide such benefits and the amount 
of the cash equivalent. Cash equivalent means the amount of money paid to an employee 
with a Domestic Partner or spouse rather than providing benefits to the employee's 
Domestic Partner or spouse. The cash equivalent is equal to the employer's direct 
expense of providing benefits to an employee's spouse; 

✔



City of Pembroke Pines 

3. The Contractor is a religious organization, association, society, or any non-profit 
charitable or educational institution or organization operated supervised or controlled by 
or in conjunction with a religious organization, association, or society; 

4.  The Contractor is a governmental agency; 

The certification shall be signed by an authorized officer of the Contractor. Failure to 
provide such certification (by checking the appropriate boxes above along with completing 
the information below) shall result in a Contractor being deemed non-responsive. 

COMPANY NAME: ____________________________________________________________ 

AUTHORIZED OFFICER NAME / SIGNATURE:  ____________________________________ 

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

Sara Swaney Digitally signed by Sara Swaney 
Date: 2022.06.16 11:03:56 -06'00'



    
City of Pembroke Pines 

VENDOR DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE CERTIFICATION FORM 

SECTION 1 GENERAL TERM 
Preference may be given to vendors submitting a certification with their bid/proposal certifying they have 
a drug-free workplace in accordance with Section 287.087, Florida Statutes. This requirement affects all 
public entities of the State and becomes effective January 1, 1991. The special condition is as follows: 

IDENTICAL TIE BIDS - Preference may be given to businesses with drug-free workplace programs. 
Whenever two or more bids that are equal with respect to price, quality, and service are received by the 
State or by any political subdivision for the procurement of commodities or contractual services, a bid 
received from a business that certifies that it has implemented a drugfree workplace program shall be 
given preference in the award process. Established procedures for processing tie bids will be followed if 
none of the tied vendors have a drug-free workplace program. In order to have a drug-free workplace 
program, a business shall: 

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, 
possession, or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the 
actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition. 

2.  Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business’s policy of 
maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee 
assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse 
violations.

3.  Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under 
bid a copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).

4.  In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working 
on the commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the 
terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo 
contendere to, any violation of chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United 
States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after each 
conviction.

5.  Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or 
rehabilitation program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is 
so convicted. 

6.  Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation 
of this section.  

SECTION 2 AFFIRMATION 

  Place a check mark here only if affirming bidder complies fully with the above requirements for a Drug-Free 
Workplace.   

  Place a check mark here only if affirming bidder does not meet the requirements for a Drug-Free Workplace. 

Failure to complete this certification at this time (by checking either of the boxes above) shall render the vendor 
ineligible for Drug-Free Workplace Preference. This form must be completed by/for the proposer; the proposer 
WILL NOT qualify for Drug-Free Workplace Preference based on their sub-contractors’ qualifications.

__________________________ ______________________  __________________ 
Authorized Signature   Authorized Signer Name  Company Name 

✔

Sara Swaney
Digitally signed by Sara 
Swaney
Date: 2022.06.16 11:06:29 
-06'00'

SARA SWANEY SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.



City of Pembroke Pines 

SCRUTINIZED COMPANY CERTIFICATION 
PURSUANT TO FLORIDA STATUTE § 287.135. 

I, _________________________________, on behalf of ________________________________,  
           Print Name and Title            Company Name 

certify that ___________________________________________________________________: 
                 Company Name 

1. Does not participate in a boycott of Israel; and
2. Is not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel list; and
3. Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List; and  
4. Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy 

Sector List; and
5. Has not engaged in business operations in Syria. 

Submitting a false certification shall be deemed a material breach of contract. The City shall 
provide notice, in writing, to the Contractor of the City’s determination concerning the false 
certification. The Contractor shall have ninety (90) days following receipt of the notice to respond 
in writing and demonstrate that the determination of false certification was made in error. If the 
Contractor does not demonstrate that the City’s determination of false certification was made in 
error then the City shall have the right to terminate the contract and seek civil remedies pursuant 
to Florida Statute § 287.135. 

Section 287.135, Florida Statutes, prohibits the City from: 1) Contracting with companies for 
goods or services in any amount if at the time of bidding on, submitting a proposal for, or entering 
into or renewing a contract if the company is on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel 
List, created pursuant to Section 215.4725, F.S. or is engaged in a boycott of Israel; and 2) 
Contracting with companies, for goods or services over $1,000,000.00 that are on either the 
Scrutinized Companies with activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector list, created pursuant 
to s. 215.473, or are engaged in business operations in Syria. 

As the person authorized to sign on behalf of the Contractor, I hereby certify that the company 
identified above in the section entitled “Contractor Name” does not participate in any boycott of 
Israel, is not listed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, is not listed on either the 
Scrutinized Companies with activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, and is not engaged 
in business operations in Syria. I understand that pursuant to section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the 
submission of a false certification may subject the company to civil penalties, attorney's fees, 
and/or costs. I further understand that any contract with the City for goods or services may be 
terminated at the option of the City if the company is found to have submitted a false certification 
or has been placed on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan list or the Scrutinized 
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List. 

_________________________        _______________________          __________________ 
Company Name                                Print Name / Signature                    Title                   

eum Energy Sector List

SARA SWANEY, VP OF FINANCE SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC. SARA SWANEY VP OF FINANCE



 

       

City of Pembroke Pines 

E-VERIFY SYSTEM CERTIFICATION STATEMENT 
(UNDER SECTION 448.095, FLORIDA STATUTES) 

 
1. Definitions: 

a. “Contractor” means a person or entity that has entered or is attempting to enter into a contract with 
a public employer to provide labor, supplies, or services to such employer in exchange for salary, 
wages, or other remuneration. “Contractor” includes, but is not limited to, a vendor or consultant. 

b. “Subcontractor” means a person or entity that provides labor, supplies, or services to or for a 
contractor or another subcontractor in exchange for salary, wages, or other remuneration. 

c. “E-Verify system” means an Internet-based system operated by the United States Department of 
Homeland Security that allows participating employers to electronically verify the employment 
eligibility of newly hired employees. 
 

2. Effective January 1, 2021, Contractors, shall register with and use the E-verify system in order to verify 
the work authorization status of all newly hired employees. Contractor shall register for and utilize the U.S. 
Department of Homeland Security’s E-Verify System to verify the employment eligibility of: 

a. All persons employed by a Contractor to perform employment duties within Florida during the term 
of the contract; and  

b. All persons (including subvendors/subconsultants/subcontractors) assigned by Contractor to 
perform work pursuant to the contract with the City of Pembroke Pines. The Contractor 
acknowledges and agrees that registration and use of the U.S. Department of Homeland Security’s 
E-Verify System during the term of the contract is a condition of the contract with the City of 
Pembroke Pines; and 

c. Should vendor become the successful Contractor awarded for the above-named project, by entering 
into the contract, the Contractor shall comply with the provisions of Section 448.095, Fla. Stat., 
“Employment Eligibility,” as amended from time to time. This includes, but is not limited to 
registration and utilization of the E-Verify System to verify the work authorization status of all 
newly hired employees. Contractor shall also require all subcontractors to provide an affidavit 
attesting that the subcontractor does not employ, contract with, or subcontract with, an unauthorized 
alien. The Contractor shall maintain a copy of such affidavit for the duration of the contract.   
 

3. Contract Termination 
a. If the City has a good faith belief that a person or entity with which it is contracting has knowingly 

violated s. 448.09 (1) Fla. Stat., the contract shall be terminated.  
b. If the City has a good faith belief that a subcontractor knowingly violated s. 448.095 (2), but the 

Contractor otherwise complied with s. 448.095 (2) Fla. Stat., shall promptly notify the Contractor 
and order the Contractor to immediately terminate the contract with the subcontractor. 

c. A contract terminated under subparagraph a) or b) is not a breach of contract and may not be 
considered as such. 

d. Any challenge to termination under this provision must be filed in the Circuit Court no later than 
20 calendar days after the date of termination.  

e. If the contract is terminated for a violation of the statute by the Contractor, the Contractor may not 
be awarded a public contract for a period of 1 year after the date of termination. 

 
COMPANY NAME: _____________________________________________________________________________ 

 
PRINTED NAME / AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:  ______________________________________________________ 

Shaun
Stamp



City of Pembroke Pines 

VETERAN OWNED SMALL BUSINESS (VOSB) PREFERENCE CERTIFICATION 

SECTION 1 GENERAL TERM 

VETERAN OWNED SMALL BUSINESS (VOSB) PREFEREENCE 
The evaluation of competitive bids is subject to section 35.37 of the City’s Procurement Procedures which, except 
where contrary to federal and state law, or any other funding source requirements, provides that preference be given 
to veteran owned small businesses. To satisfy this requirement, the vendor shall affirm in writing its compliance with 
the following objective criteria as of the bid or proposal submission date stated in the solicitation.   A veteran owned 
small business shall be defined as: 

1. "Veteran Owned Small Business" shall mean a business entity which has received a “Determination Letter” from 
the United States Department of Veteran Affairs Center for Verification and Evaluation notifying the business 
that they have been approved as a Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB). 

A preference of two and a half percent (2.5%) of the total evaluation point, or two and a half percent (2.5%) of the total 
price, shall be given to the Veteran Owned Small Business (VOSB).  This shall mean that if a VOSB submits a 
bid/quote that is within 2.5% of the lowest price submitted by any vendor, the VOSB shall have an option to submit 
another bid which is at least 1% lower than the lowest responsive bid/quote. If the VOSB submits a bid which is at least 
1% lower than that lowest responsive bid/quote, then the award will go to the VOSB.  If not, the award will be made to 
the vendor that submits the lowest responsive bid/quote. If the lowest responsive and responsible bidder IS a "Local 
Pembroke Pines Vendor" (LPPV) or a “Local Broward County Vendor” (LBCV) as established in Section 35.36 of 
the City’s Code of Ordinances, entitled “Local Vendor Preference”, then the award will be made to that vendor and no 
other bidders will be given an opportunity to submit additional bids as described herein.  

If there is a LPPV, a LBCV, and a VOSB participating in the same bid solicitation and all three vendors qualify to submit 
a second bid, the LPPV will be given first option. If the LPPV cannot beat the lowest bid received by at least 1%, an 
opportunity will be given to the LBCV. If the LBCV cannot beat the lowest bid by at least 1%, an opportunity will be 
given to the VOSB. If the VOSB cannot beat the lowest bid by at least 1%, then the bid will be awarded to the lowest 
bidder.  

If multiple VOSBs submit bids/quotes which are within 2.5% of the lowest bid/quote and there are no LPPV or LBCV
as described in Section 35.36 of the City’s Code of Ordinance, entitled “Local Vendor Preference”, then all VOSBs will 
be asked to submit a Best and Final Offer (BAFO). The award will be made to the VOSB submitting the lowest BAFO 
providing that that BAFO is at least 1% lower than the lowest bid/quote received in the original solicitation. If no VOSB
can beat the lowest bid/quote by at least 1%, then the award will be made to the lowest responsive bidder. 

COMPARISON OF QUALIFICATIONS 
The preferences established in no way prohibit the right of the City to compare quality of supplies or services for 
purchase and to compare qualifications, character, responsibility and fitness of all persons, firms or corporations 
submitting bids or proposals. Further, the preference established in no way prohibit the right of the city from giving any 
other preference permitted by law instead of the preferences granted, nor prohibit the city to select the bid or proposal 
which is the most responsible and  in the best interests of the city. 

SECTION 2 AFFIRMATION 

VETERAN OWNED SMALL BUSINESS (VOSB) PREFEREENCE CERTIFICATION: 

  Place a check mark here only if affirming bidder meets requirements above as a Veteran Owned Small Business.   
In addition, the bidder must attach the “Determination Letter” from the U.S. Dept. of Veteran Affairs Center. 

  Place a check mark here only if affirming bidder does not meet the requirements above as a VOSB. 

Failure to complete this certification at this time (by checking either of the boxes above) shall render the vendor 
ineligible for VOSB Preference. This form must be completed by/for the proposer; the proposer WILL NOT 
qualify for VOSB Preference based on their sub-contractors’ qualifications.

COMPANY NAME: _____________________________________________________________________________ 

PRINTED NAME / AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:  ______________________________________________________ 

✔

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

Sara Swaney Digitally signed by Sara Swaney 
Date: 2022.06.16 09:49:14 -06'00'



CERTIFICATION REGARDING LOBBYING; 
DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION AND OTHER RESPONSIBILITY MATTERS 

FOR EXPENDITURE OF FEDERAL FUNDS 
 

LOBBYING 
 

As required by 7 CFR Part 3018, for persons entering into a contract, grant or cooperative agreement over $100,000 involving the 
expenditure of Federal funds, the undersigned certifies for itself and its principals that: 
 

(a) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for 
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee 
of Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making 
of any Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension, 
continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement; 

 
(b) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or attempting 

to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress or an 
employee of a Member of Congress, in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the 
undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form - LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying,” in 
accordance with its instructions; and 

 
(c) The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards 

at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans, and cooperative agreements) and that all 
subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly. 

 
This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or entered into. 
Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by section 1352, title 31, U.S. 
Code. Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than $10,000 and not more 
than $100,000 for each such failure. 
 
The undersigned Contractor, certifies or affirms the truthfulness and accuracy of each statement of its certification and disclosure, if 
any.  In addition, the Contractor understands and agrees that the provisions of 31 U.S.C. Chap. 38, Administrative Remedies for False 
Claims and Statements, apply to this certification and disclosure, if any. 
 
 
________________________________________________  ________________________________________________ 
Signature of Contractor’s Authorized Official   Printed Name and Title of Contractor’s Authorized Official  
 
 
________________________________________________  ________________________________________________ 
Contrator / Name of Company     Date 
 
 
 

DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION AND OTHER RESPONSIBILITY MATTERS 
 

As required by 7 CFR Part 3017, for persons entering into a contract, grant or cooperative agreement over $25,000 involving the 
expenditure of Federal funds, the undersigned certifies for itself and its principals that: 
 

(a) Are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from covered 
transactions by any Federal department or agency; 

 
(b) Have not within a three-year period preceding this application been convicted of or had a civil judgment rendered against 

them for commission of fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a public 
(Federal, State, or local) transaction or contract under a public transaction; violation of Federal or State antitrust statutes or 
commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or destruction of records, making false statements, or 
receiving stolen property; 

 
(c) Are not presently indicted for or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a Government entity (Federal, State, or local) with 

commission of any offenses enumerated in paragraph (b) of this certification; and 
 
(d) Have not within a three-year period preceding this application had one or more public transaction (Federal, State, or local) 

terminated for cause or default; and 
 
Where the applicant is unable to certify to any of the statements in this certification, he or she shall attach an explanation to this 
application. 
 
 
________________________________________________  ________________________________________________ 
Signature of Contractor’s Authorized Official   Printed Name and Title of Contractor’s Authorized Official  
 
 
________________________________________________  ________________________________________________ 
Contrator / Name of Company     Date 

SHAUN SANDOVAL, CEO

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

SHAUN SANDOVAL, CEO

SANDOVAL CUSTOM CREATIONS, INC.

06/16/2022

06/16/2022
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