Hernandez, Catherine

From: Dodge, Charles

Sent: Wednesday, May 10, 2023 9:37 AM

To: Bailey, Michael; Hernandez, Catherine

Cc: Thompson, Paul; Bonilla, Jonathan

Subject: Re: Gravity Sewer System Failures - Three Repairs

Request approved.

cd

From: Bailey, Michael <mfbailey@ppines.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 10, 2023 9:26 AM

To: Hernandez, Catherine <cahernandez@ppines.com>; Dodge, Charles <cdodge @ppines.com>
Cc: Thompson, Paul <pthompson@ppines.com>; Bonilla, Jonathan <jbonilla@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: Gravity Sewer System Failures - Three Repairs

0Ok, thanks Cathy.

Michael F. Bailey, P.E.
Utilities Director
954-518-9073

From: Hernandez, Catherine <cahernandez@ppines.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 6:13 PM

To: Bailey, Michael <mfbailey@ppines.com>; Dodge, Charles <cdodge@ppines.com>

Cc: Thompson, Paul <pthompson@ppines.com>; Bonilla, Jonathan <jbonilla@ppines.com>
Subject: RE: Gravity Sewer System Failures - Three Repairs

Good afternoon all,
Please see the quotes attached.

Thank you,

Cathy Fewnandez
(954) 518-9018

From: Bailey, Michael <mfbailey@ppines.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 6:03 PM

To: Dodge, Charles <cdodge@ppines.com>

Cc: Thompson, Paul <pthompson@ppines.com>; Bonilla, Jonathan <jbonilla@ppines.com>; Hernandez, Catherine
<cahernandez@ppines.com>

Subject: RE: Gravity Sewer System Failures - Three Repairs

Hi Mr. Dodge, I’'m sending this message to recommend your approval of three emergency sewer main repairs
and an associated budget amendment. The recent heavy rains have exposed three locations where the sewer



mains have defects/failures and are undermining the street/swale. These repairs are outside of the Jacobs
contract because they are deeper than the four-foot limit in the contract.

Attached are quotes for the three locations (one of the quotes include two repairs) from Southern
Underground Industries, piggy backing an annual sewer repair contract they have with the City of Fort

Lauderdale. The total for these repairs is $82,370.00.

Funding for these repairs would require a budget adjustment. | recommend the following:

FR:  471-536-6010-534981-0000-000-0000- (Function Sourcing -Utilities) $11,620
471-535-6021-534981-0000-000-0000- (Function Sourcing -Utilities) $14,940
471-535-6022-534981-0000-000-0000- (Function Sourcing -Utilities) $16,600
471-533-6031-534981-0000-000-0000- (Function Sourcing -Utilities) $25,730
471-533-6032-534981-0000-000-0000- (Function Sourcing -Utilities) $14,110

TO:  471-535-6021-546150-0000-000-0000- (R&M Land Bldg & Improvement) $83,000

For the future, | would like to take a piggy back contract to the Commission for annual sewer repairs at a not-
to-exceed amount of, say, $250,000 so that we can proceed with similar repairs without having to request
emergency approval and obtain Commission ratification every time.

Please let me know if this meets with your approval or if you have any questions. Thanks,

Michael F. Bailey, P.E.
Utilities Director
954-518-9073

From: Thompson, Paul <pthompson@ppines.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 3, 2023 9:39 AM

To: Bailey, Michael <mfbailey@ppines.com>

Subject: Gravity Sewer System Failure SW 6th St and NW 87th Way

Mike,
Please find attached the quotes for the emergency repair of the 2 areas affected by sinkholes caused by possible failure
of our gravity sewer system. Let’s discuss as necessary.

Regards,

gﬁlauf 7W¢M

Assistant Utility Director

City of Pembroke Pines

8300 S. Palm Drive

Pembroke Pines, FL 33025
Email: pthompson@ppines.com
Office Phone: (954) 518-9097
Cell Phone: (954) 995-0281







