Pricing Tabulation
IFB # ED-23-03 "Fire Alarm Replacement at West Campus Charter School"

Bass-United Fire & Security Dan Enterprises LLC Triad Security Group Inc WSA Systems
Systems Inc.
# Base Items Total Vendor Total Vendor Total Vendor Total Vendor
Cost Notes Cost Notes Cost Notes Cost Notes
#0-1 |Lump Sum for Building E, P & | $287,000.00 |n/a $307,997.71 |(a) $395,241.69 No Bid No Bid
$287,000.00 $307,997.71 $395,241.69 $0.00
Bass-United Fire & Security Dan Enterprises LLC Triad Security Group Inc WSA Systems
Systems Inc.
# Additional Work Total Vendor Total Vendor Total Vendor Total Vendor
Cost Notes Cost Notes Cost Notes Cost Notes
#1-1 |Conduit Per Linear FT $15.00 [installed with wire $437.50 |Material, labor and $25.00 |Underground No Bid|No Bid
installation included
#1-2 |Raceway Per Linear FT $15.00 [installed with wire $437.50 |Material, labor and $8.00 [Raceway or No Bid[No Bid
installation included conduit
#1-3 [Addressable Duct Detectors with Test Switch, Relay $285.00 |device only $240.00 |Material, labor and $978.00 |additional $780.00 |1
Modules and Smoke Detector Per Unit installation included
#1-4 |Addressable Heat Detector Per Unit $110.00 |device only $223.00 |Material, labor and $340.00 |additional $85.00 (1
installation included
#1-5 |Addressable Smoke Detector Per Unit $150.00 |device only $223.00 |Material, labor and $340.00 |additional $100.00 |1
installation included
#1-6 |Addressable Pull Station Per Unit $90.00 |device only $1,172.50 (Material, labor and $375.67 |additional $120.00 |1
installation included
#1-7 |Strobe Light Per Unit $75.00 |device only $149.00 |Material, labor and $299.37 |additional $215.00 |1
installation included
#1-8 [Speaker Strobe Per Unit $125.00 |device only $195.00 |Material, labor and $361.26 |additional $80.00 (1
installation included




