Grosso, Astrid

From: Dorismond, Marie <Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us>
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 12:25 PM

To: Grosso, Astrid

Subject: RE: City of Pembroke Pines

Hi Astrid

Yes the City applied for $292,768.00 unfortunately, this year you couldn’t award the full amount to everybody.
I will be happy to do an amendement in the future if we have any remaining funds for the year.

Please let me know if you have any additional questions.

j?ﬂrnfyouf

Marie France Dorismond

Transit Coordinator
954-777-4605
Marie.dorismond@dot.state.fl.us
www.dot.state.fl.us

From: Grosso, Astrid [mailto:agrosso@ppines.com]

Sent: Monday, October 1, 2018 10:08 AM

To: Dorismond, Marie <Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us>
Subject: FW: City of Pembroke Pines

Marie,

Would you Please confirm amount received for the City of Pembroke Pines is correct.
| attached the application submitted for the FFY2018/YR 43 back in 2017. The application’s total amount is
$292,768 please refer to page 4. Let me know anything.

Thanks,
A.

From: Dorismond, Marie [mailto:Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us]
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 9:09 AM

To: Grosso, Astrid <agrosso@ppines.com>

Subject: RE: City of Pembroke Pines

Good morning Astrid
Good catch. Please see attached for the correction.
Remember to send me the original on (the one with the error). | still need it for your file.

j?:aﬂfyou./
Marie France Dorismond
Transit Coordinator



954-777-4605
Marie.dorismond@dot.state.fl.us
www.dot.state.fl.us

From: Grosso, Astrid [mailto:agrosso@ ppines.com]

Sent: Monday, October 1, 2018 6:16 AM

To: Dorismond, Marie <Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us>
Subject: RE: City of Pembroke Pines

Good Morning Marie,
Please note that, Estimated Total Cost Amount $286,690. Letter stays $285,690 could you please send a

revised first page. The other columns are correct.

Estimated
| Total Cost

| $285,840.00

|s  8s0.00

| $286,690.00

Thanks,
A.

From: Dorismond, Marie [mailto:Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us]
Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 11:23 AM

To: Grosso, Astrid <agrosso@ppines.com>

Cc: Shechter, Jay <jshechter@ppines.com>

Subject: RE: City of Pembroke Pines

Thank you Astrid!

From: Grosso, Astrid [mailto:agrosso@ppines.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 10:46 AM

To: Dorismond, Marie <Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us>
Cc: Shechter, Jay <jshechter@ppines.com>

Subject: RE: City of Pembroke Pines

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution with links and attachments.

Good Morning Marie,
Great News!!! Thank you.



301 NW 103" Avenue please.

A,

From: Dorismond, Marie [mailto:Marie.Dorismond@dot.state.fl.us]
Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 10:41 AM

To: Grosso, Astrid <agrosso@ppines.com>

Subject: City of Pembroke Pines

Good morning
What will be the best address to send your Notice of Grant Award.
| have two addresses on file:

10100 Pines Blvd
Pembroke Pines, FL 33026

301 NW 103" Ave
Pembroke Pines, FL 33026

Please confirm which one will work best for your Notice of Grant Award.

Thank you!

Marie France Dorismond

Transit Coordinator
954-777-4605
Marie.dorismond@dot.state.fl.us
www.dot.state.fl.us
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