



[View by Line Item](#) | [View by Supplier](#)

[Email Tabulation](#) | [Generate PDF](#) | [View Printable](#)

**Bid #TS-18-02 - Chromebooks, Licenses, and Mobile Carts for Pembroke Pines Charter Schools**

Creation Date **Nov 27, 2018**

End Date **Dec 18, 2018 2:00:00 PM EST**

Start Date **Nov 27, 2018 8:20:05 PM EST**

Awarded Date **Not Yet Awarded**

<b>Staples</b>		<b>\$82,571.00 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>Corey Sheets</b> <a href="mailto:corey.sheets@staples.com">corey.sheets@staples.com</a> Ph 407-475-4809		Address <b>GRAND ISLAND, FL 32735</b>	
Bid Notes <b>NO BID EARTHWALK CHARGING CARTS WE ARE QUOTING AN ALTERNATE</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> NO BID EARTHWALK CHARGING CARTS WE ARE QUOTING AN ALTERNATE	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$225.53	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0000US	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$23.71	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CROSSWDISEDU	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$779.90	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CSC36AC	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> ALTERNATE OFFER FOR TRIPPLITE CHARGING CART	

<b>AKA Comp Solutions, INC.</b>		<b>\$83,511.00 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>Fahad Rafique</b> <a href="mailto:fahad@akacomp.com">fahad@akacomp.com</a> Ph 312-753-8276		Address <b>5875 N Lincoln Ave</b> <b>Ste 132</b> <b>Chicago, IL 60659</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$254.22	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$24.15	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$0.00	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> No Bid for this Item	

<b>Troxell Communications</b>		<b>\$84,692.00 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>Michael Schecter</b> <a href="mailto:heidi.griffith@trox.com">heidi.griffith@trox.com</a> Ph 703-462-3034		Address <b>2465 Centreville Road</b> <b>Suite J17-852</b> <b>Herndon, VA 20171</b>	
Bid Notes <b>For questions, comments, or award, feel free to contact Heidi Griffith, Account Executive, at 954-746-4831 or heidi.griffith@trox.com</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> For questions, comments, or award, feel free to contact Heidi Griffith, Account Executive, at 954-746-4831 or heidi.griffith@trox.com	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$244.89	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Lenovo 20GL0000US	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	

TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$23.25	300 / each	\$6,975.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Google CROSSWDNEDU		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$425.00	10 / each	\$4,250.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Aver B30		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> ALTERNATE: Aver Charge Cart B30		

<b>FireFly Computers</b>		<b>\$85,690.00 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Brian Dimitroff</b> <a href="mailto:contracts@fireflycomputers.com">contracts@fireflycomputers.com</a> Ph 612-564-4088		Address <b>1271 Red Fox Road</b> <b>Saint Paul, MN 55112</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$243.00	300 / each	\$72,900.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0001US		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$25.00	300 / each	\$7,500.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CROS-SW-DIS-EDU		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$529.00	10 / each	\$5,290.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CHRGE030		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		

<b>MobileMe Information Technologies</b>		<b>\$87,185.00 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Ed Alonso</b> <a href="mailto:ed@mobilemeit.com">ed@mobilemeit.com</a> Ph 305-381-5898 Fax 800-948-8120		Address <b>2182 NW 87th Ave</b> <b>Miami, FL 33172</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - Alt 1	\$234.00	300 / each	\$70,200.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0001US		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> (Optional Unit Upgrade) Lenovo P/N 80VJ0001US - This is an upgrade to the unit requested. It comes with a 32GB flash drive rather than a 16GB. The exact specs are: N42 Touch Chromebook, 14.0 HD AntiGlare Multitouch, Intel N3060 (1.60GHz, 2MB), 4.0GB, 1x32GB EMMC, Intel HD 400, Intel 7265(2x2) AC + BT4.1, 720p HD Camera, 3 cell Li-Polymer, 1yr Warranty - Price includes shipping and handling.		



<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CROSSWDISGRT <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$989.00	10 / each	\$9,890.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> LKN-101-96 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Alternative Cart Option Lock N Charge Joey 30 Cart - Allows districts to enjoy the education focused designs at an entry level price. An easy to use cart that charges, secures, stores and transports up to 30 devices. Detailed Spec sheet is attached. Price includes shipping and handling.		

<b>Southern Computer Warehouse (SCW)</b>		<b>\$91,904.30 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Julia Stewart</b> <a href="mailto:scwbids@scw.com">scwbids@scw.com</a> Ph 877-468-6729 Fax 770-579-8937		Address <b>1395 S. Marietta Pkwy</b> <b>Bldg. 300 Ste 106</b> <b>Marietta, GA 30067</b>		
Bid Notes <b>Thank you for allowing SCW the chance to participate in this bidding process. We look forward to the chance to work with you in the near future. Please feel free to reach out with any questions or concerns that you might have!</b>				
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Thank you for allowing SCW the chance to participate in this bidding process. We look forward to the chance to work with you in the near future. Please feel free to reach out with any questions or concerns that you might have!		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$263.31	300 / each	\$78,993.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$25.05	300 / each	\$7,515.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		

TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$539.63	10 / each	\$5,396.30
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> *** This is an alternate product - Anywhere Cart 30 Bay Cart. The specifications have been uploaded through the system for review and consideration. Thank you!		

<b>EarthWalk Communications, Inc.</b>		<b>\$93,690.00 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Erin Ginther</b> <a href="mailto:Bids@earthwalk.com">Bids@earthwalk.com</a> Ph 888-213-4900		Address <b>10511 Battleview Parkway</b> <b>Manassas, VA 20109</b>		
Supplier Code 270221				
Bid Notes <b>Shipping &amp; Handling including Liftgate if needed are included to Pembroke Pines FL</b>				
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Shipping & Handling including Liftgate if needed are included to Pembroke Pines FL		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$242.00	300 / each	\$72,600.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0001US <b>Supplier Notes:</b> This unit is an upgrade to the 80VJ0000US specified, it includes a 32GB drive instead of a 16GB drive. All other specifications are the same		
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$25.00	300 / each	\$7,500.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CHROME-MC <b>Supplier Notes:</b> our internal item number for CROSSWDISGRT. Google Console Management License		
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,359.00	10 / each	\$13,590.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> SYSTEM CC30+HE <b>Supplier Notes:</b> EarthWalk Saver Series System ChromeCart 30+HEZ Charging system		

<b>Hypertec USA Inc. (Hypertec Direct)</b>		<b>\$95,621.00 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Mike Marracino</b> <a href="mailto:bidsus@hypertec.com">bidsus@hypertec.com</a> Ph 480-626-9000 Fax 480-626-9001		Address <b>1753 E BROADWAY RD STE 101-514</b> <b>TEMPE, AZ 85282</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$242.10	300 / each	\$72,630.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0000US <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$23.31	300 / each	\$6,993.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CROS-SW-DIS-GRT <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,599.80	10 / each	\$15,998.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> E-SS30.3-HEZP2 <b>Supplier Notes:</b>		

<b>Zones Inc</b>		<b>\$96,830.00 (3/3 items)</b>		
Bid Contact <b>Imran Yunus</b> <a href="mailto:bidteam@zones.com">bidteam@zones.com</a> Ph 310-766-0124		Address <b>YORBA LINDA, CA 92886</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$243.82	300 / each	\$73,146.00
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Uploaded attachment has all the information with authorized signatures.		

TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$23.98	300 / each	\$7,194.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> W-9 Form Attached		
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,649.00	10 / each	\$16,490.00
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>		

<b>Riverside Technologies, Inc.</b>		<b>\$98,885.00 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact: <b>Terry DenBeste</b> <a href="mailto:kbranson@riversidetechnologies.com">kbranson@riversidetechnologies.com</a> Ph 866-804-4388 Fax 866-812-5370		Address <b>105 Gateway Drive</b> <b>Box 1547</b> <b>N. Sioux City, SD 57049</b>	
Bid Notes: <b>Please see the attached quote for additional details:</b> <b>Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@1rti.com Thank you for Your Business!</b>			

<b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Please see the attached quote for additional details: Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@1rti.com Thank you for Your Business!
----------------------	---

Item #	Line Item	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$245.00	300 / each	\$73,500.00

<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 80VJ0000US		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Please see the attached quote for additional details: Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@1rti.com Thank you for Your Business!		

TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$23.25	300 / each	\$6,975.00
----------------	--	---------	------------	------------

<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> RTSWR-T0023		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Please see the attached quote for additional details: Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@1rti.com Thank you for Your Business!		

TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,841.00	10 / each	\$18,410.00
----------------	---	------------	-----------	-------------

<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Please see the attached quote for additional details: Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@1rti.com Thank you for Your Business!		

--	--

<b>Virtucom, Inc.</b>		<b>\$100,460.00 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>Sean Bevan</b> <a href="mailto:sbevan@virtucom.com">sbevan@virtucom.com</a> Ph 800-890-2611 Fax 770-908-8007		Address <b>5060 Avalon Ridge Pkwy Suite 300</b> <b>Norcross, GA 30071</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$251.00	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$75,300.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> N42		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$24.00	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$7,200.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Google Chrome OS Mgmt		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,796.00	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$17,960.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CC30+HE		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	

<b>The Horus Group LLC</b>		<b>\$105,296.50 (3/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>George Black</b> <a href="mailto:gblack@horusgroupllc.com">gblack@horusgroupllc.com</a> Ph 817-201-5057		Address <b>FORT WORTH, TX 76135</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$278.24	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$83,472.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$29.96	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$8,988.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,283.65	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$12,836.50	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
	Alt 1	\$1,283.65	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$12,836.50	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Ergotron Cart		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	

<b>Cetrix</b>		<b>\$12,950.00 (1/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>Paul Nilsen</b> <a href="mailto:p.nilsen@cetrixinc.com">p.nilsen@cetrixinc.com</a> Ph 356-355-0149		Address <b>San Juan, 116/8</b> <b>St. George's Road</b> <b>St. Julian, NY 10020</b>	
Bid Notes <b>Cetrix Technologies is the original manufacturer of ChargeMax charging carts and are placing a bid on the charging carts only. We will add the City of Pembroke to our insurance policy when we are awarded the contract.</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> Cetrix Technologies is the original manufacturer of ChargeMax charging carts and are placing a bid on the charging carts only. We will add the City of Pembroke to our insurance policy when we are awarded the contract.	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02-01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060		
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		No Bids	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual)		
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		No Bids	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
TS-18-02-01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency - First Offer	\$1,295.00	10 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Total Price</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		\$12,950.00	
<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> CC-30DP		<b>Supplier Notes:</b> This is an alternate offer: Cetrix ChargeMax CC-30DP for Chromebooks, with better specifications and options than CC30+ HE (see attachments). Our offered ChargeMax model comes with vertically placed Chromebook compartments. Horizontal compartments are an option (\$100 each). Since we are the original manufacturer, we provide a range of customization options which can be discussed in detail after award, including color and graphics, special plugs and security measures, a mobile app for remote control and programming, etc.	

--	--

<b>Begus online llc</b>		<b>\$115,500.00 (2/3 items)</b>	
Bid Contact <b>alberto zaltzberg</b> <a href="mailto:keylacorp@az-emarketing.com">keylacorp@az-emarketing.com</a> Ph 888-462-6210		Address <b>2875 ne 191 st</b> <b>500</b> <b>miami, FL 33180</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Line Item</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Qty/Unit</b>
TS-18-02--01-01	80VJ0000US - Lenovo N42-20 Touch Chromebook 80VJ - 14" - Celeron N3060 - First Offer	\$348.00	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
		Lenovo IdeaPad N42-20 (80US0000US) Chromebook Intel Celeron N3060 (1.60 GHz) 4 GB Memory 16 GB eMMC 14.0" Chrome OS	
TS-18-02--01-02	CROSSWDISGRT - Google Chrome OS Management Console License (Perpetual) - First Offer	\$37.00	300 / each
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	
		Google Chrty Google Chrome OS Management Console License	
TS-18-02--01-03	CC30+ HE - EarthWalk Saver Series CC30+ Bay Mobile Charging Cart for Efficiency		No Bids
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>	
		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>	

Close

Questions? Contact a BidSync representative: 800-990-9339 or email: [support@bidsync.com](mailto:support@bidsync.com)

[Home](#) | 
 [Bid Search](#) | 
 [Bids](#) | 
 [Orders](#) | 
 [Tools](#) | 
 [Support](#) | 
 [Privacy](#) | 
 [Logout](#)



Copyright © 1999-2018 - BidSync - All rights reserved.



DATE: 12/18/18

**SEALED BID: TS-18-02 - Chromebooks, Licenses, And Mobile Carts For Pembroke Pines Charter Schools**

**COMPANY NAME**

**AMOUNT**

_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____

**PRESENT:**

CHARLES F. DODGE, CITY MANAGER

MARLENE GRAHAM, CITY CLERK

DEBRA E. ROGERS, DEPUTY CITY CLERK

DANNY BENEDIT, PURCHASING SPECIALIST

ETIUC PERJUTE, PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

**OTHERS:**

Michael Gonzalez

*[Signature]*  
*[Signature]*

*[Signature]*

*[Signature]*

**ORIGINAL BIDS RELEASED TO:**

\_\_\_\_\_

ON \_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

Vendor	Staples Contract & Commercial LLC	AKA Comp Solutions, Inc.	Troxell Communications, Inc.	FireFly Computers	MobileMe IT
<b>Contact Information</b> (From Attachment A)	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 1096 East Newport Center Drive Suite #300 Deerfield Beach, FL 33342</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Corey Sheets - Account Manager Phone: 94071 475-4809 Fax: (508) 382-1735 corey.sheets@staples.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Marty Robertson - VP/General Manager marty.robertson@staples.com</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 5875 North Lincoln Avenue Suite #132 Chicago, IL 60659</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Fahad Rafique - Accounts Manager Phone: (773) 733-4393 Fax: N/A fahad@akacomp.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 8570 Stirling Road Suite #102, #400 Hollywood, FL 33024</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Heidi Griffith - Account Executive Phone: (954) 746-4831 Fax: (954) 746-4832 heidi.griffith@trox.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Michael Fabio - VP of Finance Phone: (800) 352-7912 Fax: (800) 752-1299 michael.fabio@trox.com</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 1271 Red Fox Road Saint Paul, MN 55112</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Carlie Mathias - Account Development Representative Phone: (612) 564-4088 fax: (612) 392-2155 contracts@fireflycomputers.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Nikki Levang - VP of Operations</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 2182 NW 87th Avenue Doral, FL 33172</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Ed Alonso - Director of Sales Phone: (305) 381-5898 Fax: N/A ed@mobilemeit.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>
<b>Attachment A - Contact Information Form</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment B - Vendor Information Form and W-9</b>	Yes.	Did not submit.	Yes.	Did not submit.	Yes.
<b>Attachment C - Non-Collusive Affidavit</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment D - Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form</b>	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.
<b>Attachment E - Local Vendor Preference Certification</b>	Claiming Local Vendor Preference Certification as a Broward County Vendor. - (Submitted Broward County Local Business Tax Receipt)	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.
<b>Attachment F - Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification</b>	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for YOAB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for YOAB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for YOAB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.
<b>Attachment G - Equal Benefits Certification Form</b>	Currently complies.	Currently complies.	Currently complies.	Exempt.	Currently complies.
<b>Attachment H - Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form</b>	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.
<b>Attachment I - Vendor Certification Regarding Scrutinized Companies List</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment J - Proposer's Completed Qualification Statement</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Additional Information</b>	Broward County Local Business Tax Receipt and Product Description.	None provided.	2018 Florida Annual Resale Certificate for Sales Tax, Detail by Entity Name Document, Certificate of Liability Insurance, Nationwide References, and Item Specifications.	Quote and Exception: Proposing Alternate Device Letter	Item Description
<b>Bid Security (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Method of Submittal</b>	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync
<b>Supplier Notes for Offer</b>	No bid earthwalk charging carts we are quitting an alternate.	None provided.	For questions, comments, or award, feel free to contact Heidi Griffith, Account Executive, at 954-746-4831 or heidi.griffith@trox.com	None provided.	None provided.
<b>Comments</b>					

Vendor	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.	EarthWalk Communications, Inc.	Hypertec USA, Inc. (Hypertec Direct)	Zones IT Solutions, Inc. (Zones LLC)	Riverside Technologies, Inc.
<b>Contact Information</b> (From Attachment A)	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 1395 South Marietta Parkway Building 300, Suite #106 Marietta, GA 30067</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Julia Stewart - Vice President of Sales Phone: (877) 468-6729 Fax: (770) 579-8937 scwbids@scw.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 10511 Battlevue Parkway, 154384 Manassas, VA 20109</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Greg Vanderlip Phone: (703) 393-1940 Fax: (109) 997-8797 Bids@earthwalk.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Robert Greg Vanderlip - EVP Extension #1003 gregv@earthwalk.com</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 1868 East Broadway Road Tempe, AZ 85282</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Mike Marracino - Sr. VP &amp; GM Phone: (480) 626-9000 fax: (480) 626-9001 bidsus@hypertec.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 1102 15th Street SW Suite #102 Auburn, WA 98001</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Saad Bharti - Account Executive Phone: (253) 545-7318 Fax: (253) 288-6795 saad.bharti@zones.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Jon Bailey - Director, Business &amp; Legal Affairs Phone: (253) 288-6795 bidteam@zones.com</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 105 Gateway Drive North Sioux City, SD 57049</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Terry DenBeste - Territory Sales Manager Phone: (866) 804-4388 Fax: (866) 812-5370 tdenbeste@rti.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Kevin Heiss - President kevnh@rti.com</p>
<b>Attachment A - Contact Information Form</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment B - Vendor Information Form and W-9</b>	Did not submit.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment C - Non-Collusive Affidavit</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment D - Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form</b>	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.
<b>Attachment E - Local Vendor Preference Certification</b>	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.
<b>Attachment F - Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification</b>	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.
<b>Attachment G - Equal Benefits Certification Form</b>	Currently complies.	Currently complies.	Will comply at time of award.	Currently complies.	Will not comply.
<b>Attachment H - Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form</b>	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.
<b>Attachment I - Vendor Certification Regarding Scrutinized Companies List</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment J - Proposer's Completed Qualification Statement</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Additional Information</b>	Quote and Item Description	Sales Quote and Certificate of Liability Insurance.	Quote, Item Description, and Certificate of Liability Insurance.	City of Albuquerque Terms and Conditions Exceptions	Certificate of Liability Insurance, Quote, and Item Specification.
<b>Bid Security (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Method of Submittal</b>	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync
<b>Supplier Notes for Offer</b>	Thank you for allowing SCW the chance to participate in this bidding process. We look forward to the chance to work with you in the near future. Please feel free to reach out with any questions or concerns that you might have!	Shipping & Handling including Liftgate if needed are included to Pembroke Pines FL	None provided.	None provided.	Please see the attached quote for additional details: Thank you for the opportunity! Product availability and product discontinuation are subject to change without notice. The prices in this quotation are valid for 30 days from quote date above. Please make your purchase order to the attention of: Riverside Technologies, Inc. 748 N. 109th Court Omaha, NE 68154 Please include the quote number and RFQ # from this quote on the corresponding purchase order. Please fax your purchase order to RTI at 866-812-5370 or email to tdenbeste@rti.com Thank you for Your Business!
<b>Comments</b>					

Vendor	Virtucom, Inc.	The Horus Group LLC	Cetrix Technologies LLC	Begus Online LLC
<b>Contact Information</b> (From Attachment A)	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 5060 Avalon Ridge Parkway Suite #300 Peachtree Corners, GA 30071</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Brenda Wilson - Account Relationship Manager Phone: (770) 908-8100 Fax: (770) 908-8007 bwilson@virtucom.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 8301 Lakeview Boulevard Suite #111 Rowlett, TX 75088</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> George Black - Vice President Phone: (817) 201-5067 Fax: N/A gblack@horusgroupinc.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Same As Above</p>	<p><b>Company Information:</b> 8 The Green Suite #5945 Dover, DE</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Olsen Antos - Regional Sales Manager Phone: (302) 480-9434 Fax: N/A o.antos@cetrixinc.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> Cahtian J. Khalaf - President Phone: (302) 480-9399 info@cetrixinc.com</p>	<p><b>* Info obtained via BidSync *</b> <b>Company Information:</b> 2875 NE 191st Street Suite #500 Miami, FL 33180</p> <p><b>Primary Contact:</b> Alberto Zaltzberg Phone: (888) 462-6210 Fax: N/A keylacorp@az-emarketing.com</p> <p><b>Authorized Approver:</b> None Provided</p>
<b>Attachment A - Contact Information Form</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment B - Vendor Information Form and W-9</b>	Did not submit.	Did not submit.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment C - Non-Collusive Affidavit</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment D - Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Form</b>	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	No items selected.	A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are active in management nor any affiliate have been charged with a public entity crime.	No items selected.
<b>Attachment E - Local Vendor Preference Certification</b>	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for Local Vendor Preference Certification.	No items selected.
<b>Attachment F - Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification</b>	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.	Does not qualify for VOSB Preference Certification.
<b>Attachment G - Equal Benefits Certification Form</b>	Will comply at time of award.	No items selected.	Will comply at time of award.	Will comply at time of award.
<b>Attachment H - Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form</b>	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.	Complies fully.
<b>Attachment I - Vendor Certification Regarding Scrutinized Companies List</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Attachment J - Proposer's Completed Qualification Statement</b>	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.	Yes.
<b>Additional Information</b>	None provided.	Main Specifications	About Cetrix Technologies, Item Specifications, References, User Manual, and Certificate of Liability Insurance.	Picture of laptop
<b>Bid Security (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Method of Submittal</b>	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync	BidSync
<b>Supplier Notes for Offer</b>	None provided.	None provided.	Cetrix Technologies is the original manufacturer of ChargeMax charging carts and are placing a bid on the charging carts only. We will add the City of Pembroke to our insurance policy when we are awarded the contract.	None provided.
<b>Comments</b>			PARTIAL BID	PARTIAL BID