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Bid #PSUT-19-02 - Backflows and Water Meter Parts & Lift Station Rehab Materials

Creation Date   Jun 10, 2019 End Date Jul 9, 2019 2:00:00 PM EDT

Start Date Jun 11, 2019 8:13:46 PM EDT Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

Core & Main $727,721.24    (71/71 items)

 Bid Contact  Susan Reed 
susan.reed@coreandmain.com 
Ph 407-383-7008   
Fax 321-482-5057

 Address 590 Ferguson Drive
Orlando, FL 32805

 Supplier Code 266883
 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  
 Bid Notes   Please see attached qualifications and memorandum of insurance.

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Please see attached qualifications
and memorandum of insurance.

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--01-01  BACKFLOWS: 3/4" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $182.47     300 / each $54,741.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-02  BACKFLOWS: 1" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $190.24     200 / each $38,048.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-03  BACKFLOWS: 2" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $424.47     300 / each $127,341.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-04  BACKFLOWS: DUAL CHECK LF 1"X3/4" F7R10-U3 - First Offer $28.24     3500 / each $98,840.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $318,970.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price     Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--02-01  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $24.20     40 / each $968.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-02  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $28.48     300 / each $8,544.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-03  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X4" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $11.53     160 / each $1,844.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-04  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" RUBBER WASHER/GASKET - First Offer $0.94     500 / each $470.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-05  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X6" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $17.01     160 / each $2,721.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-06  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $1.01     300 / each $303.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-07  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1-1/2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $0.89     80 / each $71.20  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-08  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/8" RUBBER METER WASHERS - First Offer $0.07     2500 / each $175.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-09  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/16" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.07     2500 / each $175.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-10  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/32" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.06     2500 / each $150.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-11  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 3/4" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $0.00      100 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-12  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 2" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $44.71      100 / each $4,471.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-13  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" TAILPIECE - First Offer $4.93      250 / each $1,232.50  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-14  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1" TAILPIECE - First Offer $6.45      100 / each $645.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-15  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BEE SPRAY - First Offer $0.00      500 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-16  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: ANT SPRAY - First Offer $0.00      200 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-17  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BLUE SPRAY PAINT - First Offer $2.79      300 / each $837.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-18  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT WRENCHES - First Offer $21.54      100 / each $2,154.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-19  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT STANDS - First Offer $0.00      100 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-20  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" X 1 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $0.00      10 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-21  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/4 X 2 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $0.00      10 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--02-22  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: MANUAL HAND PUMP WITH 6 FT HOSE - First Offer $960.00      25 / each $24,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $48,762.10  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--03-01  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - 012 - First Offer $47.29      2000 / each $94,580.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-02  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC LID ONLY - 012 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $21.35      2000 / each $42,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-03  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - TRUSS T 1015 - First Offer $27.35      500 / each $13,675.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-04  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC LID ONLY- TRUSS T 1015 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $12.35      1000 / each $12,350.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-05  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $21.04      150 / each $3,156.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-06  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT LID ONLY W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $34.60      200 / each $6,920.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-07  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $19.12      150 / each $2,868.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-08  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT LID W/ CAST IRON READER - First Offer $31.93      150 / each $4,789.50  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-09  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL1416 P "WATER METER" W/ 2 AMR HOLES - First Offer $70.41      500 / each $35,205.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-10  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL09P01-3 "WATER METER" W/ 1 AMR HOLE - First Offer $70.41      100 / each $7,041.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:



 PSUT-19-02--03-11  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX CEMENT - First Offer $39.00      100 / each $3,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-12  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX LID - First Offer $56.78      100 / each $5,678.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-13  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 BOX PLASTIC - First Offer $109.35      100 / each $10,935.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-14  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 LID PLASTIC - First Offer $103.04      100 / each $10,304.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $254,101.50  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--04-01  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $1,270.59      20 / each $25,411.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-02  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $2,227.46      10 / each $22,274.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-03  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 4" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $50.47      10 / each $504.70  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-04  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $84.25      5 / each $421.25  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-05  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $38.44      40 / each $1,537.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-06  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $62.89      30 / each $1,886.70  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-07  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: valve boxes with sewer covers - First Offer $36.00      30 / each $1,080.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-08  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for pvc (red) - First Offer $31.72      80 / each $2,537.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-09  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for ductile iron (black) - First Offer $25.08      40 / each $1,003.20  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-10  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for PVC (red) - First Offer $26.16      110 / each $2,877.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-11  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for Ductile Iron (black) - First Offer $21.32      40 / each $852.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-12  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $189.35      20 / each $3,787.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-13  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $231.58      10 / each $2,315.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-14  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" C900 sewer pipe (green) - First Offer $2.77      400 / each $1,108.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-15  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" C900 Sewer Pipe (green) - First Offer $3.28      200 / each $656.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-16  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ - First Offer $450.59      25 / each $11,264.75  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: Item 9679800

 PSUT-19-02--04-17  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ - First Offer $803.53      20 / each $16,070.60  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: Item 9678146

 PSUT-19-02--04-18  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $30.73      40 / each $1,229.20  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-19  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $26.06      40 / each $1,042.40  



Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-20  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: Cases of Ramnek (tar strips) - First Offer $0.00      4 / each $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: No Bid

 PSUT-19-02--04-21  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 2" meter boxes with traffic lids - First Offer $215.62      16 / each $3,449.92  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-22  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $1.15      200 / each $230.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-23  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $2.48      200 / each $496.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-24  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $3.47      40 / each $138.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-25  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $3.82      40 / each $152.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-26  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Transition rubber - First Offer $4.12      40 / each $164.80  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-27  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Transition rubber - First Offer $5.00      40 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-28  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $12.35      100 / each $1,235.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-29  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $9.41      100 / each $941.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-30  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Zip Flange - First Offer $37.52      12 / each $450.24  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-31  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Zip Flange - First Offer $47.29      12 / each $567.48  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $105,887.64  

Fortiline, Inc. $810,019.00    (71/71 items)

 Bid Contact  Julie Cline 
sheri.smith@fortiline.com 
Ph 704-788-9813   
Fax 704-788-9859

 Address 7025 Northwinds Drive, NW
Concord, NC 28027

 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--01-01  BACKFLOWS: 3/4" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $200.00      300 / each $60,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-02  BACKFLOWS: 1" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $210.00      200 / each $42,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-03  BACKFLOWS: 2" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $450.00      300 / each $135,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-04  BACKFLOWS: DUAL CHECK LF 1"X3/4" F7R10-U3 - First Offer $32.00      3500 / each $112,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $349,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--02-01  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $21.75      40 / each $870.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-02  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $22.50      300 / each $6,750.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-03  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X4" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $11.75      160 / each $1,880.00  

mailto:sheri.smith@fortiline.com


Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-04  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" RUBBER WASHER/GASKET - First Offer $1.30      500 / each $650.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-05  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X6" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $17.50      160 / each $2,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-06  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $1.10      300 / each $330.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-07  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1-1/2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $0.85      80 / each $68.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-08  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/8" RUBBER METER WASHERS - First Offer $0.08      2500 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-09  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/16" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.08      2500 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-10  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/32" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.08      2500 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-11  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 3/4" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $65.00      100 / each $6,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-12  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 2" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $36.00      100 / each $3,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-13  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" TAILPIECE - First Offer $4.00      250 / each $1,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-14  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1" TAILPIECE - First Offer $6.00      100 / each $600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-15  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BEE SPRAY - First Offer $10.50      500 / each $5,250.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-16  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: ANT SPRAY - First Offer $15.00      200 / each $3,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-17  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BLUE SPRAY PAINT - First Offer $7.50      300 / each $2,250.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-18  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT WRENCHES - First Offer $22.00      100 / each $2,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-19  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT STANDS - First Offer $98.00      100 / each $9,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-20  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" X 1 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $30.00      10 / each $300.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-21  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/4 X 2 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $80.00      10 / each $800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-22  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: MANUAL HAND PUMP WITH 6 FT HOSE - First Offer $60.00      25 / each $1,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $50,748.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--03-01  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - 012 - First Offer $40.00      2000 / each $80,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-02  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC LID ONLY - 012 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $24.00      2000 / each $48,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-03  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - TRUSS T 1015 - First Offer $29.00      500 / each $14,500.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 



Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-04  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC LID ONLY- TRUSS T 1015 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $13.00      1000 / each $13,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-05  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $23.00      150 / each $3,450.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-06  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT LID ONLY W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $32.00      200 / each $6,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-07  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $21.00      150 / each $3,150.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-08  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT LID W/ CAST IRON READER - First Offer $34.00      150 / each $5,100.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-09  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL1416 P "WATER METER" W/ 2 AMR HOLES - First Offer $67.00      500 / each $33,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-10  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL09P01-3 "WATER METER" W/ 1 AMR HOLE - First Offer $67.00      100 / each $6,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-11  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX CEMENT - First Offer $42.00      100 / each $4,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-12  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX LID - First Offer $60.00      100 / each $6,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-13  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 BOX PLASTIC - First Offer $98.00      100 / each $9,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-14  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 LID PLASTIC - First Offer $92.00      100 / each $9,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $243,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--04-01  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $1,600.00      20 / each $32,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-02  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $2,204.00      10 / each $22,040.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-03  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 4" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $155.00      10 / each $1,550.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-04  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $245.00      5 / each $1,225.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-05  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $135.00      40 / each $5,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-06  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $220.00      30 / each $6,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-07  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: valve boxes with sewer covers - First Offer $42.00      30 / each $1,260.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-08  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for pvc (red) - First Offer $33.00      80 / each $2,640.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-09  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for ductile iron (black) - First Offer $28.00      40 / each $1,120.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-10  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for PVC (red) - First Offer $25.00      110 / each $2,750.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-11  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for Ductile Iron (black) - First Offer $23.00      40 / each $920.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:



 PSUT-19-02--04-12  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $400.00      20 / each $8,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-13  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $450.00      10 / each $4,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-14  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" C900 sewer pipe (green) - First Offer $4.00      400 / each $1,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-15  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" C900 Sewer Pipe (green) - First Offer $8.00      200 / each $1,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-16  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ - First Offer $400.00      25 / each $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-17  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ - First Offer $600.00      20 / each $12,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-18  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $40.00      40 / each $1,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-19  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $45.00      40 / each $1,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-20  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: Cases of Ramnek (tar strips) - First Offer $100.00      4 / each $400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-21  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 2" meter boxes with traffic lids - First Offer $220.00      16 / each $3,520.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-22  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $200.00      200 / each $40,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-23  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $4.00      200 / each $800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-24  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $6.00      40 / each $240.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-25  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $10.00      40 / each $400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-26  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Transition rubber - First Offer $4.00      40 / each $160.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-27  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Transition rubber - First Offer $5.00      40 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-28  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $9.50      100 / each $950.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-29  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $10.00      100 / each $1,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-30  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Zip Flange - First Offer $37.00      12 / each $444.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-31  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Zip Flange - First Offer $46.00      12 / each $552.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $167,271.00  

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. $629,049.20    (68/71 items)

 Bid Contact  Jason A Mueller 
drew.petonick@ferguson.com 
Ph 954-973-8100  

 Address 2361 NW 22nd Street
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

 Supplier Code 270223
 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

mailto:drew.petonick@ferguson.com


 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--01-01  BACKFLOWS: 3/4" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $157.00      300 / each $47,100.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-02  BACKFLOWS: 1" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $167.00      200 / each $33,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-03  BACKFLOWS: 2" BACKFLOW (Watts and Wilkins) - First Offer $377.00      300 / each $113,100.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--01-04  BACKFLOWS: DUAL CHECK LF 1"X3/4" F7R10-U3 - First Offer $24.75      3500 / each $86,625.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $280,225.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--02-01  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $38.00      40 / each $1,520.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-02  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2" BRASS OLVAL METER FLANGE - First Offer $51.00      300 / each $15,300.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-03  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X4" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $10.50      160 / each $1,680.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-04    METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" RUBBER WASHER/GASKET    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-05  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2X6" BRASS NIPPLE NO LEAD - First Offer $15.00      160 / each $2,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-06  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $1.50      300 / each $450.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-07  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1-1/2"X1/8 RUBBER DROP IN METER GASKET - First Offer $1.30      80 / each $104.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-08  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/8" RUBBER METER WASHERS - First Offer $0.10      2500 / each $250.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-09  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/16" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.10      2500 / each $250.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-10  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4"X1/32" RUBBER METER WASHER - First Offer $0.10      2500 / each $250.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-11  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 3/4" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $78.00      100 / each $7,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-12  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 2 1/2" X 2" HYDRANT SWIVEL ADAPTOR - First Offer $78.00      100 / each $7,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-13  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" TAILPIECE - First Offer $8.70      250 / each $2,175.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-14  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1" TAILPIECE - First Offer $13.40      100 / each $1,340.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-15  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BEE SPRAY - First Offer $6.25      500 / each $3,125.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-16  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: ANT SPRAY - First Offer $4.72      200 / each $944.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-17  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: BLUE SPRAY PAINT - First Offer $3.95      300 / each $1,185.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-18  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT WRENCHES - First Offer $24.76      100 / each $2,476.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:



 PSUT-19-02--02-19  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: HYDRANT STANDS - First Offer $75.00      100 / each $7,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-20  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 3/4" X 1 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $38.25      10 / each $382.50  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-21  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: 1 1/4 X 2 TURN ON KEY - First Offer $35.55      10 / each $355.50  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--02-22  METER ASSEMBLY PARTS AND APPURTENANCES: MANUAL HAND PUMP WITH 6 FT HOSE - First Offer $37.00      25 / each $925.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $58,212.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--03-01  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - 012 - First Offer $33.70      2000 / each $67,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-02  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON DBLE PLASTIC LID ONLY - 012 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $20.40      2000 / each $40,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-03  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC BOX ONLY - TRUSS T 1015 - First Offer $12.00      500 / each $6,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-04  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: CARSON SINLGE PLASTIC LID ONLY- TRUSS T 1015 W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $12.00      1000 / each $12,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-05  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $21.00      150 / each $3,150.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-06  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: DUAL H DOUBLE CEMENT LID ONLY W/CAST IRON READER - First Offer $34.00      200 / each $6,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-07  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT BOX - First Offer $19.00      150 / each $2,850.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-08  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: SINGLE CEMENT LID W/ CAST IRON READER - First Offer $32.00      150 / each $4,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-09  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL1416 P "WATER METER" W/ 2 AMR HOLES - First Offer $67.50      500 / each $33,750.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-10  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: FIBERLYTE LID, FL09P01-3 "WATER METER" W/ 1 AMR HOLE - First Offer $75.00      100 / each $7,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-11  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX CEMENT - First Offer $39.00      100 / each $3,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-12  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: 66 BOX LID - First Offer $57.00      100 / each $5,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-13  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 BOX PLASTIC - First Offer $105.00      100 / each $10,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--03-14  METER BOXES AND METER BOX LIDS: LIGHT DUTY 17x30 LID PLASTIC - First Offer $100.00      100 / each $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $215,150.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price  Difference 

 PSUT-19-02--04-01  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $1,075.00      20 / each $21,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-02  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Suction Lines (Stainless Steel) - First Offer $1,200.00      10 / each $12,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-03  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 4" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $148.00      10 / each $1,480.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-04  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6" x 4" T's MJ - First Offer $235.00      5 / each $1,175.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 



Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-05  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $130.00      40 / each $5,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-06  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" 90 Degrees MJ - First Offer $203.00      30 / each $6,090.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-07  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: valve boxes with sewer covers - First Offer $40.00      30 / each $1,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-08  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for pvc (red) - First Offer $26.00      80 / each $2,080.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-09  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalugs for ductile iron (black) - First Offer $21.00      40 / each $840.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-10  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for PVC (red) - First Offer $22.00      110 / each $2,420.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-11  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalugs for Ductile Iron (black) - First Offer $18.00      40 / each $720.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-12  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $327.00      20 / each $6,540.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-13  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" x 6' Flanged on one end Ductile Iron Pipe - First Offer $370.00      10 / each $3,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-14  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" C900 sewer pipe (green) - First Offer $2.50      400 / each $1,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per ft

 PSUT-19-02--04-15  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" C900 Sewer Pipe (green) - First Offer $4.93      200 / each $986.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per ft

 PSUT-19-02--04-16    PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-17    PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Dezurick valve with nut on top MJ    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-18  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $33.00      40 / each $1,320.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per ft

 PSUT-19-02--04-19  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Ductile iron pipe (sewer) - First Offer $27.00      40 / each $1,080.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: PRICED PER FT

 PSUT-19-02--04-20  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: Cases of Ramnek (tar strips) - First Offer $60.00      4 / each $240.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-21  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 2" meter boxes with traffic lids - First Offer $214.00      16 / each $3,424.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-22  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $1.00      200 / each $200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per ft

 PSUT-19-02--04-23  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" SDR 35 (green) - First Offer $2.25      200 / each $450.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per ft

 PSUT-19-02--04-24  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $4.40      40 / each $176.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-25  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" neoprime full face gaskets - First Offer $5.70      40 / each $228.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-26  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Transition rubber - First Offer $4.00      40 / each $160.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-27  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Transition rubber - First Offer $4.85      40 / each $194.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 



Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-28  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $1.30      100 / each $130.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per t-bolt only

 PSUT-19-02--04-29  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" megalug T-Bolt Kits - First Offer $1.30      100 / each $130.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: priced per t-bolt only

 PSUT-19-02--04-30  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 4" Zip Flange - First Offer $32.10      12 / each $385.20  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSUT-19-02--04-31  PARTS LIST FOR LIFT STATION REHAB: 6" Zip Flange - First Offer $34.50      12 / each $414.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $75,462.20  

Offer Total

 $727,721.24 (Does not apply to percentage or no price items.)
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City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement 

IFB #PSUT-19-02 
Backflows and Water Meter Parts Lift Station Rehab Materials

Vendor Core & Main Fortiline, Inc. Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
4310 NW 10th Avenue

Oakland Park, FL 33309
Primary Contact:

Ryan Shay - Outside Sales 
Representative

Phone: (954) 772-7343
Fax: (954) 772-0443

ryan.shay@coreandmain.com
Authorized Approver:

Susan Reed:Municipal Sales Coordinator
Phone: (407) 383-7008

Fax: (321) 482-5057
susan.reed@coreandmain.com

Company Information:
7025 Northwinds, NW
Concord, NC 28027
Primary Contact:

Jeff Brouillette - Government Sales 
Representative

Phone: (561) 284-4476
Fax: (772) 408-1963

jeff.brouilete@fortiline.com
sheri.smith@fortiline.com
Authorized Approver:

Richard Linneman -VP & Asst. Secretary
Phone: (704) 788-9800

Fax: (704) 788-9896
richard.linneman@fortiline.com

sheri.smith@fortiline.com

Company Information:
1950 NW 18th St

Pompano Beach, FL 33069
Primary Contact:

Drew Petonick - Sales
Phone: (561) 718-1037

Fax: (954) 917-3134
drew.petonick@ferguson.com

Authorized Approver:
Same As Above

Attachment A - Contact Information Form Yes. Yes. Yes.
Attachment B - Non-Collusive Affidavit Yes. Yes. Yes.
Attachment C - Proposer’s Qualifications 
Statement

Yes. Yes. Yes.

Vendor Registration and Qualification 
Documents:

1. Vendor Information Form Yes. Yes. Yes.
2. Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Yes. Yes. Yes.

3. Sworn Statement of Public Entity 
Crimes Form

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate 

have been charged with a public entity 
crime.

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any 

affiliate have been charged with a public 
entity crime.

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who 
are acitve in management nor any affiliate 

have been charged with a public entity 
crime.

4. Local Vendor Preference 
Certification

Claiming Local Vendor Preference 
Certification as a Broward County vendor

 Does not meet the requirements as a 
Local Vendor

Claiming Local Vendor Preference 
Certification as a Broward County vendor

5. Local Business Tax Receipts
2018-19 City of Oakland Park Local 

Business Tax Receipt for Core & Main LP
2018-19 Palm Beach County Local 

Business Tax Receipt for Fortiline Inc.

2018-19 Broward County Local Business 
Tax Receipt for Ferguson Underground 

Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks

6. Veteran Owned Small Business 
Preference Certification

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference 
Certification.

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference 
Certification.

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference 
Certification.

7. Equal Benefits Certification Form Currently complies. Currently complies. Currently complies.
8. Vendor Drug-Free Workplace 
Certification Form

Complies fully. Complies fully. Complies fully.

9. Scrutinized Company Certification Yes. Yes. Yes.
Bid Security (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's 
Check, Not Submitted)

N/A N/A N/A

Additional Information

Core & Main submitted a "Qualification to 
Bid" document stating that the 
"Acceptance of any Agreement

by Seller is made expressly conditioned 
on assent by the City of Pembroke Pines" 

to various terms that would need to be 
reviewed by the City Attorney's Office and 

the Risk Department.

-Key Personnel Contact Information
-State of Florida Department of State 

Business Corporation filling.
-Local Palm Beach County Tax Receipt

Information regarding Tax ID number and 
various DBAs

Method of Submittal BidSync BidSync BidSync

Supplier Notes for Offer
Please see attached qualifications and 

memorandum of insurance. 
None provided. None provided. 

Comments
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