City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement
IFB #PSUT-20-04
Water Treatment Plant Facility
Improvements 2020

Vendor

Cardinal Contractors, Inc.

Intercounty Engineering, Inc.

Lawrence Lee Construction Services, Inc.

Contact Information
(From Attachment A)

Company Information:
13794 NW 4th St, Suite 200
Sunrise, FL 33325
Primary Contact:
Michael Brandao- VP
Phone: (561) 809-1285
mbrandao@prim.com

Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
1925 NW 18 Street
Pompano Beach, FL 33069
Phone: (954) 972-9800
Fax:  (954) 974-0042
Primary Contact:
Stephen Polk - VP
bids@rfcenvironmental.com

Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Company Information:
50 NE Dixie Hwy, Suite A6
Stuart, FL 34994
Primary Contact:
Geoffrey L. Schmidt - President
Phone: (561) 578-7715
GS@LawrencelLeeConstruction.com

Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Attachment A - Contact Information Form Included Included Included
Attachment B - Non-Collusive Affidavit Included Included Included
Attachment C - Proposer’s Qualifications Statement Included Included Included
Attachment F - References Form Included Included Included
Vendor Registration and Qualification Documents:
1. Vendor Information Form Included Included Included
2. Form W-9 (Rev. October 2018) Included Included Not Included

3. Sworn Statement of Public Entity Crimes Form

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been
charged with a public entity crime.

4. Local Vendor Preference Certification

Included - Broward County Vendor

Not Included

Included - Not a local vendor

5. Local Business Tax Receipts

LBTR- Broward County

LBTR- Broward County

LBTR - City of Stuart

6. Veteran Owned Small Business Preference Certification

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference
Certification.

Form not included-Does not qualify for VOSB
Preference Certification.

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference
Certification.

7. Equal Benefits Certification Form

Currently complies

Contractor does not provide benefits to
employees' spouses in traditional marriages

Currently complies

8. Vendor Drug-Free Workplace Certification Form

Complies fully

Complies fully

Complies fully

9. Scrutinized Company Certification

Included

Included

Included

Bid Security (N/A, Bid Bond, Cashier's Check, Not Submitted)

5 % Bid Bond

5 % Bid Bond

5 % Bid Bond Recv'd on BidSync.com
However, never recv'd org Bid Bond

Additional Information

DBPR License, Certificate of Liability Insurance, &
Corporate Docs

Attended Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting

Attended Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting

Did not attend Mandatory Pr-Bid Meeting

Method of Submittal

BidSync

BidSync

BidSync

Supplier Notes for Offer

Lines #01- 01 - 06 No bids
&

Line #02-02-Cost for the Payment and
Performance Bond is included in PSUT-20-
04--02-01 - Option 2: Total Cost to
Complete All Five Projects: Water
Treatment Plant Facility
Improvements 2020

None

None

Comments

None

None

None
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RF Environmental Services

Company Information:
4840 NE 11th Ave

Oakland Park, FL 33334
Primary Contact:
Thaddeus Buckley - President
Phone: (954) 605-6711
thad@rfeswater.com

Authorized Approver:
Same as above

Included

Included

Included

Included

Included

Included

A. Neither the entity nor any officers who are
acitve in management nor any affiliate have been

charged with a public entity crime.

Included - Broward County Vendor

LBTR for Milan Construction

Does not qualify for VOSB Preference
Certification.

Currently complies

Complies fully

Included

5 % Bid Bond

DBPR Licenses & Corporate Docs

Attended Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting

BidSync

None

None

City of Pembroke Pines
Bid Tabulation - Procurement
IFB #PSUT-20-04
Water Treatment Plant Facility
Improvements 2020
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BidSync

Periscope

BidSync: Bid Tabulation Report

Welcome eduncan@ppines.com | Logout

MNeed assistance?
Contact us

or call BOO-990-9319

View by Line Item | View by Supplier

Bid #PSUT-20-04 - Water Treatment Plant Facility Improvements 2020

Creation Date Jun 10, 2020
Start Date Jun 11, 2020 6:26:12 PM EDT

End Date

Email Tabulation | Generate PDF | View Printable

Jul 28, 2020 2:00:00 PM EDT

Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

Cardinal Contractors, Inc.

Eric Macek
emacek@prim.com
Ph 941-377-8555
Fax 941-377-8542
Supplier Code 278782

Bid Contact

$2,363,000.00 (8/8 items)

Address 4744 E State Road 64
Bradenton, FL 34208

Qualifications PP-DRUGFREE PP-EQUAL PP-LBTR PP-LOCAL PP-SCRUTINIZED PP-SWORN PP-VENDORINFO PP-VOSB PP-W9

https://www.bidsync.com/DPXReports?ac=bidreview&auc=2058049&byvendor=y&awardrec=y

Bid Notes Cost for the Payment and Performance Bond is included in PSUT-20-04--02-01 - Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment
Plant Facility Improvements 2020
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Cost for the Payment and Performance
Bond is included in PSUT-20-04--02-01 - Option 2: Total
Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant
Facility Improvements 2020
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--01-01 Part One - Rehabilitation of Treatment Unit A - First Offer $0.00 | 1/job $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
PSUT-20-04-01-02 | Part Two - Completion of Treatment Unit D - First Offer $0.00 | 1/job | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
PSUT-20-04-01-03 | Part Three - Painting Exterior of A, B, C &D - First Offer 5000 | 1/job | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
PSUT-20-04--01-04 | Part Four - Painting of Keyed notes - First Offer $0.00 | 1/job | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
PSUT-20-04--01-05 | Part Five - lon Exchange Instrumentation Upgrade - First Offer $0.00 I 1/job | $0.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
PSUT-20-04-01-06 | Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 000% | 1/job | 0.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No bid
Item # Line Iltem Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--02-01 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant Facility Improvements 2020 - First Offer $2,363,000.00 | 1/job $2,363,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--02-02 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 1.00% | 1/job 1.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Cost for the Payment and Performance

Bond is included in PSUT-20-04--02-01 - Option 2: Total
Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant
Facility Improvements 2020
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BidSync: Bid Tabulation Report

Lot Total: $2,363,000.00

Intercounty Engineering,Inc.

Bid Contact Maurice Hynes
smcdougle@intercountyengineering.com
Ph 954-972-9800

$4,405,786.00 (8/8 items)

Address 1925 N.W. 18th St.
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

Qualifications PP-DRUGFREE PP-EQUAL PP-LBTR PP-LOCAL PP-SCRUTINIZED PP-SWORN PP-VENDORINFO PP-VOSB PP-W9

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--01-01 Part One - Rehabilitation of Treatment Unit A - First Offer $1,399,423.00 | 1/job $1,399,423.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-02 | Part Two - Completion of Treatment Unit D - First Offer $73,640.00 | 1/job | $73,640.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04-01-03 | Part Three - Painting Exterior of A, B, C &D - First Offer $218290.00 | 1/job | $218,290.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-04 I Part Four - Painting of Keyed notes - First Offer $390,555.00 I 1/job I $390,555.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-05 | Part Five - lon Exchange Instrumentation Upgrade - First Offer $120,985.00 | 1/job | $120,985.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-06 | Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 0.80% | 1/job | 0.80%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--02-01 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant Facility Improvements 2020 - First Offer $2,202,893.00 | 1/job $2,202,893.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--02-02 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 0.80% | 1/job 0.80%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $2,202,893.00

Lawrence Lee Construction Services, Inc.

Bid Contact ~ Geoffrey Schmidt

gs@LawrenceleeConstruction.com
Ph 561-578-7715

$5,014,000.00 (8/8 items)

Address PO Box 1446
PORT SALERNO, FL 34992

Qualifications PP-DRUGFREE PP-EQUAL PP-LBTR PP-LOCAL PP-SCRUTINIZED PP-SWORN PP-VENDORINFO PP-VOSB PP-W9

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--01-01 Part One - Rehabilitation of Treatment Unit A - First Offer $1,632,000.00 | 1/job $1,632,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

PSUT-20-04--01-02 | Part Two - Completion of Treatment Unit D - First Offer $95,000.00 | 1/job | $95,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

PSUT-20-04--01-03 | Part Three - Painting Exterior of A, B, C & D - First Offer $200,000.00 I 1/job | $200,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

PSUT-20-04--01-04 I Part Four - Painting of Keyed notes - First Offer $430,000.00 I 1/job I $430,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

PSUT-20-04-01-05 | Part Five - lon Exchange Instrumentation Upgrade - First Offer $150,00000 | 1/job | $150,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

PSUT-20-04--01-06 | Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 1.00% | 1/job | 1.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--02-01 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant Facility Improvements 2020 - First Offer $2,507,000.00 | 1/job $2,507,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
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PSUT-20-04--02-02

Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer

BidSync: Bid Tabulation Report

1.00% | 1/job

1.00%

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $2,507,000.00

RF Environmental Services

Bid Contact

Ph 954-605-6711
Supplier Code 274366

Thaddeus Buckley
thad3939@gmail.com

Address 4324 NE 21

$5,285,800.00 (8/8 items)

st Ave

FORT LAUDERDALE, FL 33308

Qualifications PP-DRUGFREE PP-EQUAL PP-LBTR PP-LOCAL PP-SCRUTINIZED PP-SWORN PP-VENDORINFO PP-VOSB PP-W9

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Item Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--01-01 Part One - Rehabilitation of Treatment Unit A - First Offer $1,778,000.00 | 1/job $1,778,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-02 | Part Two - Completion of Treatment Unit D - First Offer $56,000.00 | 1/job | $56,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-03 | Part Three - Painting Exterior of A, B, C & D - First Offer $149,000.00 I 1/job | $149,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-04 I Part Four - Painting of Keyed notes - First Offer $523,000.00 I 1/job I $523,000.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04-01-05 | Part Five - lon Exchange Instrumentation Upgrade - First Offer $13690000 | 1/job | $136,900.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--01-06 | Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 1.00% | 1/job | 1.00%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Item # Line Iltem Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price
PSUT-20-04--02-01 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Water Treatment Plant Facility Improvements 2020 - First Offer $2,642,900.00 | 1/job $2,642,900.00
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PSUT-20-04--02-02 | Option 2: Total Cost to Complete All Five Projects: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 0.75% | 1/job 0.75%
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Lot Total: $2,642,900.00
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