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View by Line Item | View by Supplier Email Tabulation  |  Generate PDF  |  View Printable

Bid #PSPW-20-05 - Exterior Painting of Various City Buildings 
 
Creation Date   Jun 9, 2020 End Date Jul 7, 2020 2:00:00 PM EDT

Start Date Jun 9, 2020 6:24:31 PM EDT Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

Eagle Painting $269,316.52    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Janet Field 
janet@eaglepaintingfla.com 
Ph 954-746-7300  

 Address 10062 NW 50th Street
Sunrise, FL 33351

 Supplier Code 235247
 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $114,198.63      1 / job $114,198.63  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $114,198.63  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NO BID 

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NO BID 

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NO BID 

 PSPW-20-05--02-04  East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NO BID 

 PSPW-20-05--02-05  East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NO BID 

  Lot Total: $0.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $14,998.23      1 / job $14,998.23  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $12,996.62      1 / job $12,996.62  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $33,102.91      1 / job $33,102.91  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $16,997.37      1 / job $16,997.37  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $5,988.00      1 / job $5,988.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $84,083.13  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $4,602.13      1 / job $4,602.13  
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Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $999.00      1 / job $999.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-03  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls - First Offer $7,499.61      1 / job $7,499.61  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $22,001.17      1 / job $22,001.17  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $768.31      1 / job $768.31  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $35,870.22  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $15,497.21      1 / job $15,497.21  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $4,001.23      1 / job $4,001.23  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $7,999.35      1 / job $7,999.35  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04  West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $1,002.47      1 / job $1,002.47  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $607.72      1 / job $607.72  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $1,003.31      1 / job $1,003.31  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08  West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints - First Offer $5,053.25      1 / job $5,053.25  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $35,164.54  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: no bid 

  Lot Total: $0.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 3.00%      1 / each 3.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: not sure if this is to be included
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in the package, but it's 3% of the bid price 

  Lot Total: $0.00  

ASSURED CONTRACTING LLC $340,927.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Luigi Galascio 
operations@assuredgc.com 
Ph 954-347-0866  

 Address 3553 NW 10th Avenue
Oakland Park, FL 33317

 Supplier Code 237248
 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $32,050.00      1 / job $32,050.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $32,050.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $5,487.00      1 / job $5,487.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $35,900.00      1 / job $35,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $5,600.00      1 / job $5,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-04  East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints - First Offer $6,500.00      1 / job $6,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-05  East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints - First Offer $12,500.00      1 / job $12,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $65,987.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $35,000.00      1 / job $35,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $31,500.00      1 / job $31,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $32,000.00      1 / job $32,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $31,500.00      1 / job $31,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $12,500.00      1 / job $12,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $142,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $4,500.00      1 / job $4,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $8,900.00      1 / job $8,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-03  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls - First Offer $23,000.00      1 / job $23,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $2,500.00      1 / job $2,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $6,500.00      1 / job $6,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $45,400.00  

mailto:operations@assuredgc.com
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 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $9,800.00      1 / job $9,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $3,600.00      1 / job $3,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $4,500.00      1 / job $4,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04  West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints - First Offer $4,600.00      1 / job $4,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $1,900.00      1 / job $1,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $2,600.00      1 / job $2,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $3,600.00      1 / job $3,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08  West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints - First Offer $2,600.00      1 / job $2,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $33,200.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $3,600.00      1 / job $3,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $2,690.00      1 / job $2,690.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $4,500.00      1 / job $4,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $4,500.00      1 / job $4,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $6,500.00      1 / job $6,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $21,790.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 5.00%      1 / each 5.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

All Counties Painting dba Peoples Choice Pressure Cleaning & Painting $436,700.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Steve Landis 
h2opressure@bellsouth.net 
Ph 954-445-8033  

 Address 4341 SW 73 Terrace
Davie, FL 33314

 Supplier Code 274364
 Qualifications  FED-LOBBY&DEBAR   FL-EVERIFY   PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-HUBZONE   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-MBE   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-

VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9   PP-WBE  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $117,000.00      1 / job $117,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $117,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $4,370.00      1 / job $4,370.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $3,300.00      1 / job $3,300.00  

mailto:h2opressure@bellsouth.net
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Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $30,766.00      1 / job $30,766.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-04  East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints - First Offer $8,258.00      1 / job $8,258.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-05  East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints - First Offer $19,806.00      1 / job $19,806.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $66,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $17,454.00      1 / job $17,454.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $8,532.00      1 / job $8,532.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $8,727.00      1 / job $8,727.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $14,677.00      1 / job $14,677.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $11,610.00      1 / job $11,610.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $61,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $3,956.00      1 / job $3,956.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $0.00      1 / job $0.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: NOT APPLICABLE 

 PSPW-20-05--04-03  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls - First Offer $450.00      1 / job $450.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $1,240.00      1 / job $1,240.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $1,240.00      1 / job $1,240.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $6,886.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $7,923.00      1 / job $7,923.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $8,880.00      1 / job $8,880.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $28,025.00      1 / job $28,025.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04  West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $400.00      1 / job $400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $850.00      1 / job $850.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $765.00      1 / job $765.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08  West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints - First Offer $19,471.00      1 / job $19,471.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $68,314.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $35,690.00      1 / job $35,690.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $34,870.00      1 / job $34,870.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $17,415.00      1 / job $17,415.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $17,415.00      1 / job $17,415.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $11,610.00      1 / job $11,610.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $117,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 5.00%      1 / each 5.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes: SEE ATTACHED BID BOND 

  Lot Total: $0.00  

Hartzell Painting & Construction $491,800.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Mike Goodwin 
mgoodwin@myhartzell.com 
Ph 954-957-9761  

 Address 2301 n.w. 33rd court suite
112
Pompano bch, FL 33069

 Supplier Code 261520
 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $125,000.00      1 / job $125,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $125,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $5,500.00      1 / job $5,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $25,000.00      1 / job $25,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $30,000.00      1 / job $30,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-04  East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-05  East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints - First Offer $5,000.00      1 / job $5,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $80,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $12,000.00      1 / job $12,000.00  

Product Code:   Supplier Product Code: 

mailto:mgoodwin@myhartzell.com
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $2,500.00      1 / job $2,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $12,000.00      1 / job $12,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $12,000.00      1 / job $12,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $32,000.00      1 / job $32,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $70,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-03  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $3,400.00      1 / job $3,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $11,400.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $4,000.00      1 / job $4,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $4,000.00      1 / job $4,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $31,000.00      1 / job $31,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04  West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints - First Offer $16,000.00      1 / job $16,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $1,000.00      1 / job $1,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $5,500.00      1 / job $5,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $4,000.00      1 / job $4,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08  West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints - First Offer $8,000.00      1 / job $8,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $73,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $45,000.00      1 / job $45,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $28,000.00      1 / job $28,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $19,300.00      1 / job $19,300.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $19,300.00      1 / job $19,300.00  
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Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $19,300.00      1 / job $19,300.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $130,900.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 3.00%      1 / each 3.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

J.I.J. Construction Corp. $642,500.00    (30/30 items)

 Bid Contact  Kati Cassiani 
kati@jijconstruction.com 
Ph 561-574-5995  

 Address 1977 South Military Trail
West Palm Beach, FL 33415

 Qualifications  PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $150,000.00      1 / job $150,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $150,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $35,000.00      1 / job $35,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-04  East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints - First Offer $20,000.00      1 / job $20,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-05  East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints - First Offer $25,000.00      1 / job $25,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $110,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $33,000.00      1 / job $33,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $5,000.00      1 / job $5,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $20,000.00      1 / job $20,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $22,500.00      1 / job $22,500.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $10,000.00      1 / job $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $90,500.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $7,000.00      1 / job $7,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $2,000.00      1 / job $2,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-03  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls - First Offer $30,000.00      1 / job $30,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

mailto:kati@jijconstruction.com
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 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $30,000.00      1 / job $30,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $5,000.00      1 / job $5,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $74,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $10,000.00      1 / job $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $5,000.00      1 / job $5,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04  West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints - First Offer $10,000.00      1 / job $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $8,000.00      1 / job $8,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $10,000.00      1 / job $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $5,000.00      1 / job $5,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08  West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $78,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $80,000.00      1 / job $80,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $20,000.00      1 / job $20,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $15,000.00      1 / job $15,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $10,000.00      1 / job $10,000.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $140,000.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 2.00%      1 / each 2.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  

JAG PAINTING CONTRACTORS INC $457,790.00    (25/30 items)

 Bid Contact  JORGE MERINO 
jagpainting@bellsouth.net 
Ph 954-632-0273   
Fax 305-625-0033

 Address 15928 NW 48 AVE
MIAMI GARDENS, FL 33014

 Supplier Code 282558
 Qualifications  FED-LOBBY&DEBAR   FL-EVERIFY   PP-DRUGFREE   PP-EQUAL   PP-HUBZONE   PP-LBTR   PP-LOCAL   PP-MBE   PP-SCRUTINIZED   PP-SWORN   PP-

VENDORINFO   PP-VOSB   PP-W9   PP-WBE  

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--01-01  Pines Place: Tower 3 - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $138,900.00      1 / job $138,900.00  

mailto:jagpainting@bellsouth.net
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Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $138,900.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--02-01  East Campus : East Parking Lot and Bus Loop - Prep & Paint Metal Awning and Supports - First Offer $14,800.00      1 / job $14,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-02  East Campus : Building P - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $7,900.00      1 / job $7,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-03  East Campus : Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast - Prime and Repaint - First Offer $31,200.00      1 / job $31,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-04    East Campus : Building L- Replace all Tilt Wall & Window Joints    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--02-05    East Campus : All Buildings - Replace all Window to Wall Joints    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $53,900.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--03-01  Academic Village: Gymnasium- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $16,900.00      1 / job $16,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-02  Academic Village: Breezeway- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $14,700.00      1 / job $14,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-03  Academic Village: Cafeteria Bldg- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $20,800.00      1 / job $20,800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-04  Academic Village: Building D- Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $15,400.00      1 / job $15,400.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--03-05  Academic Village: Building D 2 (two) Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $10,900.00      1 / job $10,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $78,700.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--04-01  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $3,600.00      1 / job $3,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-02  West Elementary: Building I - Paint Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $800.00      1 / job $800.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-03    West Elementary: Building I - Paint Courtyard and Airnasium Borders and Walls    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-04  West Elementary: Building E - Pressure Clean and Paint Exterior - First Offer $24,200.00      1 / job $24,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--04-05  West Elementary: Building E - Paint Gutters - First Offer $600.00      1 / job $600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $29,200.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--05-01  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Exterior Shutters - First Offer $7,700.00      1 / job $7,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-02  West Middle: Building M & I - Paint Interior and Exterior Doors and Frames - First Offer $8,600.00      1 / job $8,600.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-03  West Middle: Building M & I - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $17,700.00      1 / job $17,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-04    West Middle: Building M & I - Replace remaining Tilt wall joints    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-05  West Middle: Building M - Paint Exterior Window Frame of CafÃ© - First Offer $400.00      1 / job $400.00  
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Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-06  West Middle: Building M - Repair water damage under Window and Paint - First Offer $350.00      1 / job $350.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-07  West Middle: Building M - Paint Gutters - First Offer $1,200.00      1 / job $1,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--05-08    West Middle: ALL Buildings - Replace all wall to window joints    No Bids   

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $35,950.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--06-01  Central Campus: Airnasium - Remove Damaged Paint and Rust, Sandblast, Prime and Repaint - First Offer $72,700.00      1 / job $72,700.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-02  Central Campus: ALL Buildings - Replace all Wall to Window Joints - First Offer $19,440.00      1 / job $19,440.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-03  Central Campus: Building M- Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $10,900.00      1 / job $10,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-04  Central Campus: Building E - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $10,900.00      1 / job $10,900.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

 PSPW-20-05--06-05  Central Campus: Building Y - Sandblast and Paint Exterior Stairwells - First Offer $7,200.00      1 / job $7,200.00  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $121,140.00  

 Item #  Line Item Unit Price      Qty/Unit Total Price 

 PSPW-20-05--07-01  Additional Cost to provide a Payment & Performance Bond: Cost to Provide Payment and Performance Bond - First Offer 3.00%      1 / each 3.00%  

Product Code:  
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:

  Lot Total: $0.00  
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